
ICAR -  Krishi Vigyan Kendra 

(Host : Sri Avinashilingam Education Trust , Coimbatore) 

Vivekanandapuram – 641113,Karamadai Block, Coimbatore DT, TamilNadu 

Training Programmes conducted by the KVK 
 
April 2008 to March 2009 
 

Dates Training title 
Training 

Type 
Discipline Duration Male Female Total 

23-Apr-08 
Method and time of application of 
fertilizer for field crops 

off Agronomy 1 40 5 45 

23-Apr-08 
Improved cultivation practices for 
banana 

off Horticulture 1 40 5 45 

23-Apr-08 Milch animal management off Animal Science 1 0 15 15 

24-Apr-08 Azolla cultivation practices off Animal Science 1 7 0 7 

23-Apr-08 
Importance of safety storage of 
food grains 

off Home Science 1 0 15 15 

25-Apr-08 
Formation of new SHG (Accounts 
maintaining) 

off Home Science 1 0 16 16 

25-Apr-08 
Utilization of motorized maize 
Sheller 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 3 8 11 

29-Apr-08 
Improved blanching method for 
turmeric 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 11 1 12 

25-Apr-08 Market led extension off Agri. Extension 1 35 14 49 

29-Apr-08 Market led extension off Agri. Extension 1 10 2 12 

16-Apr-08 
Integrated plant nutrient supply 
system 

off Soil Science 1 7 5 12 

05-Apr-08 Preservation of fruits sp Home Science 1 0 21 21 

16-Apr-08 
Improved blanching method for 
turmeric 

sp 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 12 4 16 

08-May-08 
Role of SHGs in women 
development 

on Home Science 1 0 12 12 



15-May-08 
Importance of soil test based drip 
fertigation in sugarcane 

off Agronomy 1 5 3 8 

16-May-08 
Leaf webber management in 
Sesamum 

off Agronomy 1 10 2 12 

15-May-08 
Role of pseudomonas florescence 
in the management of stem 
splitting in banana 

off Horticulture 1 2 8 10 

17-May-08 
Management of shoot and fruit 
borer in Brinjal 

off Horticulture 1 10 4 14 

02-May-08 Nutrient management in goat off Animal Science 1 0 7 7 

28-May-08 Milch animal management off Animal Science 1 0 13 13 

29-May-08 
Importance of Azolla and 
cultivation practices 

off Animal Science 1 11 0 11 

02-May-08 
Importance of safe storage 
methods in minor millets 

off Home Science 1 0 11 11 

05-May-08 
Importance of sprouted Greengram 
in daily diet 

off Home Science 1 0 15 15 

06-May-08 
Sustainable development through 
women empowerment (Nutrition/ 
Health) 

off Home Science 1 23 25 48 

28-May-08 Safe storage methods off Home Science 1 0 16 16 

31-May-08 Utilization of insect trap off Home Science 1 0 10 10 

01-May-08 
Utilization of chisel plough for deep 
ploughing 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 17 0 17 

16-May-08 
Utilization of chisel plough for deep 
ploughing 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 12 6 18 

26-May-08 
Utilization of chisel plough for deep 
ploughing 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 12 0 12 

28-May-08 
Utilization of chisel plough for deep 
ploughing 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 13 0 13 

22-May-08 Market led extension off Agri. Extension 1 36 13 49 

26-May-08 Market led extension off Agri. Extension 1 10 15 25 



28-May-08 Role of bio fertilizer off Soil Science 1 0 12 12 

21-Jun-08 Market led extension on Agri. Extension 3 13 13 26 

03-Jun-08 Importance of goat feed off Animal Science 1 3 8 11 

25-Jun-08 Importance of green fodder off Animal Science 1 2 8 10 

02-Jun-08 
Income generating activities 
through Joint Liability Group 

off Home Science 0 0 11 11 

03-Jun-08 Utilization of insect trap off Home Science 1 0 15 15 

27-Jun-08 Safe drinking water off Home Science 1 0 16 16 

17-Jun-08 
Utilization of 8 row inclined plate 
planters - cotton 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 12 0 12 

19-Jun-08 
Safety storage methods for food 
grains 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 6 11 17 

03-Jun-08 
Group dynamic in the formation of 
SHG 

off Agri. Extension 1 0 12 12 

11-Jun-08 Importance of role of bio fertilizers off Soil Science 1 12 2 14 

06-Jun-08 
Introduction of improved devices 
for turmeric blanching & polishing 

sp 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 14 12 26 

24-Jun-08 
Post harvest management & 
important of value addition 

sp Agri. Extension 1 27 11 38 

10-Jul-08 Mealy bug management in cotton on Agri. Extension 1 39 14 53 

19-Jul-08 
Role of commodity based groups in 
agriculture development 

on Agri. Extension 1 15 0 15 

22-Jul-08 Importance of organic farming on Agri. Extension 1 5 0 5 

21-Jul-08 
Cultivation and utilization of azolla 
for quality milk production in 
livestock 

on Animal Science 1 7 4 11 

23-Jul-08 Value added products from banana on Home Science 2 0 14 14 

16-Jul-08 
Pre season training - importance of 
new yielding variety in rainfed 
greengram cultivation 

off Agronomy 1 4 12 16 

17-Jul-08 Features of COHM - 5 in maize off Agronomy 1 5 12 17 



cultivation 

07-Jul-08 
Importance of concentrate feed in 
goat rearing 

off Animal Science 1 0 12 12 

09-Jul-08 
Azolla -  A alternate feed for milch 
animals 

off Animal Science 1 0 10 10 

21-Jul-08 
Importance of milking machine in 
drudgery reduction 

off Animal Science 1 33 1 34 

05-Jul-08 
Income generating activities 
suitable for JLGs and SHGs 

off Home Science 1 0 17 17 

07-Jul-08 
Value added products from minor 
millets 

off Home Science 1 0 19 19 

08-Jul-08 
Role of NGOs in SHGs women 
empowerment 

off Home Science 1 0 15 15 

09-Jul-08 Role of banks in credit linkages off Home Science 1 0 26 26 

10-Jul-08 Safe drinking water off Home Science 1 0 24 24 

17-Jul-08 Food adulteration and prevention off Home Science 1 0 15 15 

15-Jul-08 
Utilization of cono weeder in paddy 
cultivation 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 12 0 12 

17-Jul-08 
Use of manually operated maize 
dibbler (single row) 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 6 11 17 

24-Jul-08 
Post harvest management 
techniques in cotton 

off Agri. Extension 1 54 0 54 

21-Jul-08 
Role of commodity based groups in 
agriculture development 

off Agri. Extension 1 15 0 15 

07-Jul-08 
Use of group dynamic in the 
formation of farmers club 

off Agri. Extension 1 5 3 8 

21-Jul-08 
Use of group dynamic in the 
formation of farmers club/ SHG 

off Agri. Extension 1 11 2 13 

23-Jul-08 
Use of group dynamic in the 
formation of farmers club/ SHG 

off Agri. Extension 1 12 0 12 

22-Jul-08 
Importance of soil and water 
testing 

off Soil Science 1 12 0 12 

07-Jul-08 Rat control measures through sp Agri. 2 89 37 126 



wonder trap Engineering 

30-Jul-08 Home care products sp Home Science 1 0 39 39 

31-Jul-08 
Preparation and utilization of 
enriched Vermi compost for 
sustainable agriculture production 

sp Agronomy 1 5 8 13 

31-Jul-08 
Vermi compost preparation 
techniques 

sp Horticulture 1 5 8 13 

20-Aug-08 
Role of bio agents and ETL based 
plant protection in Greengram 

on Agronomy 1 4 8 12 

21-Aug-08 
Vegetable cultivation through 
organic farming 

on Horticulture 1 17 0 17 

30-Aug-08 
Supplementation of mineral 
mixture in repeat breeder cows 

on Animal Science 1 10 0 10 

25-Aug-08 Value added products from banana on Home Science 1 0 10 10 

20-Aug-08 
Improved crop production 
techniques in BT cotton 

on Agri. Extension 1 27 0 27 

25-Aug-08 Market led extension on Agri. Extension 1 10 0 10 

06-Aug-08 
Role and importance of seed 
treatment with bio agents and bio 
fertilizers in Greengram 

off Agronomy 1 5 14 19 

08-Aug-08 
Role and importance of seed 
treatment with bio agents and bio 
fertilizers in Sesamum 

off Agronomy 1 7 11 18 

14-Aug-08 
Importance of foliar spraying of 
nutrient in sunflower 

off Agronomy 1 5 4 9 

22-Aug-08 Importance of mineral mixture off Animal Science 1 12 0 12 

26-Aug-08 Importance of mineral mixture off Animal Science 1 12 4 16 

06-Aug-08 Value added products off Home Science 1 0 19 19 

14-Aug-08 Food adulteration and prevention off Home Science 1 0 26 26 

12-Aug-08 Role of NGOs in SHGs development off Home Science 2 11 2 13 

21-Aug-08 Safe drinking water off Home Science 1 0 26 26 

22-Aug-08 Food adulteration and prevention off Home Science 1 0 16 16 



11-Aug-08 Utilization of seed dibbler in maize off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 5 10 15 

06-Aug-08 
Quality parameters & PHM of 
cotton 

off Agri. Extension 1 10 4 14 

05-Aug-08 
Importance of soil and water 
testing 

off Soil Science 1 7 5 12 

12-Aug-08 
Eco friendly technologies in 
Agriculture 

sp Agri. Extension 1 37 3 40 

09-Aug-08 
Importance of various Agri 
implements in crop production 

sp 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 14 5 19 

13-Aug-08 
Rat control measures through 
wonder trap 

sp 
Agri. 

Engineering 
2 46 35 81 

30-Sep-08 Importance of mineral mixture on Animal Science 1 9 0 9 

16-Sep-08 
Value added products from 
Greengram 

on Home Science 1 0 14 14 

11-Sep-08 
Integrated nutrient management in 
maize 

off Agronomy 1 10 14 24 

12-Sep-08 
Management of early emerging 
weeds using herbicides 

off Agronomy 1 3 11 14 

12-Sep-08 
Importance of high density planting 
and fruit quality enhancement in 
banana 

off Horticulture 1 7 4 11 

06-Sep-08 Safe drinking water off Home Science 1 2 20 22 

08-Sep-08 Safety storage methods off Home Science 1 0 20 20 

10-Sep-08 
Value added products from 
Greengram 

off Home Science 1 0 19 19 

10-Sep-08 Utilization of seed dibbler in maize off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
2 2 10 12 

16-Sep-08 
Preventive and curative measures 
for pest - insect damages 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 5 10 15 

18-Sep-08 Drip irrigation in banana off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 14 0 14 

22-Sep-08 Utilization of tubular maize Sheller off Agri. 1 5 10 15 



Engineering 

09-Sep-08 
Role and importance of bio 
fertilizer 

off Soil Science 1 3 12 15 

04-Oct-08 
Control measures for pod borer in 
Greengram 

off Agronomy 1 11 6 17 

06-Oct-08 
Control measures for pod borer in 
Sesamum 

off Agronomy 1 13 2 15 

21-Oct-08 
Pre season training for INM in 
Bengalgram 

off Agronomy 1 15 4 19 

22-Oct-08 
Pre season training for INM in 
sunflower 

off Agronomy 1 14 7 21 

22-Oct-08 
Plant protection techniques for 
coconut 

off Horticulture 1 11 3 14 

30-Oct-08 INM in coconut off Horticulture 1 14 7 21 

04-Oct-08 Importance of Azolla in animal feed off Animal Science 1 4 4 8 

15-Oct-08 
Importance of green fodder in 
Milch animal 

off Animal Science 1 10 5 15 

28-Oct-08 Importance of Azolla in animal feed off Animal Science 1 8 0 8 

14-Oct-08 Importance of value addition off Home Science 1 8 6 14 

18-Oct-08 Value added products from banana off Home Science 1 0 16 19 

21-Oct-08 Safe drinking water on Home Science 1 20 4 24 

22-Oct-08 Food adulteration and prevention off Home Science 1 0 12 12 

06-Oct-08 
Utilization of low cost finger glove 
in bhendi plucking 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 5 10 15 

10-Oct-08 
Importance of seed dibbler in 
maize 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 2 9 11 

30-Oct-08 
Rain water harvesting techniques / 
structures 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 12 2 14 

16-Oct-08 
Participatory Rural Appraisal 
techniques in Rajavur village 

off Agri. Extension 1 17 3 20 

06-Oct-08 
Use of group dynamic in the 
formation of farmers club 

off Agri. Extension 1 12 0 12 



14-Oct-08 
Use of group dynamic in the 
formation of farmers club 

off Agri. Extension 1 12 0 12 

06-Oct-08 INM in groundnut off Soil Science 1 13 2 15 

07-Oct-08 INM in Sesamum off Soil Science 1 8 6 14 

05-Nov-08 
Importance of mineral mixture in 
Milch animal 

on Animal Science 1 11 2 13 

27-Nov-08 
Role and importance of organic 
farming in vegetable cultivation 

on Soil Science 1 0 8 8 

28-Nov-08 
Preparation and utilization of 
Vermi compost in field crops 

on Soil Science 1 0 12 12 

17-Nov-08 
Role of wheel hoe weeder in maize 
cultivation 

off Agronomy 1 3 7 10 

17-Nov-08 
Scientific sheep and goat rearing 
techniques. 

off Animal Science 1 3 12 15 

28-Nov-08 
Importance of Azolla and its 
production techniques 

off Animal Science 1 8 2 10 

04-Nov-08 Food adulteration and prevention off Home Science 1 0 12 12 

05-Nov-08 
Importance of value addition in 
banana 

off Home Science 1 0 11 11 

06-Nov-08 
Low cost nutritious mix preparation 
for adolescence 

off Home Science 1 19 18 37 

07-Nov-08 
Safety storage methods for food 
grains 

off Home Science 1 0 68 68 

03-Nov-08 Utilization of tubular maize Sheller off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 5 7 12 

21-Nov-08 
Utilization of 8 row drum seeder in 
direct seeded low land rice. 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 10 3 13 

27-Nov-08 
Field preparation techniques 
(shallow puddling)  for 8 row drum 
seeder utilization 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 9 1 10 

28-Nov-08 
Use of group dynamic in the 
formation of farmers club (Azolla 
growers) 

off Agri. Extension 1 9 1 10 



05-Nov-08 INM in Bengalgram off Soil Science 1 3 9 12 

14-Nov-08 
Nutrient management in 
groundnut 

off Soil Science 1 6 6 12 

07-Nov-08 Home care products preparation sp Home Science 1 0 17 17 

11-Nov-08 
Cultivation and processing of 
medicinal and aromatic  plants 

sp Soil Science 2 31 13 44 

18-Nov-08 
Importance of Vermi compost and 
its production techniques 

sp Horticulture 1 4 6 10 

26-Nov-08 
Preparation of nutritious mix, Idly 
podi, curry leaf powder, karam 
masala powder and banana flour 

sp Home Science 3 0 43 43 

24-Dec-08 
Role of wheel hoe weeder in maize 
cultivation 

on Agronomy 1 0 19 19 

29-Dec-08 

Preparation of Panchakavya, 
Amirthakaraisal, Effective Micro 
Organism & Vermi compost and its 
uses 

on Horticulture 2 2 11 13 

31-Dec-08 Silk worm rearing techniques on Horticulture 1 37 17 54 

29-Dec-08 
Importance of Azolla and its 
cultivation practices 

on Animal Science 1 36 5 41 

22-Dec-08 
Value added products from 
Greengram 

on Home Science 2 0 15 15 

24-Dec-08 
Utilization of various mechanical 
weeder in paddy production 

on 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 30 0 30 

15-Dec-08 
Importance tips to be adopted in 
cotton cultivation 

on Agri. Extension 1 29 1 30 

23-Dec-08 
Different composting techniques 
for effective utilization of farm 
waste 

on Soil Science 1 0 12 12 

29-Dec-08 
Role of bio agents and ETL based 
plant protection in Greengram 

off Agronomy 1 5 10 15 

08-Dec-08 
Stem weevil management in 
banana 

off Horticulture 1 9 2 11 

18-Dec-08 Role and importance of Azolla in off Animal Science 1 0 10 10 



cattle feed 

05-Dec-08 
Value added products from minor 
millets 

off Home Science 1 0 15 15 

12-Dec-08 
Value added products from 
Greengram 

off Home Science 1 0 24 24 

17-Dec-08 Food adulteration and prevention off Home Science 1 0 18 18 

19-Dec-08 Value added products from banana off Home Science 1 0 13 13 

30-Dec-08 Value added products from banana off Home Science 1 6 8 14 

02-Dec-08 Safety plucking method in bhendi off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 13 2 15 

19-Dec-08 
Utilization of mechanical weeder in 
paddy production 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 8 0 8 

29-Dec-08 Utilization of tubular maize Sheller off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 3 6 9 

31-Dec-08 
Utilization of 8 row drum seeder in 
paddy cultivation 

off 
Agri. 

Engineering 
1 20 0 20 

01-Dec-08 
Importance of community based 
groups in agricultural development 

off Agri. Extension 1 18 12 30 

13-Dec-08 
Effective weed management by 
power weeder in cotton 

off Agri. Extension 1 35 7 42 

12-Dec-08 INM in Bengalgram off Soil Science 1 0 12 12 

16-Dec-08 
Role of macro nutrient in 
Bengalgram 

off Soil Science 1 0 12 12 

18-Dec-08 
Role of macro nutrient in 
Greengram 

off Soil Science 1 0 12 12 

30-Dec-08 
Micro nutrient management in  
groundnut 

off Soil Science 1 4 7 11 

12-Dec-08 
Importance of BT cotton and its 
production techniques 

sp Agronomy 1 38 7 45 

16-Dec-08 Artificial jewels making techniques sp Home Science 1 0 32 32 

24-Dec-08 Paper carry bag making techniques sp Home Science 1 0 33 33 

19-Dec-08 Improved production techniques in sp Soil Science 1 15 0 15 



maize 

05.01.09 
Importance of fodder management 
and clean milk production 

on Animal Science 1 55 32 87 

21.01.09 Value added products from banana on Home Science 2 1 21 22 

28.01.09 
Value added products from minor 
millets 

on Home Science 2 0 21 21 

04.01.09 
Importance of new high yielding 
varieties and its season in 
groundnut cultivation 

off Agronomy 1 14 6 20 

19.01.09 
Uses and application of bio 
fertilizers in rice 

off Agronomy 1 15 0 15 

27.01.09 
Stem weevil management in 
banana 

off Horticulture 1 21 3 24 

19.01.09 
Importance of Azolla and its 
multiplication  techniques 

off Animal Science 1 7 0 7 

23.01.09 
Role of mineral mixture in quality 
milk  production 

off Animal Science 1 6 3 9 

06.01.09 
Accounts maintaining and record 
keeping by SHGS 

off Home Science 1 0 23 23 

23.01.09 Menu planning and budgeting off Home Science 1 0 27 27 

05.01.09 
Implements used in paddy 
cultivation 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 18 1 19 

20.01.09 
Direct sowing of pre germinated 
paddy seeds with 8 row drum 
seeder 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 16 0 16 

23.01.09 Utilization of 8 row drum seeder off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 0 10 

30.01.09 Maintenance of power sprayer off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 0 12 

23.01.09 
Use of group dynamics in the 
formation of farmers club 

off Agri Extension 1 6 3 9 

20.01.09 INM in groundnut off Soil Science 1 8 11 19 

22.01.09 Method of fertilizer application off Soil Science 1 2 12 24 



27.01.09 
Importance of soil testing and INM 
in bhendi 

off Soil Science 1 2 22 24 

29.01.09 Organic vegetable cultivation off Soil Science 1 2 10 12 

31.01.09 
Different composting techniques 
using farm waste 

off Soil Science 1 8 7 15 

30.01.09 
Marketing techniques for home 
made products 

sp Home Science 1 0 28 28 

21.02.09 
Vermi  compost production 
techniques and its uses 

on Horticulture 1 11 1 11 

21.02.09 Vermi composting techniques on Soil Science 1 0 7 7 

23.02.09 
Different composting techniques 
using farm wastes 

on Soil Science 1 0 13 13 

02.02.09 
Pod borer management in 
Bengalgram 

off Agronomy 1 5 35 40 

07.02.09 
Importance of mineral mixture in 
dairy farming 

off Animal Science 1 12 0 12 

02.02.09 
Value added products from 
Bengalgram 

off Home Science 1 0 28 28 

07.02.09 Menu planning and budgeting off Home Science 1 0 27 27 

10.02.09 
Value added products from 
groundnut 

off Home Science 1 6 11 17 

11.02.09 Value added products from banana off Home Science 1 0 16 16 

03.02.09 
Mechanization in groundnut 
cultivation 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
2 3 14 17 

14.02.09 
Prevention & curative measures for 
pest and insects control 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 2 14 

02.02.09 INM in Bengalgram off Soil Science 1 5 35 40 

22.02.09 
Soil test based fertilizer 
recommendation in bhendi 

off Soil Science 1 2 11 13 

11.02.09 
Integrated Nutrient Management 
in Bhendi 

off Soil Science 1 0 12 12 

28.02.09 Mulberry cultivation techniques sp Horticulture 1 99 47 146 



11.02.09 
Role of combined harvester in 
Bengalgram cultivation 

sp 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 13 2 15 

17.02.09 
Combined harvester in paddy 
production 

sp 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 30 0 30 

13.03.09 
Greengram fodder production 
techniques (CO (CN)-4) 

on Agronomy 1 29 1 30 

18.03.09 
Importance of basal application of 
ferrous sulphate in sugarcane 

on Agronomy 1 8 5 13 

19.03.09 
Importance of bio fertilizer 
application in groundnut 

on Agronomy 1 10 4 14 

23.03.09 
Role of SVPR 1 variety in Sesamum 
cultivation 

on Agronomy 1 9 3 12 

26.03.09 
Yield maximization techniques in 
groundnut 

on Agronomy 1 30 8 38 

17.03.09 
Modern Vermi compost production 
techniques 

off Horticulture 1 7 15 22 

31.03.09 
Importance of Vermi compost in 
vegetable cultivation 

off Horticulture 1 9 12 21 

13.03.09 Green fodder management off Animal Science 1 29 1 30 

26.03.09 Green fodder management off Animal Science 1 30 8 38 

10.03.09 
Credit linkage for agriculture 
activities 

off Home Science 1 0 19 19 

12.03.09 
Role of SHGs in agriculture 
development 

off Home Science 1 0 17 17 

26.03.09 Safety storage methods off Home Science 1 6 29 35 

14.03.09 
Electrical wiring for home and farm 
needs 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 16 0 16 

26.03.09 
Utilization of single row rotary 
weeder in paddy 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 0 10 

28.03.09 
Utilization of two row rotary 
weeder in paddy 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 0 12 

29.03.09 Utilization of cono weeder in paddy off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 0 10 



16.03.09 
Banana based products 
preservation 

voc Home Science 6 0 15 15 

16.03.09 
Repair and maintenance of electric 
control /  panels 

voc 
Agri 

Engineering 
8 4 6 

10 

 

  



April 2009 to March 2010 

 

Date Training title Type Discipline Duration Male Female Total 

30-Apr-09 
Organic pest  and disease 
management in vegetable cultivation 

off Horticulture 1 6 13 19 

30-Apr-09 Food adulteration and preservation off Home Science 1 0 12 12 

29-Apr-09 
Utilization of mechanical weeder in 
paddy production 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
2 14 0 14 

21-Apr-09 
Safety storage of food grains and 
correct cooking methods 

sp Home Science 1 0 50 50 

25-Apr-09 
Safety storage of food grains and 
correct cooking methods 

sp Home Science 1 0 50 
 

14-May-09 Value added products from banana on Home Science 2 0 15 15 

05-May-09 Value added products from banana off Home Science 1 0 9 9 

30-May-09 EDP training to rural women off Home Science 1 0 21 21 

25-May-09 
Manually operated groundnut 
decorticator (sitting type) 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 13 12 25 

07-May-09 
Finance and time management of an 
agricultural women 

off Agri Extension 1 0 22 22 

22-May-09 Paper bag making techniques sp Home Science 1 0 18 18 

30-May-09 Building relationship in a society sp Agri Extension 1 16 4 20 

09-Jun-09 EDP training to rural women on Home Science 2 0 25 25 

28-Jun-09 
Value added products from 
greengram 

on Home Science 2 0 29 29 

23-Jun-09 
Improved cultivation practices in 
turmeric 

off Horticulture 1 11 1 12 

20-Jun-09 Importance of azolla in animal feed off Animal Science 1 7 11 18 

23-Jun-09 Importance of azolla in animal feed off Animal Science 1 7 2 9 

16-Jun-09 
Value added products from 
greengram 

off Home Science 1 1 16 17 



26-Jun-09 Effective cooking methods off Home Science 1 0 29 29 

08-Jun-09 
Manually operated groundnut 
decorticator  (CIAE model) 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 17 7 24 

13-Jun-09 
Introduction of 6 row inclined plate 
planter in groundnut cultivation 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 6 18 

20-Jun-09 Deep ploughing with chisel plough off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 11 4 15 

25-Jun-09 Deep ploughing with chisel plough off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 24 0 24 

29-Jun-09 Deep ploughing with chisel plough off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 5 17 

03-Jun-09 Home care products sp Home Science 3 0 37 37 

29-Jun-09 
Effective fodder management 
techniques 

sp Animal Science 1 32 0 32 

23-Jun-09 Gender mainstreaming in Agriculture sp Agri Extension 1 65 20 85 

10-Jul-09 Plant protection techniques in tomato on Horticulture 1 17 0 17 

14-Jul-09 
Crop production techniques in fodder 
crop - COFS 29 & CO 4 

on Animal Science 1 21 6 27 

23-Jul-09 
Use of salt lick for sheep and goat 
rearing 

on Animal Science 1 43 2 45 

22-Jul-09 
Role of Joint Liability Groups in 
agricultural development 

on Home Science 1 16 5 21 

06-Jul-09 
Importance of mixed fodder crops in 
live stock management 

off Animal Science 1 5 4 9 

07-Jul-09 
Scientific  sheep and goat rearing 
techniques 

off Animal Science 1 20 2 22 

04-Jul-09 Value added products from banana off Home Science 1 2 37 39 

16-Jul-09 Value added products from milk off Home Science 1 1 8 9 

23-Jul-09 
Role of Joint Liability Groups in 
agricultural development 

off Home Science 1 0 14 14 

28-Jul-09 Effective cooking methods off Home Science 1 0 15 15 



30-Jul-09 EDP training to rural women off Home Science 1 0 13 13 

07-Jul-09 
Introduction of 6 row inclined plate 
planter in groundnut 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 7 5 12 

25-Jul-09 Adoption of groundnut harvester off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 0 10 

06-Jul-09 
Technological interventions planned 
for Perumbathy village 

off Agri Extension 1 50 25 75 

15-Jul-09 
Production of bio control agents for 
mealy bug management 

sp Agri Extension 1 9 45 14 

13-Aug-09 IPM in Tomato off Horticulture 1 23 7 30 

19-Aug-09 
Importance of organic manures and 
micro nutrient mixture in crop 
production 

off Horticulture 1 18 7 25 

18-Aug-09 Sheep and goat rearing techniques on Animal Science 1 64 4 68 

24-Aug-09 Importance of green fodder on Animal Science 1 10 1 11 

28-Aug-09 
Importance of salt lick in sheep and 
goat 

off Animal Science 1 14 3 17 

17-Aug-09 
Value added products from 
groundnut 

on Home Science 1 0 9 9 

20-Aug-09 Effective cooking methods off Home Science 1 1 14 15 

29-Aug-09 
Importance of nutritional kitchen 
garden 

off Home Science 1 3 6 9 

18-Aug-09 Backyard poultry rearing off Home Science 1 0 12 12 

19-Aug-09 
Adoption of Tractor drawn groundnut 
harvester 

on 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 21 5 26 

23-Aug-09 Adoption of groundnut stripper on 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 13 8 21 

31-Aug-09 
Mechanization in groundnut 
cultivation 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 8 24 32 

24-Aug-09 
Adoption of groundnut stripper 
(CRIDA model) 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 11 5 16 

28-Aug-09 Improved crop management  off Horticulture 1 15 1 16 



practices in greengram 

25-Aug-09 
Quality mulbery leaf production and 
silk worm rearing techniques 

on Agri Extension 1 8 1 9 

31-Aug-09 
Papaya mealy bug management 
techniques 

on Agri Extension 1 0 22 22 

29-Aug-09 Importance of soil and water testing on Soil Science 1 14 2 16 

10-Aug-09 
Introduction of new high yielding 
cotton variety 

off Agri Extension 1 42 8 50 

12-Aug-09 
Improved crop management practices 
in cotton 

off Agri Extension 1 43 9 52 

20-Aug-09 Role of bio fertilizers off Soil Science 1 24 4 28 

24-Aug-09 INM in Greengram off Soil Science 1 20 4 24 

10-Sep-09 INM in Brinjal on Horticulture 1 26 0 26 

01-Sep-09 
Role of SHGs in women 
empowerment 

on Home Science 1 0 23 23 

17-Sep-09 
Low cost drip irrigation system in 
turmeric 

on 
Agri 

Engineering 
2 15 0 15 

22-Jul-09 
Mechanization in groundnut 
production 

on 
Agri 

Engineering 
2 14 1 15 

05-Sep-09 
Improved cultivation practices in 
brinjal 

off Horticulture 1 24 2 26 

22-Sep-09 
Control measures of stem weevil in 
cotton 

off Horticulture 1 29 9 38 

19-Sep-09 
Importance of salt lick in sheep and 
goat   rearing 

off Animal Science 1 15 5 20 

24-Sep-09 
Importance of green fodder for milch 
animal 

off Animal Science 1 17 4 21 

16-Sep-09 Importance of  kitchen gardening off Home Science 1 0 15 15 

17-Sep-09 EDP training for rural women off Home Science 1 0 13 13 

22-Sep-09 Backyard poultry rearing off Home Science 1 0 20 20 

30-Sep-09 Importance of kitchen gardening off Home Science 1 0 12 12 



03-Sep-09 
Utilization of tractor drawn 6 row 
inclined plate planter 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 9 7 16 

22-Sep-09 Role of bio fertilizers off Soil Science 1 12 0 12 

02-Oct-09 
Improved cultivation practices in 
sesamum 

off Agronomy 1 11 4 15 

08-Oct-09 
Improved cultivation practices in 
sesamum 

off Agronomy 1 25 4 29 

19-Oct-09 
Importance of green fodder in milk 
production 

off Animal Science 1 15 2 17 

21-Oct-09 
Importance of Effective micro 
organism in cattle rearing 

off Animal Science 1 11 2 13 

23-Oct-09 
Importance of Effective micro 
organism in cattle rearing 

off Animal Science 1 14 2 16 

09-Oct-09 Backyard poultry rearing off Home Science 1 4 19 23 

27-Oct-09 Food adulteration and prevention off Home Science 1 0 13 13 

18-Oct-09 
Role of farm ponds and percolation 
ponds in ground water recharging 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 0 12 

22-Oct-09 
Adoption of groundnut stripper 
(CRIDA model) 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 20 0 20 

29-Oct-09 
Utilization of motorized earth augur 
in banana cultivation 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 13 7 20 

06-Oct-09 
Mealy bug management in 
agricultural cop 

off Agri Extension 1 21 4 25 

22-Oct-09 INM in vegetable cowpea off Soil Science 1 0 12 12 

23-Oct-09 INM in Bhendi off Soil Science 1 4 9 13 

08-Oct-09 Value added products from tomato sp Home Science 1 28 15 43 

14-Oct-09 Value added products from tomato sp Home Science 1 16 12 28 

11-Nov-09 Safety storage methods off Home Science 1 0 14 14 

13-Nov-09 Food adulteration and prevention off Home Science 1 6 12 18 

20-Nov-09 Role of micro nutrient in human diet off Home Science 1 0 16 16 



13-Nov-09 
Direct sowing of 8 row drum seeder in 
paddy 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 0 12 

29-Dec-09 
Vermi compost production 
techniques and its uses 

on Horticulture 3 8 2 10 

29-Dec-09 
Proper maintenance methods of 
power sprayers 

on 
Agri 

Engineering 
2 8 2 10 

22-Dec-09 Plant protection techniques in brinjal off Horticulture 1 13 6 19 

23-Dec-09 Plant protection techniques in tomato off Horticulture 1 11 6 17 

29-Dec-09 
Control measures of fruit borer in 
tomato 

off Horticulture 1 14 7 21 

10-Dec-09 Importance of mixed fodder crops off Animal Science 1 12 3 15 

11-Dec-09 
Importance of mineral mixture in 
milch animal management 

off Animal Science 1 15 3 18 

29-Dec-09 
Importance of mineral mixture in 
milch animal management 

off Animal Science 1 13 2 15 

08-Dec-09 Importance of health and hygiene off Home Science 1 0 22 22 

10-Dec-09 Food adulteration and prevention off Home Science 1 0 12 12 

11-Dec-09 
Record keeping and accounts 
maintaining for SHGs 

off Home Science 1 0 12 12 

09-Dec-09 
Utilization of cono weeder in paddy 
production 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 11 0 11 

21-Dec-09 Introduction of power weeder off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 13 1 14 

22-Dec-09 
Introduction of 6 row inclined plate 
planter in bengalgram 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 9 2 11 

10-Dec-09 Role of bio fertilizers in vegetables off Soil Science 1 0 12 12 

21-Dec-09 Importance of bio fertilizers in pulses off Soil Science 1 0 18 18 

16-Dec-09 Value added products from tomato sp Home Science 1 27 10 37 

10-Dec-09 Food and nutritional security sp Home Science 1 3 44 47 

18-Jan-10 EDP  training to rural women on Home Science 1 0 21 21 



20-Jan-10 Value added products from tomato on Home Science 1 18 4 22 

23-Jan-10 
Preparation of banana flour mix 
nutritious mix 

on Home Science 1 0 28 28 

27-Jan-10 Value added products from milk on Home Science 1 0 15 15 

27-Jan-10 
Importance of borax in sunflower 
cultivation 

off Agronomy 1 3 4 7 

28-Jan-10 
Foliar application of micro nutrient in 
bengalgram 

off Agronomy 1 2 3 5 

30-Jan-10 Pre season training for FLD groundnut off Agronomy 1 8 4 12 

21-Jan-10 Organic farming in banana cultivation off Horticulture 1 26 0 26 

07-Jan-10 Disease management in milch animals off Animal Science 1 24 0 24 

19-Jan-10 
Importance of green fodder in milch 
animals 

off Animal Science 1 13 2 15 

09-Jan-10 
Installation  of drip irrigation system 
in coconut 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 0 12 

19-Jan-10 
Introduction of low cost drip irrigation 
in vegetable production 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 11 0 11 

28-Jan-10 
Mechanization in groundnut 
production 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 8 4 12 

08-Jan-10 
Use of group dynamic in the 
formation of farmer club 

off Agri Extension 1 23 0 23 

09-Jan-10 
Use of group dynamic in the 
formation of farmers club 

off Agri Extension 1 25 0 25 

19-Jan-10 
Use of group dynamic in the 
formation of farmers club 

off Agri Extension 1 16 0 16 

28-Jan-10 Importance of soil and water testing off Soil Science 1 30 0 30 

29-Jan-10 Importance of bio fertilizers off Soil Science 1 2 13 15 

30-Jan-10 Nutrient management in banana off Soil Science 1 8 5 13 

19-Jan-10 
Improved cultivation practices in 
pulses crops 

sp Agronomy 1 12 45 57 

29-Jan-10 Improved cultivation practices in sp Agronomy 1 55 6 61 



groundnut cultivation 

04-Jan-10 Value added products from  tomato sp Home Science 1 24 3 27 

25-Jan-10 
Proper maintenance of plant 
protection equipments 

sp 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 15 0 15 

29-Jan-10 
Mechanization of groundnut 
production 

sp 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 45 10 55 

23-Feb-10 
Repair and maintenance of power 
sprayers 

on 
Agri 

Engineering 
2 15 0 15 

25-Feb-10 
Repair and maintenance of power 
sprayers 

on 
Agri 

Engineering 
2 15 0 15 

23-Feb-10 
Group dynamic in the formation of 
farmers club 

on Agri Extension 2 15 0 15 

25-Feb-10 
Role of farmers club in agricultural 
marketing 

on Agri Extension 2 15 0 15 

05-Feb-10 
Improved cultivation practices in 
sesamum 

off Agronomy 1 43 18 61 

18-Feb-10 Dryland agriculture off Agronomy 1 14 13 27 

09-Feb-10 IPM in tomato off Horticulture 1 34 16 50 

05-Feb-10 Importance of mixed fodder crops off Animal Science 1 32 4 36 

08-Feb-10 Backyard turkey rearing off Animal Science 1 8 3 11 

17-Feb-10 Importance of Azolla in animal feed off Animal Science 1 17 7 24 

18-Feb-10 
Role of EM in milch animal 
management 

off Animal Science 1 18 12 30 

26-Feb-10 Cattle rearing off Animal Science 1 34 10 44 

11-Feb-10 
Safety storage and correct cooking 
methods 

off Home Science 1 0 18 18 

23-Feb-10 
Income generating through backyard 
poultry 

off Home Science 1 7 1 8 

03-Feb-10 
Utilization of power weeder in 
banana 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 0 12 

06-Feb-10 
Advantages of  drip irrigation in 
vegetables 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 9 2 11 



15-Feb-10 
Utilization of power weeder in 
banana 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 11 0 11 

16-Feb-10 
Group dynamic in the formation of 
farmer club 

off Agri Extension 1 15 0 15 

04-Feb-10 Role of soil application bio fertilizers off Soil Science 1 4 11 15 

05-Feb-10 
Seed treatment in maize with bio 
fertilizers and bio agents 

off Soil Science 1 3 12 15 

09-Feb-10 INM in greengram off Soil Science 1 13 2 15 

17-Feb-10 INM in bhendi off Soil Science 1 2 13 15 

22-Feb-10 
Utilization of power weeder in 
banana 

sp 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 38 0 38 

27-Feb-10 
Utilization of battery operated 
sprayers 

sp 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 45 0 45 

06-Mar-10 
Importance of vermi compost and its 
production techniques 

on Horticulture 1 15 15 30 

10-Mar-10 IPM in tomato on Horticulture 1 6 11 17 

16-Mar-10 
Role of SHGs in women 
empowerment 

on Home Science 1 0 12 12 

22-Mar-10 Drip irrigation system in curry leaf on 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 15 0 15 

25-Mar-10 Drip irrigation techniques in banana on 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 18 2 20 

23-Mar-10 
Role of farmers club in agricultural 
production 

on Agri Extension 2 20 0 20 

10-Mar-10 INM in coconut on Soil Science 1 6 11 17 

16-Mar-10 Organic vegetable cultivation on Soil Science 1 30 15 45 

29-Mar-10 Different composting techniques on Soil Science 1 30 15 45 

30-Mar-10 INM in greengram on Soil Science 1 16 1 17 

09-Mar-10 
Importance of gypsum application 
and earthing up in groundnut 

off Agronomy 1 15 4 19 

10-Mar-10 Foliar application of borax in off Agronomy 1 9 3 12 



sunflower 

05-Mar-10 
Improved cultivation practices in 
curry leaf 

off Horticulture 1 26 0 26 

16-Mar-10 Importance of Boer goat off Animal Science 1 17 10 27 

23-Mar-10 Profitable goat rearing techniques off Animal Science 1 3 12 15 

09-Mar-10 
Repair and maintenance of  power 
sprayers 

off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 0 12 

12-Mar-10 Drip irrigation techniques in banana off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 11 3 14 

09-Mar-10 
Group dynamic in the formation of 
farmer club 

off Agri Extension 1 21 3 24 

30-Mar-10 
Group dynamic in the formation of 
farmers club 

off Agri Extension 1 18 3 21 

10-Mar-10 Vermi composting  techniques off Soil Science 1 30 15 45 

07-Mar-10 
Importance of vermi compost and its 
production techniques 

sp Horticulture 1 15 20 35 

12-Mar-10 
Preparation and its utilization of 
Panchagavya 

sp Horticulture 1 32 5 37 

11-Mar-10 
Importance of vermi compost and its 
production techniques 

sp Horticulture 1 9 25 34 

12-Mar-10 
Importance of vermi compost and its 
production techniques 

sp Horticulture 1 15 10 25 

17-Mar-10 
Value added  products from oilseeds 
and pulses 

sp Home Science 1 28 11 39 

19-Mar-10 Modern irrigation system sp 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 18 0 18 

30-Mar-10 
Repairs and maintenance of power 
tiller 

sp 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 17 4 21 

26-Mar-10 
Role of KVK in agricultural 
development 

sp Agri Extension 1 54 0 54 

25-Mar-10 Medicinal plant cultivation sp Horticulture 1 45 0 45 

 

 



April 2010 to March 2011 

Date Training title Type Discipline Duration Male Female Total 

01-Apr-10 Sheep and goat rearing off Animal Science 1 5 12 17 

03-Apr-10 Importance of concentrate feed off Animal Science 1 20 5 25 

07-Apr-10 INM in vegetable cowpea off Soil Science 1 12 0 12 

07-Apr-10 
Role of KVK in agricultural 

development 
sp Agri Extension 1 88 7 95 

07-Apr-10 Nutritious mix preparation on Home Science 2 0 17 17 

09-Apr-10 
Preparation techniques in 

panchakavya  
off Horticulture 1 24 6 30 

13-Apr-10 Importance of safe drinking water off Home Science 1 28 0 28 

13-Apr-10 INM in brinjal off Soil Science 1 6 3 9 

13-Apr-10 Sheep and goat rearing off Animal Science 1 0 15 15 

14-Apr-10 Sheep and goat rearing off Animal Science 1 0 12 12 

16-Apr-10 
Marketing techniques in agriculture 

allied enterprises 
off Home Science 1 0 12 12 

17-Apr-10 Importance of soil testing off Soil Science 1 8 6 14 

17-Apr-10 Introduction of chisel plough off Agri Engg 1 15 8 23 

17-Apr-10 
Role of SHGs in women 

empowerment 
off Home Science 1 15 15 30 

19-Apr-10 
Importance of Zypsum application 

and earhting up in groundnut 
off Agronomy 1 23 9 32 

19-Apr-10 Adoption of groundnut digger off Agri Engg 1 11 6 17 

20-Apr-10 
Role of KVK in agricultural 

development 
sp Agri Extension 1 30 9 39 

21-Apr-10 Importance of concentrate feed off Animal Science 1 22 8 30 



21-Apr-10 Backyard turkey rearing off Home Science 1 4 2 6 

23-Apr-10 
Group dynamics in the formation of 

farmers club 
off Agri Extension 1 22 0 22 

23-Apr-10 
Importance of panchagavya foliar 

application in curry leaf 
off Horticulture 1 33 4 37 

23-Apr-10 
Importance of power weeder  and 

cutting machine in mulpery field 
on Horticulture 1 23 9 32 

23-Apr-10 
Value addition of fruits and 

vegetables 
sp Home Science 1 19 20 39 

26-Apr-10 
Importance of vamban - 3 greengram 

variety 
off Agronomy 1 25 4 29 

26-Apr-10 IPM in curry leaf off Soil Science 1 3 8 11 

27-Apr-10 
Role of KVK in agricultural 

development 
sp Agri Extension 1 37 0 37 

29-Apr-10 
Processing preservation of fruits and 

vegetables 
sp Home Science 1 35 29 64 

30-Apr-10 Safety storage methods off Home Science 1 10 16 26 

03-May-10 
Scientific techniques for sheep and 

goat rearing 
on Animal Science 1 2 12 14 

03-May-10 
Role of water harvesting techniques 

in ground water recharging 
off Agri Engg 1 12 0 12 

05-May-10 Fertilizer management in bhendi on Soil Science 1 22 7 29 

06-May-10 
Group dynamics in the formation of 

farmers club 
off Agri Extension 1 22 0 22 

12-May-10 
Scientific method of  concentrate 

feed mixing for milch animal 
off Animal Science 1 15 10 25 

13-May-10 Role of KVK in agricultural production sp Agri Extension 1 84 0 84 

13-May-10 
Scientific techniques for sheep and 

goat rearing 
off Animal Science 1 4 12 16 



13-May-10 
Control measures of mealy bug in 

cotton 
off Agronomy 1 17 3 20 

15-May-10 
Control measures of mealy bug in 

cotton 
off Agronomy 1 12 6 18 

15-May-10 
Scientific techniques for sheep and 

goat rearing 
off Animal Science 1 5 15 20 

15-May-10 
Group dynamics in the formation of 

farmers club 
off Agri Extension 1 20 0 20 

15-May-10 
Utilization of rotavator in groundnut 

production 
sp Agri Engg 1 14 0 14 

18-May-10 
Group dynamics in the formation of 

farmers club 
off Agri Extension 1 20 0 20 

18-May-10 Importance of curry leaf in daily diet off Home Science 1 6 29 35 

19-May-10 
Role of water harvesting techniques 

in ground water recharging 
off Agri Engg 1 11 0 11 

24-May-10 Thrips control measures in curry leaf off Horticulture 1 22 6 28 

25-May-10 Role of minerals in human diet off Home Science 1 22 26 48 

26-May-10 
Seed preparation for groundnut 

combine harvester 
sp Agri Engg 1 10 6 16 

27-May-10 
Value added products from fruits and 

vegetables 
sp Home Science 1 22 7 29 

29-May-10 
Importance of panchakavya spray in 

curry leaf 
off Horticulture 1 18 4 22 

31-May-10 Soil and water testing techniques off Soil Science 1 2 9 11 

31-May-10 Value added products from curryleaf on Home Science 1 0 13 13 

03-Jun-10 
Control measures of mealy bug in 

cotton 
on Agronomy 1 14 1 15 

05-Jun-10 
Food safety and household food 

security 
off Home Science 1 0 16 16 



07-Jun-10 INM in chillies off Soil Science 1 8 2 10 

08-Jun-10 
Role of Effective Micro organism in 

milk production 
off Animal Science 1 8 4 12 

08-Jun-10 
Entrepreneur development 

programme to rural women 
on Home Science 2 0 30 30 

09-Jun-10 
Importance of mixed fodder for dairy 

animals 
on Animal Science 2 16 17 33 

09-Jun-10 Advantages of drip irrigation systems on Agri Engg 2 20 0 20 

09-Jun-10 ICM in maize on Soil Science 1 20 20 40 

09-Jun-10 Role of KVK in agricultural production on Agri Extension 2 20 0 20 

10-Jun-10 Importance of coconut cultivation on Horticulture 2 3 22 25 

11-Jun-10 
Scientific method of clean milk 

production 
off Animal Science 1 16 0 16 

11-Jun-10 ICM in greengram off Soil Science 1 7 23 30 

14-Jun-10 
Importance of salt lick in sheep and 

goat 
off Animal Science 1 14 0 14 

14-Jun-10 
Role of SHGs in Agricultural 

development 
off Home Science 1 0 16 16 

14-Jun-10 

Raised seed preparation techniques 

for groundnut combine harvester 

utilization 

off Agri Engg 1 12 6 18 

15-Jun-10 
Group dynamics in the formation of 

Farmers club 
off Agri Extension 1 8 6 14 

15-Jun-10 
Role of SHGs in Agricultural 

development 
off Home Science 1 0 14 14 

19-Jun-10 
Group dynamics in the formation of 

Farmers club 
off Agri Extension 1 20 0 20 

19-Jun-10 
Adoption of manually operated 

groundnut decorticator 
off Agri Engg 1 0 14 14 



21-Jun-10 
Value added products from 

greengram 
off Home Science 1 0 19 19 

22-Jun-10 
Importance of concentrate feed in 

milch animals 
off Animal Science 1 18 14 32 

28-Jun-10 
Control measures of fruit borer in 

tomato 
off Horticulture 1 15 3 18 

28-Jun-10 Importance of soil and water testing on Soil Science 1 3 47 50 

29-Jun-10 
Groundnut rich foliar spray in 

groundnut cultivation  
off Agronomy 1 18 20 38 

29-Jun-10 
Pre season training in cotton 

cultivation 
off Agronomy 1 19 13 32 

29-Jun-10 
Utilization of chisel plough for dryland 

cotton cultivation 
off Agri Engg 1 25 2 27 

29-Jun-10 Importance of raising kitchen garden off Home Science 1 0 24 24 

29-Jun-10 
Role of farmers club in agricultural 

development 
off Agri Extension 1 18 7 25 

07-Jul-10 Importance of greens in daily diet off Home Science 1 0 15 15 

12-Jul-10 EDP training to rural women off Home Science 1 0 16 16 

15-Jul-10 Value added products from fruits on Home Science 1 3 9 12 

16-Jul-10 
Cultivation practices and marketing 

details of spices and condiments 
on Horticulture 1 37 1 38 

16-Jul-10 
Training on Effective Microorganism 

(EM) Technology 
sp Horticulture 1 18 29 47 

16-Jul-10 
Shallow puddling for paddy 

production  
off Agri Engg 1 16 0 16 

17-Jul-10 
Group dynamics in the formation of 

Farmers club 
off Agri Extension 1 20 0 20 

17-Jul-10 
Production of multiple fodder crops in 

single field 
off Animal Science 1 20 0 20 



17-Jul-10 
Utilization of power weeder in 

banana 
off Agri Engg 1 14 0 14 

20-Jul-10 
Group dynamics in the formation of 

Farmers club 
off Agri Extension 1 17 0 17 

20-Jul-10 Utilization of power weeder in cotton off Agri Engg 1 15 7 22 

21-Jul-10 
Importance of foliar spray of nutrients 

in groundnut 
on Agronomy 1 12 0 12 

21-Jul-10 Mealy bug management in cotton on Agronomy 1 11 4 15 

21-Jul-10 Importance of farm mechanization on Agri Engg 1 9 3 12 

21-Jul-10 
Integrated crop management in 

Maize 
on Agronomy 1 11 0 11 

22-Jul-10 
Role of farmers club in agricultural 

development 
off Agri Extension 1 20 2 22 

23-Jul-10 
Importance of green fodder 

cultivation techniques 
off Animal Science 1 27 0 27 

27-Jul-10 
Role of mechanization in agricultural 

production in Annur block 
sp Agri Engg 1 26 14 40 

28-Jul-10 Training on tailoring and stitching off Home Science 1 0 10 10 

28-Jul-10 
Mechanization in groundnut 

production 
on Agri Engg 2 10 10 20 

04-Aug-10 
Field preparation of paddy cultivation 

in SRI  
sp Agri Engg 1 25 0 25 

05-Aug-10 Adoption of groundnut harvester sp Agri Engg 1 10 5 15 

06-Aug-10 
Utilization of various power weeders 

in paddy productions 
off Agri Engg 1 22 0 22 

06-Aug-10 
Group dynamics in the formation of 

Farmers club 
off Agri Extension 1 20 0 20 

06-Aug-10 
Processing and preservation of 

banana and curry leaf 
sp Home Science 1 26 0 26 



12-Aug-10 Importance of safe drinking water off Home Science 1 4 15 19 

12-Aug-10 Importance of mixed fodder crops off Animal Science 1 4 15 19 

12-Aug-10 
Role of farmers club in agricultural 

development 
off Agri Extension 1 13 6 19 

13-Aug-10 
Utilization of mist blower in paddy 

plant protection  
off Agri Engg 2 20 0 20 

13-Aug-10 Income generation through tailoring sp Home Science 180 0 30 30 

16-Aug-10 
Importance of organic farming in 

medicinal plant cultivation 
on Horticulture 1 60 4 64 

18-Aug-10 

Nutritional security and income 

generating through backyard poultry 

rearing 

off Home Science 1 6 1 7 

18-Aug-10 
Utilization of various power weeders 

in paddy productions 
sp Agri Engg 1 25 0 25 

19-Aug-10 Value added products from milk on Home Science 1 26 16 42 

23-Aug-10 Fertilizer management in bhendi off Soil Science 1 2 9 11 

01-Sep-10 Income generating through tailoring  sp Home Science 1 0 30 30 

04-Sep-10 Adoption of raingun in forage crops off Agri Engg 1 12 0 12 

04-Sep-10 
Scientific techniques in Sheep and 

goat  rearing  
off Animal Science 1 14 0 14 

07-Sep-10 
Modern irrigation technologies in 

Groundnut production 
on Agri Engg 2 17 3 20 

07-Sep-10 EDP Training to Rural youth on Home Science 1 0 26 26 

09-Sep-10 Value added Products from Milk off Home Science 1 0 16 16 

13-Sep-10 Importance of soil sampling on Soil Science 1 13 0 13 

15-Sep-10 Utilization of mini tractor  off Agri Engg 1 13 2 15 

16-Sep-10 Adoption of Hi – tech sprayer in SRI sp Agri Engg 1 25 0 25 



paddy production 

16-Sep-10 
Present scenario of medicinal plants 

in TamilNadu 
on Horticulture 1 10 3 13 

16-Sep-10 
Production of multiple fodder crops in 

single field 
on Animal Science 1 13 0 13 

18-Sep-10 
Processing and Preservation of Fruits 

and vegetables 
off Home Science 1 20 5 25 

18-Sep-10 
Importance of concentrate feed in 

milch animals  
off Animal Science 1 19 6 25 

18-Sep-10 

Improved production technology of 

Tomato and their pest and diseases 

management 

off Horticulture 1 20 5 25 

18-Sep-10 

Improved production technology of 

Cotton  and their pest and diseases 

management 

off Agronomy 1 20 5 25 

20-Sep-10 EDP Training to Rural women off Home Science 1 0 29 29 

22-Sep-10 
Improved production technology of 

Banana  
sp Horticulture 1 18 1 19 

22-Sep-10 
Processing and Preservation of Fruits 

and vegetables 
sp Home Science 1 18 1 19 

23-Sep-10  Importance of green manures  sp Agronomy 1 18 1 19 

25-Sep-10 Safety storage methods on Home Science 1 0 25 25 

29-Sep-10 
Uses and application of bio fertilizer 

in rainfed greengram 
off Soil Science 1 10 0 10 

29-Sep-10 
Utilization of motorized post hole 

digger in banana production 
off Agri Engg 1 12 5 17 

30-Sep-10 Foliar spraying techniques in maize off Soil Science 1 4 4 8 

06-Oct-10 Management of fruit borer in brinjal off Horticulture 1 12 0 12 

06-Oct-10 Preservation of Fruits and vegetables off Home Science 1 12 0 12 



06-Oct-10 Modern irrigation system (Raingun) off Agri Engg 1 12 0 12 

07-Oct-10 

Importance of Effective 

Microorganism   to improve the milk 

quality  

off Animal Science 1 6 20 26 

07-Oct-10 
Integrated pest management in 

chillies 
off Horticulture 1 8 2 10 

14-Oct-10 Cultivation practices in mixed fodder off Animal Science 1 7 8 15 

18-Oct-10 Cultivation practices in bengalgram off Agronomy 1 16 7 23 

19-Oct-10 IPM in banana on Horticulture 1 11 0 11 

19-Oct-10 Cultivation practices in pulses sp Agronomy 1 21 10 31 

19-Oct-10 Package of practices  in pulses on Agronomy 1 11 0 11 

20-Oct-10 
Nutritional security and income 

generation through back yard poultry 
off Home Science 1 5 5 10 

21-Oct-10 Safety plucking method in bhendi off Agri Engg 1 6 8 14 

22-Oct-10 
Importance of bio fertilizers in pulses 

prouction 
off Soil Science 1 5 17 22 

22-Oct-10 Shallow pudling in SRI production off Agri Engg 1 12 0 12 

22-Oct-10  Preservation of Fruits and vegetables off Home Science 1 4 15 19 

27-Oct-10 
Cultivation practices in groundnut and 

sesamum 
sp Agronomy 1 23 7 30 

28-Oct-10 EDP Training to Rural youth on Home Science 1 0 25 25 

28-Oct-10 Modern irrigation system (Raingun) off Agri Engg 1 21 0 21 

30-Oct-10 Menu planning for preschool children sp Home Science 1 0 40 40 

30-Oct-10 Cultivation practices in blackgram sp Agronomy 1 18 12 30 

31-Oct-10 
Income generating activities through 

tailoring  
sp Home Science 1 0 30 30 



01-Nov-10 Scientific method of goat rearing off Animal Science 1 12 5 17 

01-Nov-10 
Mechanization in SRI paddy 

production 
sp Agri Engg 1 19 0 19 

01-Nov-10 
Importance and method of seed 

treatment  in Bengalgram  
off Agronomy 1 14 2 16 

02-Nov-10 
Importance of micronutrient and NAA 

spray in Cotton production 
off Agronomy 1 14 6 20 

02-Nov-10 Importance of soil and water testing off Soil Science 1 12 0 12 

03-Nov-10 
Utilization of power weeder  in paddy 

production 
off Agri Engg 1 26 0 26 

09-Nov-10 
Tractor operated shredder in banana 

field 
off Agri Engg 1 15 0 15 

10-Nov-10 
Integrated disease management in 

chillies 
off Horticulture 1 5 6 11 

11-Nov-10 Effective cooking methods off Home Science 1 0 12 12 

16-Nov-10 
Cultivation practices for pulses 

production 
sp Agronomy 1 20 7 27 

16-Nov-10 Mixed fodder crops on Animal Science 2 0 15 15 

16-Nov-10 
Importance of Micronutrient and DAP 

spray for cotton production 
on Agronomy 1 12 0 12 

16-Nov-10 Care and maintenance of poly house on Horticulture 1 18 1 19 

19-Nov-10 
Integrated Pest management in curry 

leaf 
off Horticulture 1 9 4 13 

20-Nov-10 
Mechanization in SRI paddy 

production 
sp Agri Engg 1 27 3 30 

22-Nov-10 INM in Bhendi on Soil Science 1 0 12 12 

23-Nov-10 Scientific method of goat rearing off Animal Science 1 0 12 12 

26-Nov-10 EDP training to rural women off Home Science 1 0 17 17 



29-Nov-10 Mixed fodder crops on Animal Science 1 18 0 18 

02-Dec-10 
Value added products from fruits and 

vegetables 
off Home Science 1 0 9 19 

02-Dec-10 Reddening management in cotton off Agronomy 1 0 9 19 

02-Dec-10 Mechanization wet land weeding off Agri Engg 1 0 0 17 

02-Dec-10 Fruit drop management in tomato off Horticulture 1 0 9 19 

04-Dec-10 INM in Bengal gram off Agronomy 1 0 1 11 

06-Dec-10 EDP Training to Rural women on Home Science 1 0 35 35 

09-Dec-10 INM in Pulses  sp Agronomy 1 0 0 50 

15-Dec-10 Importance of fertility in cows off Animal Science 1 0 5 20 

16-Dec-10 Farm waste management on Horticulture 1 0 2 18 

16-Dec-10 Advanced irrigation systems on Agri Engg 1 0 0 30 

16-Dec-10 
Mulberry cultivation and Sericulture 

rearing  
on Horticulture 1 0 2 19 

23-Dec-10 
Mechanization in groundnut 

production 
sp Agri Engg 1 0 0 50 

28-Dec-10 Adoption of power weeder in banana off Agri Engg 1 0 0 14 

29-Dec-10 Training on coconut tree climber sp Agri Engg 1 0 0 5 

30-Dec-10 Advanced drip irrigation systems on Agri Engg 1 0 0 12 

30-Dec-10 INM in Pulses  sp Agronomy 1 0 14 19 

05-Jan-11 Value added products from milk off Home Science 1 0 12 13 

10-Jan-11 IPM in Banana cultivation  off Horticulture 1 0 0 15 

10-Jan-11 
Marketing techniques in agricultural 

produces 
off Home Science 1 0 0 15 



12-Jan-11 IPM in Bengal gram off Agronomy 1 0 1 11 

19-Jan-11 Reddening management in cotton on Agronomy 1 0 2 15 

19-Jan-11 Intercropping of Cocoa in Coconut on Horticulture 1 0 3 15 

27-Jan-11 Important HRD activities in KVK off Home Science 1 0 12 13 

27-Jan-11 Role of Demo   activities in KVK  off Agronomy 1 0 12 13 

28-Jan-11 
Sowing of pre germinated paddy 

seeds with 8 row drum seeder 
off Agri Engg 1 0 4 16 

28-Jan-11 Stallfed Goat rearing off Animal Science 1 0 0 0 

31-Jan-11 

Income generation through 

homemade product   preparation ( 

Kungumam) 

sp Home Science 1 0 15 15 

01-Feb-11 Income generating through tailoring sp Home Science 90 0 30 30 

01-Feb-11 Income generating through tailoring sp Home Science 90 0 30 30 

03-Feb-11 Food and nutritional security off Home Science 1 28 7 35 

03-Feb-11 IPDM in vegetables on Horticulture 1 29 7 36 

04-Feb-11 Harvesting and storage of pulses off Agronomy 1 14 8 22 

04-Feb-11 INM in curryleaf off Soil Science 1 6 12 18 

05-Feb-11 
Utilization of 8 row drum seeder  in 

paddy production 
off Agri Engg 1 11 3 14 

05-Feb-11 Feed and fodder management off Animal Science 1 12 0 12 

05-Feb-11 
Foliar application of micro nutrients in 

banana 
off Horticulture 1 10 0 10 

05-Feb-11 INM in brinjal off Soil Science 1 7 5 12 

05-Feb-11 
Harvesting threshing and storage of 

bengalgram 
off Agronomy 1 20 6 26 



08-Feb-11 
Maintenance of plant protection 

equipment  
off Agri Engg 1 12 0 12 

14-Feb-11 
Importance of Artificial Insemination 

in goat 
off Animal Science 1 15 0 15 

23-Feb-11 Drip irrigation in banana off Agri Engg 1 19 0 19 

26-Feb-11 Drip irrigation in coconut sp Agri Engg 1 20 0 20 

28-Feb-11 EDP training to rural women off Home Science 1 0 15 15 

01-Mar-11 

Designing , installation and proper 

maintenance of drip and sprinkler 

irrigation system  

voc Agri Engg 8 23 0 23 

02-Mar-11 
Utilization of vegetable preservator 

(CRIDA model) 
off Home Science 1 0 16 16 

03-Mar-11 
Different mulching techniques in field 

crops 
on Agronomy 1 23 0 23 

03-Mar-11 
Importance of sprouted greengram in 

daily diet 
off Home Science 1 0 19 19 

04-Mar-11 Importance of Soil and water testing on Soil Science 1 21 0 21 

07-Mar-11 

Income generation through livestock 

rearing( sheep and goat rearing group 

formation) 

on Animal Science 1 0 25 25 

08-Mar-11 
Importance of sprouted greengram in 

daily diet 
off Home Science 1 0 22 22 

10-Mar-11 
Utilization of drudgery reducing tools 

for women 
off  Home Science 1 0 15 15 

10-Mar-11 Drip irrigation in sugarcane off Agri Engg 1 14 4 18 

16-Mar-11 Care and maintenance  of poly house on Horticulture 1 17 6 23 

17-Mar-11 Women friendly agri tools  off Agri Engg 1 10 14 24 

18-Mar-11 Drip irrigation and its advantages sp Agri Engg 1 25 0 25 

22-Mar-11 ICM in Banana off Horticulture 1 14 0 14 



30-Mar-11 
Water management  practices in crop 

production 
on Agri Engg 2 9 3 12 

 

 

April 2011 to March 2012 

 

Date Training title Type Discipline Duration Male Female Total 

05-Apr-11 Production technology of Cotton  off Agronomy 1 12 0 12 

19-Apr-11 
Nursery management in paddy 

cultivation 
off Agronomy 1 11 0 11 

05-Apr-11 Production technology of Banana  off Horticulture 1 12 0 12 

15-Apr-11 
Method demonstration on seed 

rhizome storage in turmeric 
off Horticulture 1 11 0 11 

02-Apr-11 
Method demonstration on vegetable 

preservator 
off Home Science 1 11 3 14 

12-Apr-11 EDP training to rural women off Home Science 1 0 13 13 

16-Apr-11 Utilization of power weeder in paddy  off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 0 12 

21-Apr-11 
Utilization of power weeder in 

Banana 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 14 0 14 

07-Apr-11 Role of micronutrients in Banana off Soil Science 1 11 6 17 

19-Apr-11 Importance of soil and water testing off Soil Science 1 5 10 15 

30-Apr-11 Income generation through tailoring Sp Home Science 90 0 30 30 

10-May-11 Hybrid maize production technology  off Agronomy 1 15 2 17 

20-May-11 
Role and importance of new high 

yielding varieties of sorghum CO-30 
off Agronomy 1 28 0 28 

10-May-11 
Improved production technology of 

Banana 
off Horticulture 1 15 2 17 



20-May-11 
Role and importance of new high 

yielding varieties of  chillies co(CH)1 
off Horticulture 1 28 0 28 

10-May-11 

Role and importance of 

micronutrients in Banana production 

technology 

off Horticulture 1 15 2 17 

20-May-11 Importance of bio fertilizers in Pulses off Soil Science 1 12 0 12 

10-May-11 Importance of mixed fodder crops off Animal Science 1 15 2 17 

20-May-11 Importance of mixed fodder crops off Animal Science 1 28 0 28 

11-May-11 
Care and maintenance of vegetable 

preservator 
off Home Science 1 28 0 28 

24-May-11 Value added products from ragi off Home Science 1 0 10 10 

24-May-11 
Importance of chisel plough in 

dryland agriculture 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 0 8 8 

27-May-11 Adoption of rain gun in fodder crops off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 15 0 15 

07-Jun-11 Hybrid cotton cultivation On Agronomy 1 10 4 14 

07-Jun-11 INM in hybrid cotton On Soil Science 1 12 3 15 

07-Jun-11 Importance of mixed fodder crops On Animal Science 1 5 10 15 

07-Jun-11 EDP Training to rural women On Home Science 1 6 11 17 

27-Jun-11 
Income generation through 

sericulture rearing 
On Horticulture 1 7 11 18 

27-Jun-11 Scientific silkworm  rearing On Horticulture 1 13 7 20 

27-Jun-11 Importance of mixed fodder crops On Animal Science 1 14 10 24 

27-Jun-11 Mulberry cultivation  On Agronomy 1 18 2 20 

27-Jun-11 INM in bhendi On Soil Science 1 18 2 20 

10-Jun-11 
Introduction of Motorized earth augar 

in banana 
Off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 19 0 19 



14-Jun-11 EDP Training to rural women Off Home Science 1 0 29 29 

14-Jun-11 INM in tomato Off Soil Science 1 12 3 15 

16-Jun-11 Role of micronutrient in human diet Off Home Science 1 0 24 24 

22-Jun-11 
Role and importance of HDP in 

Banana cultivation  
Off Horticulture 1 13 7 20 

23-Jun-11 Role and importance of IPM  Off Horticulture 1 12 0 12 

23-Jun-11 IPM in paddy Off Agronomy 1 12 0 12 

29-Jun-11 
Introduction of tractor drawn 

groundnut harvester 
Off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 11 0 11 

20-Jun-11 Fruits and vegetable preservation  Voc Home Science 5 0 133 133 

14-Jun-11 
Drudgery reduction tools in brinjal 

cultivation 
Sp 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 17 12 29 

15-Jun-11 
Introduction of various mechanical 

weeder  
Sp 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 11 6 17 

15-Jul-11 
Importance and production of 

enriched FYM 
On Soil Science 2    

16-Jul-11 
Selection of suitable income 

generating activity for farm women 
On Soil Science 1 30 0 30 

16-Jul-11 Synchronization of milch animals On Animal Science 1 15 0 15 

21-Jul-11 
Installation  and maintenance of drip 

irrigation systems. 
On 

Agri 

Engineering 
2 2 18 20 

22-Jul-11 Pest and disease management in rice On Agronomy 2 30 0 30 

22-Jul-11 
Utilization of drudgery reduction 

equipment in home and farm 
On Soil Science 2 25 0 25 

22-Jul-11 Importance of mixed fodder On Animal Science 2 24 6 30 

25-Jul-11 
Role and importance of intercropping  

in Coconut 
On Horticulture 1 20 10 30 

02-Jul-11 Importance of rotavator (TD)  Off Agri 1 30 0 30 



Engineering 

07-Jul-11 Adoption of chaff cutter (Motorized) Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 11 0 11 

07-Jul-11 Importance of chaff cutter Off Animal Science 1 17 0 17 

11-Jul-11 
Utilization of 6 row inclined plate 

planter (TD) in groundnut production 
Off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 15 0 15 

14-Jul-11 Women empowerment  Off Lab Technician 1 10 4 14 

16-Jul-11 
Importance of new high yielding 

variety- COBH2 in Brinjal  
Off Horticulture 1 0 15 15 

25-Jul-11 EDP training to rural women Off Lab Technician 1 10 0 10 

26-Jul-11 
Role of bio agent in groundnut pest 

management  
Off Soil Science 1 0 15 15 

27-Jul-11 Role and functions of KVK Off Agronomy 1 18 0 18 

08-Jul-11 Importance of mixed fodder Sp Animal Science 1 26 8 34 

05-Aug-11 Seed treatment techniques in paddy Off Agronomy 1 14 1 15 

19-Aug-11 

Importance of seed rate, plant 

population and seed treatment in 

groundnut 

Off Agronomy 1 9 7 16 

09-Aug-11 
Importance of Pseudomonas in 

turmeric cultivation 
Off Horticulture 1 6 1 7 

19-Aug-11 
Importance of Trichogramma chilonis 

in brinjal cultivation 
Off Horticulture 1 9 7 16 

20-Aug-11 Importance of Mixed fodder Off Animal Science 1 17 3 20 

25-Aug-11 Clean milk production Off Animal Science 1 19 1 20 

05-Aug-11 Role and function of KVK Off Home Science 1 0 6 6 

11-Aug-11 Role and function of KVK Off Home Science 1 23 25 48 

18-Aug-11 Income generation through backyard Off Home Science 1 0 5 5 



poultry rearing 

20-Aug-11 Utilization of vegetable preservator Off Home Science 1 3 17 20 

05-Aug-11 
Field preparation of paddy production 

(Shallow puddling) 
Off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 13 0 13 

11-Aug-11 Advantages of drip irrigation system Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 15 0 15 

18-Aug-11 
Modern irrigation system of rain gun 

for fodder crops 
Off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 0 10 

09-Aug-11 
Importance of vermicompost in 

vegetable crops 
Off Soil Science 1 15 2 17 

22-Aug-11 Importance of soil and water testing Off Soil Science 1 16 8 24 

01-Aug-11 Income generation through tailoring Sp Lab Technician 90 0 30 30 

11-Aug-11 EDP training to rural women Off Lab Technician 1 0 23 23 

16-Sep-11 
Importance of non conventional 

energy sources 
On 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 2 22 24 

19-Sep-11 Protected cultivation of vegetables On Horticulture 1 4 18 22 

20-Sep-11 Banana cultivation  On Horticulture 1 50 4 54 

20-Sep-11 
Role  and importance of micro 

nutrient in banana 
On Soil Science 1 18 2 20 

23-Sep-11 
Scientific techniques in sheep and 

goat rearing  
On Animal Science 1 65 7 72 

06-Sep-11 Stall feeding practices in goat Off Animal Science 1 1 12 13 

13-Sep-11 Preparation of low cost nutritious mix Off Home Science 1 0 19 19 

20-Sep-11 Drip irrigation in banana Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 1 13 

21-Sep-11 Drip irrigation in banana Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 22 0 22 

22-Sep-11 Pulses production Technology Off Agronomy 1 20 0 20 



22-Sep-11 Value added products from pulses Off Home Science 1 30 9 39 

28-Sep-11 Importance of viable packaging Off Home Science 1 0 18 18 

29-Sep-11 
Vermicomposting production 

technology 
Off Agronomy 1 12 7 19 

01-Sep-11 Income generation through tailoring Sp Home Science 90 0 30 30 

08-Sep-11 
Pulse scenario in TamilNadu and its 

area, production  and productivity.  
Sp Agronomy 1 10 20 30 

15-Sep-11 

Role of  SAKVK in agriculture 

extension  development in 

Coimbatore district  

Sp Horticulture 1 4 1 5 

16-Sep-11 Pulses production technology Sp Agronomy 1 12 17 29 

16-Sep-11 
Vermicomposting production 

technology 
Sp Agronomy 1 0 24 24 

16-Sep-11 

Role of  SAKVK in agriculture 

extension  development in 

Coimbatore district  

Sp Horticulture 1 5 8 13 

22-Sep-11 INM in pulses  Sp Soil Science 1 10 9 19 

29-Sep-11 Role of Enriched Farm Yard manures Sp Soil Science 1 9 11 20 

29-Sep-11 Mechanization in cotton production On Agronomy 2 12 3 15 

13-Oct-11 EDP Training to rural youth On Home Science 1 12 18 30 

15-Oct-11 Vermi composting On Soil Science 1 23 6 29 

21-Oct-11 
Importance of non-conventional 

energy sources 
On 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 1 47 48 

21-Oct-11 
Nursery techniques in horticultural 

crops 
On Horticulture 1 0 16 16 

03-Oct-11 Importance of EM Off Animal Science 1 9 2 11 

03-Oct-11 Introduction of motorized chaff cutter Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 9 1 10 



10-Oct-11 
Integrated Nutrient management in 

pulses 
Off Agronomy 1 14 16 30 

10-Oct-11 
Pest and Disease management in 

banana 
Off Horticulture 1 7 3 10 

12-Oct-11 
Integrated Nutrient Management in 

pulses 
Off Soil Science 1 10 20 30 

13-Oct-11 INM in Maize Off Soil Science 1 28 2 30 

14-Oct-11 
Method demonstration on viable 

packaging 
Off Home Science 1 0 18 18 

14-Oct-11 
Advantages of various mechanical 

weeder 
Off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 14 0 14 

18-Oct-11 
Introduction of tractor drawn 

groundnut harvester 
Off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 9 0 9 

20-Oct-11 Poultry rearing Off Animal Science 1 0 10 10 

20-Oct-11 EDP Training to rural women Off Home Science 1 6 13 19 

20-Oct-11 
Popularization of Namakkal chicks in 

Coimbatore Dist.  
Off Home Science 1 1 10 11 

28-Oct-11 Mixed fodder crops in milch animals Off Animal Science 1 7 1 8 

28-Oct-11 Introduction of motorized chaff cutter Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 9 0 9 

31-Oct-11 Income generation through tailoring Sp Lab Technician 1 0 30 30 

13-Oct-11 Hybrid maize production techniques Sp Agronomy 1 28 2 30 

24-Nov-11 Different composting techniques On Agronomy 1 23 14 37 

24-Nov-11 
Role and importance of green 

manures  
On Soil Science 1 11 28 39 

25-Nov-11 
Role and importance of intercropping 

system in coconut 
On Horticulture 1 26 21 47 

04-Nov-11 EDP training to rural women Off Lab Technician 1 0 29 29 



04-Nov-11 
Introduction / Handling of motorized 

chaff cutter 
Off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 0 10 

12-Nov-11 
Income generation through Backyard 

poultry rearing 
Off Home Science 1 4 6 10 

17-Nov-11 Pulses production technology Off Agronomy 1 13 5 18 

18-Nov-11 
Role of bio agents and ETL based 

plant protection in Coleus 
Off Horticulture 1 8 0 8 

22-Nov-11 
Role of bio agents and ETL based 

plant protection in Turmeric 
Off Horticulture 1 7 0 7 

23-Nov-11 Value added products from Milk Off Home Science 1 0 18 18 

28-Nov-11 Importance of deworming  Off Animal Science 1 1 11 12 

30-Nov-11 Importance of fodder bank Off Animal Science 1 11 1 12 

30-Nov-11 Adoption of motorized earth augur Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 0 12 

22-Nov-11 
Integrated Pest Management in 

pulses 
Sp Agronomy 1 7 8 15 

23-Nov-11 

Prevention of Nutritional deficiency 

through low cost locally available 

food 

Sp Lab Technician 1 17 26 43 

30-Nov-11 
Role and importance of new high 

yielding variety in onion 
Sp Horticulture 1 14 0 14 

30-Nov-11 
Role and importance of  polythene 

mulch in vegetables  
Sp Horticulture 1 14 0 14 

30-Nov-11 Income generation through tailoring Sp Lab Technician 90 0 30 30 

30-Dec-11 Clean milk production On Animal Science 1 14 0 14 

03-Dec-11 
Role and importance of intercropping 

system in coconut 
Off Horticulture 1 8 0 8 

07-Dec-11 Introduction of motorized chaff cutter Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 0 10 



11-Dec-11 Introduction of Hi Tech sprayer Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 9 0 9 

13-Dec-11 
Introduction of motorized power 

weeder (TNAU Model) 
Off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 7 0 7 

15-Dec-11 
Role of bio agents and ETL based 

plant production in chillies 
Off Horticulture 1 5 5 10 

17-Dec-11 Introduction of groundnut harvester Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 9 6 15 

19-Dec-11 Correct cooking methods Off Home Science 1 0 27 27 

20-Dec-11 
Integrated pest and disease 

management in pulses 
Off Agronomy 1 9 12 21 

21-Dec-11 Value added products from millets Off Home Science 1 0 18 18 

23-Dec-11 Integrated farming system Off Soil Science 1 18 6 24 

26-Dec-11 
Scientific technique in sheep and goat 

rearing 
Off Animal Science 1 11 3 14 

27-Dec-11 
Adoption of motorized power weeder 

in paddy production 
Off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 9 0 9 

30-Dec-11 EDP training to Rural women  Off Lab Technician 1 0 15 15 

31-Dec-11 
Marketing skills for sale of SHG 

products 
Off Lab Technician 1 0 15 15 

19-Dec-11 
Mechanization in paddy production 

(State Dept of Agrl) 
Sp 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 29 0 29 

20-Dec-11 
Mechanization in paddy production 

(State Dept of Agrl) 
Sp 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 49 0 49 

23-Dec-11 
Health and nutrition management 

through available resources (NAWA) 
Sp Home Science 1 16 24 40 

26-Dec-11 
Food processing and preservation 

(GPT)) 
Sp Home Science 5 0 60 60 

30-Dec-11 Nutrient management in maize Sp Agronomy 1 0 15 15 



31-Dec-11 Income generation through tailoring Sp Lab Technician 90 0 30 30 

10-Jan-12 
Cultivation practices for dual sorghum 

Co 30 
On Agronomy 2 0 25 25 

12-Jan-12 Importance of millets in human diet On Home Science 2 0 26 26 

11-Jan-12 
Improved cultivation practices in 

Maize and Vermi  composting 
On Agronomy 1 20 22 42 

11-Jan-12 Role of VDK in Agriculture On Soil Science 1 17 26 43 

13-Jan-12 
Role and importance of new high 

yielding variety in coconut 
On Horticulture 1 32 11 43 

25-Jan-12 Value added products from fruits On Home Science 1 14 5 19 

03-Jan-12 Role of micronutrients in human diet Off Home Science 1 0 27 27 

04-Jan-12 Sheep and goat rearing techniques Off Animal Science 1 1 13 14 

13-Jan-12 
Introduction of motorized power 

weeder in paddy 
Off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 15 0 15 

24-Jan-12 Rhizome rot management in turmeric Off Horticulture 1 5 1 6 

25-Jan-12 Drip irrigation in vegetable crops Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 19 0 19 

27-Jan-12 Correct cooking methods Off Home Science 1 3 9 12 

30-Jan-12 
Role and importance of new high 

yielding variety in chillies 
Off Horticulture 1 7 0 7 

30-Jan-12 Correct cooking methods Off Home Science 1 0 19 19 

12-Jan-12 
Role and importance of  high density 

planting methods in banana 
Sp Horticulture 1 29 0 29 

23-Jan-12 
Importance of nutrition during adult 

cents  period 
Sp Home Science 1 0 147 147 

24-Jan-12 
Importance of nutrition during adult 

cents  period 
Sp Home Science 1 0 154 154 

25-Jan-12 Importance of nutrition during adult Sp Home Science 1 2 172 174 



cents  period 

27-Jan-12 
Importance of nutrition during adult 

cents  period 
Sp Home Science 1 0 136 136 

27-Jan-12 
Role and importance of seed 

treatment in bhendi 
Sp Horticulture 1 13 12 25 

31-Jan-12 
Role of farm mechanization in crop 

production 
Sp 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 42 0 42 

27-Jan-12 Importance of mixed fodder Sp Animal Science 1 26 8 34 

06-Feb-12 
Repair & maintenance of plant 

protection equipment 
On 

Agri 

Engineering 
2 10 12 22 

08-Feb-12 
Drip irrigation system  in vegetable 

crops  
On 

Agri 

Engineering 
2 10 0 10 

09-Feb-12 EDP Training to rural women On Lab Technician 1 53 21 74 

16-Feb-12 Vermicomposting On Soil Science 1 18 4 22 

23-Feb-12 
Role of bio agents and ETL based 

plant protection in Banana 
On Horticulture 1 27 4 31 

27-Mar-12 
Importance of non conventional 

energy sources 
On Home Science 1 1 20 21 

07-Feb-12 Power weeder in banana Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 0 12 

11-Feb-12 Different composting techniques Off Soil Science 1 24 0 24 

11-Feb-12 Vermi composting Off Soil Science 1 24 0 24 

14-Feb-12 
Role of bio agents and ETL based 

plant protection in Brinjal  
Off Horticulture 1 6 0 6 

14-Feb-12 
Importance of synchronization for 

dairy cows 
Off Animal Science 1 11 0 11 

28-Feb-12 Incorporation of pulses in daily diet Off Home Science 1 0 41 41 

29-Feb-12 
Storage loss minimization techniques 

in cereals and Pulses 
Off Home Science 1 0 42 42 



01-Feb-12 
Income generation through tailoring 

and stitching 
Voc Lab Technician 180 0 32 32 

01-Feb-12 
Prevention of nutritional deficiency 

through low cost diet 
Sp Home Science 1 0 51 51 

03-Feb-12 
Role of bio agents and ETL based 

plant protection in Bhendi 
Sp Horticulture 1 13 12 25 

03-Feb-12 Importance of drip irrigation  Sp 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 37 34 71 

09-Feb-12 
Prevention of nutritional deficiency 

through low cost diet 
Sp Home Science 1 0 31 31 

10-Feb-12 
Prevention of nutritional deficiency 

through low cost diet 
Sp Home Science 1 0 33 33 

17-Feb-12 
Health and nutritional management 

with available resources 
Sp Home Science 1 19 2 21 

17-Feb-12 
Importance of farm machineries in 

crop production 
Sp 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 125 20 145 

18-Feb-12 Rural empowerment in agro industry Sp 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 142 0 142 

26-Feb-12 Organic farming Sp Agronomy 1 12 0 12 

29-Feb-12 Value added products from bhendi  Sp Home Science 1 4 9 13 

09-Mar-12 Vermi composting On Soil Science 1 20 4 24 

12-Mar-12 EDP training to rural women On Lab Technician 1 0 17 17 

14-Mar-12 Importance of mixed fodder On Animal Science 1 1 19 20 

22-Mar-12 Intercropping system in coconut On Horticulture 1 30 10 40 

29-Mar-12 
Role of bio agents and ETL based 

plant protection in Banana 
On Horticulture 1 13 0 13 

03-Mar-12 Correct cooking methods Off Home Science 1 0 29 29 

03-Mar-12 Role of millets in daily diet Off Home Science 1 0 19 19 



11-Mar-12 Introduction of battery sprayer Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 14 0 14 

12-Mar-12 
Role of bio agents and ETL based 

plant protection in Onion 
Off Horticulture 1 7 3 10 

15-Mar-12 
Role of bio agents and ETL based 

plant protection in Tomato 
Off Horticulture 1 5 5 10 

16-Mar-12 Maize post harvest management Off Agronomy 1 29 1 30 

17-Mar-12 Value added products from maize Off Home Science 1 12 9 21 

19-Mar-12 SSI technology in sugarcane Off Agronomy 1 31 8 39 

22-Mar-12 
Role and importance of 

micronutrients in pulses 
Off Soil Science 1 4 13 17 

22-Mar-12 
Selection of agri based income 

generating activities 
Off Lab Technician 1 0 15 15 

29-Mar-12 Importance of mixed fodder Off Animal Science 1 10 2 12 

30-Mar-12 
Introduction of motorized earth augur 

in banana 
Off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 21 0 21 

01-Mar-12 
Income generation through tailoring 

and stitching 
Voc Lab Technician 180 0 32 32 

12-Mar-12 
Value added Products from  Millets 

and Milk 
Voc Home Science 6 0 114 114 

01-Mar-12 
High density planting methods in 

Banana 
Sp Horticulture 1 47 5 52 

01-Mar-12 Value added Products from banana Sp Home Science 1 47 5 52 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



April 2012 to March 2013 

 

Date Training title Type Discipline Duration Male Female Total 

01.02.12 to 

30.07.12 

Income generation through tailoring 

and stitching 
SP Lab Technician 180 0 32 32 

07.04.12 Value addition in amla Off Lab Technician 1 0 12 12 

12.04.12 

Income generation through backyard 

poultry rearing 
Off Home Science 1 0 12 12 

18.04.12 

Protected cultivation of vegetables 

crops 
Sp Horticulture 1 10 0 10 

19.04.12 High density in banana cultivation SP Horticulture 1 16 5 21 

19.04.12 Pulses production technologies Sp Agronomy 1 16 5 21 

20.04.12 Drip irrigation in banana Off Agri Engg 1 12 0 12 

27.04.12 Value added products from sorghum Off Home Science 1 3 16 19 

10.05.12 

Pest and disease management in 

Sugarcane 

Off 
Agronomy 1 18 3 21 

10.05.12 

Importance of Effective micro 

organism  

Off 
Animal Science 1 10 3 13 

11.05.12 Pulses seed production technology Off Agronomy 1 20 14 34 

11.05.12 Importance of soil  and water testing Off Soil Science 1 20 14 34 

12.05.12 

Value added products from fruits and 

vegetables 
On Home Science 1 21 0 21 

15.05.12 Stall fed goat rearing techniques On Animal Science 1 38 8 46 

15.05.12 

Micro irrigation system in banana 

cultivation 
Off Agri Engg 1 13 0 13 

16.05.12 High density in banana cultivation On Horticulture 1 25 9 34 

16.05.12 

Production and application of 

enriched Farm Yard manure 
Sp Soil Science 1 27 0 27 



19.05.12 Importance of millets in daily diet Off Home Science 1 2 10 12 

19.05.12 

Drip irrigation system for banana 

cultivation 

Off 
Agri Engg 1 12 0 12 

21.05.12 to 

25.02.12 

A short term course on gender 

sensitization 
Sp Lab Technician 5 0 40 40 

22.05.12 Value added products from banana On Home Science 1 26 0 26 

23.05.12 to 

24.05.12 
EDP Training to rural women 

Off 
Lab Technician 1 0 40 40 

25.05.12 Vermi composting techniques Off Soil Science 1 0 40 40 

26.05.12 

Shallow  puddling techniques in 

paddy production 

Off 
Agri Engg 1 12 0 12 

29.05.12 

Marketing techniques in value added 

products 
On Home Science 1 15 26 41 

04.06.12 

Role and importance of intercropping 

system in coconut 
Sp Horticulture 1 19 12 31 

05.06.12 

Packing and labeling techniques for 

Marketing  

Off 
Lab Technician 1 2 18 20 

07.06.12 

Role of bio agents and ETL  based 

plant protection in chillies 

Off 
Horticulture 1 14 2 16 

07.06.12 Value added products from millets  Off Home Science 1 0 24 24 

08.06.12 

Role of bio agents and ETL  based 

plant protection in bhendi 

Off 
Horticulture 1 11 0 11 

11.06.12 Shallow puddling in paddy production Off Agri Engg 1 14 0 14 

12.06.12 Milch animal management Sp Animal Science 1 18 10 28 

15.06.12 EDP Training to rural women Off Lab Technician 1 0 20 20 

16.06.12 

Importance of seed treatment in 

pulses 
Sp Agronomy 1 18 0 18 

18.06.12 Drip irrigation in banana Off Agri Engg 1 12 0 12 



20.06.12 

Marketing techniques in value added 

products 

Off 
Home Science 1 0 15 15 

21.06.12 Milch animal management Off Animal Science 1 18 6 24 

21.06.12 

Pest and disease management in 

horticultural crops 
Sp Horticulture 1 8 0 8 

21.06.12 

Pest and disease management in Field 

crops 
Sp Agronomy 1 10 0 10 

21.06.12 

Mechanization in groundnut 

production 
Sp Agri Engg 1 30 0 30 

22.06.12 Preparation of nutritious mix Off Lab Technician 1 0 29 29 

27.06.12 Shallow puddling in paddy production Off Agri Engg 1 11 0 11 

27.06.12 Sheep and goat rearing techniques Off Animal Science 1 14 6 20 

29.06.12 

Mechanization in groundnut 

production 
Sp Agri Engg 1 25 0 25 

02.07.12 

Integrated nutrient management in 

paddy 
Off Soil Science 1 7 16 23 

07.07.12 Milch animal management Sp Animal Science 1 0 9 9 

11.07.12 

Value added products from 

greengram 

Off 
Home Science 1 0 13 13 

13.07.12 Value added products from curry leaf Off Home Science 1 2 10 12 

16.07.12 

Seed treatment in paddy with bio 

agent and bio fertilizer 

Off 
Agronomy 1 11 1 12 

16.07.12 Correct Cooking methods  Off Lab Technician 1 0 27 27 

16.07.12 

Hi- tech nursery in Vegetable seedling 

production 
Sp Horticulture 1 23 11 34 

18.07.12 

Prevention of B complex deficiency 

through sprouted greengram 

Off 
Soil Science 1 0 24 24 

18.07.12 

Introduction of motorized earth augur 

in banana 

Off 
Agri Engg 1 10 0 10 



19.07.12 

Adoption of motorized power weeder 

in paddy production 

Off 
Agri Engg 1 9 1 10 

20.07.12 Use of curry leaf in daily diet Off Lab Technician 1 0 20 20 

20.07.12 Importance of millets in daily diet Off Home Science 1 0 11 11 

21.07.12 Value added products from sorghum Off Home Science 1 1 14 15 

23.07.12 

Intercropping system in coconut 

cultivation 
Sp Horticulture 1 15 10 25 

26.07.12 Role of millets in daily diet Off Lab Technician 1 0 24 24 

30.07.12 Seed treatment in maize Off Agronomy 1 18 2 20 

04.08.12 

Introduction of motorized earth augur 

in banana 

Off 
Agri Engg 1 10 0 10 

04.08.12 ICM in Banana  Off Horticulture 1 11 1 12 

04.08.12 

Foliar application of micronutrient in 

Banana and Turmeric 

Off 
Soil Science 1 13 2 15 

06.08.12 Role of ethylene in Bitter gourd   Off Horticulture 1 8 0 8 

06.08.12 

Selection of agri based income 

generating activities. 

Off 
Lab Technician 1 0 19 19 

06.08.12 to 

23.08.12 
Fashion Designing Sp Lab Technician 15 0 16 16 

08.08.12 

High density planting methods in 

Banana  
On Horticulture 1 30 30 60 

17.08.12 

Integrated nutrient management in 

Groundnut 

Off 
Soil Science 1 17 2 19 

17.08.12 

Importance of bio agents in paddy 

pest and disease management 

Off 
Agronomy 1 14 1 15 

17.08.12 Importance of mixed fodder bank Off Animal Science 1 0 14 14 

18.08.12 Role of Micronutrients in human diet Off Home Science 1 0 20 20 

23.08.12 Value added products from Ragi Off Home Science 1 0 12 12 



27.08.12 

Introduction of power weeder in 

paddy 

Off Agri Engg 
1 11 0 11 

28.08.12 Drip irrigation in banana Off Agri Engg 1 14 0 14 

29.08.12 

Introduction of Hi tech sprayer in 

paddy 

Off Agri Engg 
1 11 0 11 

31.08.12 

Mushroom production and its 

importance 
On Agronomy 1 3 67 70 

31.08.12 Value added products from Milk Off Home Science 1 0 12 12 

04.09.12 ICM in Banana On Horticulture 1 39 11 50 

04.09.12 Drip irrigation in banana On Agri Engg 1 19 0 19 

06.09.12 Drip irrigation in banana On Agri Engg 1 21 0 21 

05.09.12 & 

07.09.12 

Mechanization in groundnut 

production 

On Agri Engg 
2 16 0 16 

07.09.12 Composting technology On Soil Science 1 1 20 21 

18.09.12 & 

21.09.12 Mechanization in paddy production 

On 
Agri Engg 2 14 0 14 

25.09.12 

Popularization of carotene enriched 

milk 

On 
Home Science 1 2 30 32 

03.09.12  & 

05.03.12 

Entrepreneur development 

programme for Rural youth 
Off Lab Technician 2 0 28 28 

07.09.12 Importance of fodder bank Off Animal Science 1 1 10 11 

21.09.12 

Scientific sheep and rearing 

techniques 

Off 
Animal Science 1 12 0 12 

20.09.12 Composting technology Off Soil Science 1 42 0 42 

27.09.12 SRI in Paddy Off Agronomy 1 20 5 25 

27.09.12 

Selection of suitable agri and allied 

income generating activities 

Off 
Lab Technician 1 0 16 16 

28.09.12 Identification of adulterated foods Off Home Science 1 0 15 15 



06.09.12 

Mechanization in groundnut 

production 
Sp Agri Engg 1 27 14 41 

07.09.12 Seed treatment in Vegetable crops SP Horticulture 1 0 10 10 

03.10.12 Different composting technologies On Soil Science 1 10 30 40 

13.10.12 Value added products from millets On Lab Technician 1 0 25 25 

16.10.12 Mixed fodder production On Animal Science 1 49 0 49 

17.10.12 Pulses seed production technology On Agronomy 1 30 20 50 

29.10.12 Mixed fodder production On Animal Science 1 32 6 38 

03.10.12 SRI Techniques in paddy On Agronomy 1 17 8 25 

5.10.12 

Pseudo stem weevil management in 

banana 

On 
Horticulture 1 10 1 11 

05.10.12 Value addition in curry leaf Off Lab Technician 1 0 16 16 

12.10.12 Importance of Bio fertilizer Off Soil Science 1 2 10 12 

12.10.12 Sheep and goat rearing techniques Off Animal Science 1 0 17 17 

12.10.12 

Motorized earth augur in banana 

production 

Off 
Agri Engg 1 10 0 10 

15.10.12 Mixed fodder production Off Animal Science 1 1 15 16 

17.10.12 Mixed fodder production Off Animal Science 1 21 0 21 

04.10.12 to 

06.10.12 

Repairs and maintenance of controls 

for water lifting devices 
Voc Agri Engg 3 6 0 6 

08.10.12 

JCB equipment in agricultural 

production 
Sp Agri Engg 1 21 2 23 

15.10.12 to 

14.01.13 Income generation through tailoring 

Sp 
Lab Technician 90 0 31 31 

15.10.12 to 

20.10.12 Friends of Coconut Tree (FoCT) 

Sp 
Horticulture 6 16 4 20 



03.10.12 Different composting technologies On Soil Science 1 10 30 40 

13.10.12 Value added products from millets On Lab Technician 1 0 25 25 

16.10.12 Mixed fodder production On Animal Science 1 49 0 49 

17.10.12 Pulses seed production technology On Agronomy 1 30 20 50 

29.10.12 Mixed fodder production On Animal Science 1 32 6 38 

03.10.12 SRI Techniques in paddy On Agronomy 1 17 8 25 

05.10.12 

Pseudostem weevil management in 

banana 

On 
Horticulture 1 10 1 11 

05.10.12 Value addition in curry leaf Off Lab Technician 1 0 16 16 

12.10.12 Importance of Bio fertilizer Off Soil Science 1 2 10 12 

12.10.12 Sheep and goat rearing techniques Off Animal Science 1 0 17 17 

12.10.12 

Motorized earth augur in banana 

production 

Off 
Agri Engg 1 10 0 10 

15.10.12 Mixed fodder production Off Animal Science 1 1 15 16 

17.10.12 Mixed fodder production Off Animal Science 1 21 0 21 

04.10.12 to 

06.10.12 

Repairs and maintenance of controls 

for water lifting devices 
Voc Agri Engg 3 6 0 6 

08.10.12 

JCB equipment in agricultural 

production 
Sp Agri Engg 1 21 2 23 

15.10.12 to 

14.01.13 Income generation through tailoring 

Sp 
Lab Technician 90 0 31 31 

15.10.12 to 

20.10.12 Friends of Coconut Tree (FoCT) 

Sp 
Horticulture 6 16 4 20 

18.10.12 

Plant protection techniques in 

vegetable crops 

Sp 
Horticulture 1 10 10 20 

06.11.12 

Seed treatment and weed 

management in Maize 
Off Agronomy 1 16 0 16 



06.11.12 ICM in Bengalgram Off Soil Science 1 14 3 17 

06.11.12 Importance of salt lick Off Animal Science 1 10 4 14 

08.11.12 

Role and importance of intercropping 

system in coconut 

Off 
Horticulture 1 7 3 10 

08.11.12 Importance of salt lick Off Animal Science 1 12 3 15 

20.11.12 Introduction of motorized earth augur Off Agri Engg 1 16 0 16 

23.11.12 Safety storage methods of food grains Off Home Science 1 0 14 14 

26.11.12 Importance of Grand supplement Off Animal Science 1 9 3 12 

29.11.12 Role of micro nutrient in human diet Off Home Science 1 2 12 14 

01.11.12 to 

31.01.13 

Income generating through tailoring 

and embroidery 
Sp Lab Technician 90 0 32 32 

11.12.12 & 

12.12.12 
EDP training to rural youth On Lab Technician 2 8 10 18 

13.12.12 

Importance of Azolla cultivation and 

feeding 

On 
Animal Science 1 15 7 22 

14.12.12 

Importance of Azolla cultivation and 

feeding 

On 
Animal Science 1 24 0 24 

21.12.12 Back yard poultry On Animal Science 1 14 2 16 

21.12.12 

Role of   farm mechanization in crop 

production 

On 
Agri Engg 1 24 0 24 

03.12.12 

Introduction of new high yielding F1 

hybrids (Arka samrat & COTH 3) in 

tomato  

Off Horticulture 1 7 1 8 

04.12.12 

Introduction of tractor operated farm 

waste shredder 

Off 
Agri Engg 1 10 1 11 

11.12.12 Importance of soil and water testing Off Soil Science 1 10 3 13 

15.12.12 Cultivation practices in sorghum Off Agronomy 1 5 14 19 



18.12.12 

Value added    products from 

sorghum 

Off 
Home Science 1 0 20 20 

28.12.12 Animal Science as a component in IFS Off Animal Science 1 56 15 71 

28.12.12 EDP training to rural women Off Lab Technician 1 0 15 15 

29.12.12 

Farm mechanization in animal science 

based IFS 

Off 
Agri Engg 1 18 15 33 

29.12.12 

Packing, labeling techniques for 

marketing SHG products  

Off 
Lab Technician 1 0 15 15 

11.12.12 Mixed fodder bank Sp Animal Science 1 24 9 33 

27.12.12 Groundnut cultivation practices Sp Agronomy 1 21 3 24 

07.01.13 & 

08.01.13 

Administrative and accounts 

procedures for office superintend  of 

NGO and deemed  university KVK of 

Zone VIII - organized by ZPD, Zone 

VIII, Bangalore 

On - 2 21 3 24 

03.01.13 Value added products from amla  Off Home Science 1 0 14 14 

09.01.13 Weed management in tomato Off Horticulture 1 7 3 10 

17.01.13 Intercropping systems in banana Off Horticulture 1 10 0 10 

23.01.13 

Food safety and standards license for 

food products 

Off 
Lab Technician 1 0 17 17 

24.01.13 

Awareness Programme on 

importance of millets 

Off 
Lab Technician 1 0 23 23 

28.01.13 INM in Greengram Off Soil Science 1 0 14 14 

30.01.13 Pulses production technology Off Agronomy 1 18 6 24 

30.01.13 Importance of bio fertilizer Off Soil Science 1 0 12 12 

31.01.13 IPD in brinjal Off Horticulture 1 7 3 10 

31.01.13 Safety harvesting techniques in brinjal Off Agri Engg 1 13 2 15 



30.01.13 & 

31.01.13 Areca plate making 
Voc Lab Technician 2 0 33 33 

04.01.13 Importance of mixed fodder crop Sp Animal Science 1 27 17 44 

21.01.13 IPD in banana Sp Horticulture 1 13 11 24 

01.11.12 to 

31.01.13 

Income generating through tailoring 

and embroidery 

Sp 
Lab Technician 90 0 32 32 

01.02.13 Coir composting  techniques On Soil Science 1 0 20 20 

12.02.13 Goat farming On Animal Science 1 23 1 24 

19.02.13 EDP training to rural youth On 10 1 0 16 16 

22.02.13 Millets based products preparation On Home Science 1 0 13 13 

04.02.13 Different composting techniques Off Soil Science 1 0 15 15 

04.02.13 

Agri based income generating 

activities 

Off 
Lab Technician 1 0 16 16 

05.02.13 Women empowerment through SHGs Off Lab Technician 1 0 12 12 

06.02.13 Women empowerment through SHGs Off Lab Technician 1 0 12 12 

05.02.13 

Improved production technologies in 

horticultural crops 
Sp Horticulture 1 47 5 52 

06.02.13 Maize production technology Sp Agronomy 1 0 20 20 

06.02.13 

Role of farm mechanization in crop 

production 

Sp 
Agri Engg 1 0 20 20 

07.02.13 

Improved production technologies in 

horticultural crops 

Sp 
Horticulture 1 35 3 38 

13.02.13 

Precision farming in horticultural 

crops 

Sp 
Horticulture 1 15 0 15 

13.02.13 

Vermi compost production 

techniques 

Sp 
Soil Science 1 4 18 22 

28.02.13 Cereals production technology Sp Agronomy 1 12 0 12 



28.02.13 Importance of soil testing Sp Soil Science 1 25 15 40 

19.03.13 
Hi tech nursery in vegetable seedlings 

production 
On Horticulture 1 20 18 38 

19.03.13 Millets production technology On Agronomy 1 19 7 26 

19.03.13 Composting techniques On Soil Science 1 0 26 26 

19.03.13 
Advantages of modern irrigation 

system 

On 
Agri Engg 1 22 4 26 

19.03.13 Mixed fodder crop  On Animal Science 1 9 17 26 

20.03.13 SSI in sugarcane On Agronomy 1 5 52 57 

20.03.13 
Precision farming in horticultural 

crops 

On 
Horticulture 1 21 29 50 

20.03.13 ICM in banana On Soil Science 2 42 8 50 

20.03.13 Sheep and goat rearing techniques On Animal Science 1 12 3 15 

20.03.13 
Entrepreneur developmental 

programme 

On 
Lab Technician 1 0 49 49 

20.03.13 
Role of farm machineries’ in crop 

production 

On 
Agri Engg 1 19 6 25 

21.03.13 Hybrid maize production technology On Agronomy 1 5 21 26 

21.03.13 Mixed fodder crop technology On Animal Science 1 0 9 9 

21.03.13 
Entrepreneur development 

programme 

On 
Lab Technician 1 0 26 26 

21.03.13 
Role of farm machineries’ in crop 

production 

On 
Agri Engg 1 33 19 52 

22.03.13 Composting techniques On Soil Science 1 3 21 24 

25.03.13 Composting technology Off Soil Science 1 4 8 12 

27.03.13 Groundnut cultivation practice Off Agronomy 1 10 2 12 



26.03.13 Low cost nutritious mix preparation Off Home Science 1 5 7 12 

06.03.13 
Precision farming in horticultural 

crops 
Sp Horticulture 1 22 5 27 

 

 

April 2013 to March 2014 

 

Date Training title Type Discipline Duration Male Female Total 

09.04.13 & 

12.04.13 
Preparation of millet based products  on Home Science 4 0 9 9 

16.04.13 ICM in banana off Horticulture 1 10 0 10 

25.04.13 Role of micro nutrients in daily diet off Home Science 1 0 23 23 

29.04.13 
Role of chisel plough in rainfed  

agriculture 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 7 19 

30.04.13 Importance of soil  and water testing off Soil Science 1 0 12 12 

30.04.13 
Proper care and maintenance of 

power  sprayer 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 9 21 

05.04.13 Intercropping system in coconut sp Horticulture 1 32 9 41 

08.04.13 Importance of soil and water testing sp Soil Science 1 16 6 22 

09.04.13 SSI in sugarcane sp Agronomy 1 61 11 72 

10.04.13 
Role of micro irrigation system in crop 

production 
sp 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 54 6 60 

12.04.13 Mixed fodder crops techniques sp Animal Science 1 50 21 71 

01.05.13 
Economic empowerment of women 

through agriculture 
off Lab technician 1 0 30 30 

08.05.13 IPDM in banana off Horticulture 1 12 1 13 

08.05.13 Importance of mixed fodder bank off Animal Science 1 11 2 13 



10.05.13 Role of micro nutrient in human diet off Home Science 1 22 4 26 

11.05.13 
Storage loss minimization techniques 

in cereals and pulses 
off Lab technician 1 0 40 40 

16.05.13 
Soil conservation practices for dryland 

agriculture 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 13 7 20 

16.05.13 
Integrated weed management in 

maize 
off Agronomy 1 11 8 19 

23.05.13 Importance of soil testing off Soil Science 1 12 19 31 

27.05.13 to 

29.05.13 
Value added products from millets voc Home Science 3 0 13 13 

01.05.13 to 

30.06.13 
Income generation through tailoring sp Lab technician 60 0 30 30 

01.05.13 to 

31.05.13 
Basic computer and MS office sp Lab technician 30 0 30 30 

01.06.13 Importance of soil and water testing on Lab technician 1 6 14 20 

07.06.13 Value added products from banana off Home Science 1 0 13 13 

13.06.13 
Importance of gypsum application in 

groundnut 
off Agronomy 1 0 26 26 

20.06.13 Importance of mixed fodder off Animal Science 1 10 5 15 

20.06.13 Role of micro nutrients in human diet off Home Science 1 2 11 13 

20.06.13 INM in bhendi off Soil Science 1 7 5 12 

21.06.13 
Installing and maintenance of Drip 

irrigation in banana 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 14 0 14 

05.07.13 

&06.07.13 

Repair & maintenance of plant 

protection equipment’s 
on 

Agri 

Engineering 
2 9 6 15 

10.07.13 Importance of soil and water testing off Soil Science 1 2 13 15 

11.07.13 Value added products from fruits off Home Science 1 0 33 33 

12.07.13 Role and importance of rhizome off Horticulture 1 7 0 7 



treatment in turmeric 

09.07.13 Income generating activities sp Lab technician 1 0 35 35 

26.08.13 Role and functions of KVK on Lab technician 1 2 9 11 

30.08.13 EDP training to rural women on Lab technician 1 2 34 36 

13.08.13 Introduction of chisel ploughing off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 19 0 19 

05.08.13 Soil and water conservation practices voc 
Agri 

Engineering 
30 10 0 10 

20.08.13 Dry land horticulture  sp Horticulture 1 27 17 44 

20.08.13 
Importance of soil testing and bio 

fertilizer application 
sp Soil Science 1 27 17 44 

22.08.13 
Micro / Macro level water harvesting 

techniques in rainfed agriculture 
sp 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 49 0 49 

29.08.13 
Improved agronomical practices in 

greengram 
sp Agronomy 1 35 14 49 

29.08.13 
Micro / Macro level water harvesting 

techniques in rainfed agriculture 
sp 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 35 14 49 

04.09.13 Importance of mixed fodder crop off Animal Science 1 16 2 18 

12.09.13 Importance of mixed fodder crop off Animal Science 1 17 3 20 

12.09.13 INM in tomato off Soil Science 1 7 4 11 

19.09.13 Inter cropping methods in banana sp Horticulture 1 20 0 20 

19.09.13 
Importance of seed treatment in 

pulses 
sp Agronomy 1 21 0 21 

01.10.13 
Importance of Anthelmintic mineral 

block 
on Animal Science 1 6 20 26 

03.10.13 Value addition in millets on Home Science 1 13 39 52 

03.10.13 
Introduction of grading of groundnut 

for value addition 
on 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 13 39 52 



04.10.13 
Importance and method of seed 

treatment in greengram 
on Agronomy 1 0 52 52 

04.10.13 Importance of mixed fodder on Animal Science 1 34 0 34 

07.10.13 Stall fed goatery on Animal Science 1 0 26 26 

07&08.10.13 
Introduction of primary & secondary 

tillage equipment in tribal area 
on 

Agri 

Engineering 
2 9 5 14 

09.10.13 
Quality mulberry leaf production and 

scientific rearing  of silkworm 
on Agronomy 1 1 51 52 

09.10.13 
Nursery techniques in vegetable 

seedling production 
on Horticulture 1 2 42 44 

09.10.13 Importance of milking machine on Animal Science 1 2 24 26 

11.10.13 Importance of milking machine on Animal Science 1 0 26 26 

11.10.13 Different composting technology on Soil Science 1 14 21 35 

14.10.13 Vermi composting on Soil Science 1 15 33 48 

16.10.13 Demonstration of desi chicken on Animal Science 1 0 19 19 

16.10.13 Different composting technology on Soil Science 1 16 10 26 

18.10.13 Clean milk production on Animal Science 1 3 23 26 

18.10.13 Vermi composting on Soil Science 1 0 26 26 

19.10.13 
Introduction of manually operated 

groundnut decorticator 
on 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 17 35 52 

22.10.13 Intercropping methods in banana on Horticulture 1 1 25 26 

25.10.13 Integrated farming system on Horticulture 1 7 21 28 

28.10.13 
Importance and timely application of 

gypsum in groundnut 
on Agronomy 1 22 34 56 

30.10.13 
Importance of intercropping system 

in coconut 
on Horticulture 1 8 14 22 



30.10.13 
Introduction of groundnut harvesting 

(TD) 
on 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 15 4 19 

23.10.13 
Importance of soil testing & INM in 

Tomato 
off Soil Science 1 9 2 11 

24.10.13 
Introduction of motorized earth augur 

in  banana 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 0 10 

18.10.13 
Nursery techniques in sugarcane 

seedling production 
sp Agronomy 1 20 2 22 

29.10.13 Women and child care sp Home Science 1 1 35 36 

11.11.13 Importance of mixed fodder crop off Animal Science 1 15 5 20 

21.11.13 
Advantages of steam based turmeric 

boiler 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 8 0 8 

12.11.13 
Importance of inter cropping system 

in coconut 
sp Horticulture 1 10 16 26 

12.11.13 Role and importance of bio fertilizer sp Soil Science 1 10 16 26 

13.11.13 
Rainfed groundnut cultivation and 

water management 
sp Agronomy 1 14 12 26 

14.11.13 Goat rearing sp Animal Science 1 15 9 24 

18.11.13 Importance of secondary agriculture sp Home Science 1 4 11 15 

18.11.13 SSI in sugarcane sp Agronomy 1 5 15 20 

19.11.13 Milch animal management sp Animal Science 1 13 8 21 

22.11.13 
Income generating activities through 

home care products  
sp Home Science 1 18 46 64 

10.12.13 
Role of women in agriculture 

development 
on Lab technician 1 3 45 48 

02.12.13 Importance of mixed fodder crop off Animal Science 1 16 6 22 

11.12.13 Value added products from banana off Home Science 1 36 0 36 

13.12.13 EDP training to rural women off Lab technician 1 0 20 20 



23.12.13 
Introduction of tractor drawn 

groundnut harvester 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 0 10 

26.12.13 
Pest and diseases management in 

bengalgram 
off Agronomy 1 16 0 16 

26.10.13 
Introduction of mechanical grader in 

groundnut 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 0 10 

30.12.13 Prevention of food adulteration off Lab technician 1 0 14 14 

10.12.13 
Integrated Pest and Disease 

Management in banana 
sp Horticulture 1 4 13 17 

23.12.13 
Vermi compost production 

technology 
sp Soil Science 1 2 16 18 

24.12.13 Post-harvest technology in tomato sp Home Science 1 0 21 21 

24.12.13 Goat rearing sp Animal Science 1 15 8 23 

27.12.13 Value added products from tomato sp Home Science 1 2 13 15 

02.01.14 
Introduction of turmeric harvester 

(TD) 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 5 0 5 

07.01.14 Role of micro nutrient in human diet off Home Science 1 0 20 20 

21.01.14 Value addition in millets off Home Science 1 2 16 18 

22.01.14 ICM in banana off Horticulture 1 10 0 10 

22.01.14 Importance of milking machine off Animal Science 1 16 4 20 

24.01.14 Value addition in tomato off Home Science 1 7 8 15 

29.01.14 
Introduction of turmeric boiler (steam 

based) 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 5 0 5 

30.01.14 Value added products from banana off Home Science 1 17 0 17 

21.01.14 Sheep and goat rearing  sp Animal Science 1 33 3 36 

28.01.14 ICM in groundnut sp Agronomy 1 17 9 26 



28.01.14 
Advantages of drip irrigation system 

in crop production 
sp 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 11 5 16 

29.01.14 Diagnosis of soil for crop production sp Soil Science 1 5 19 24 

30.01.14 
Role of mechanization in crop 

production 
sp 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 20 2 22 

31.01.14 Mushroom cultivation  sp Home Science 1 3 22 25 

31.01.14 Value added products from fruits sp 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 0 52 52 

19.02.14 Motorized earth augur on 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 0 10 

03.02.14 INM in tomato off Soil Science 1 10 2 12 

03.02.14 Value added products from tomato off Home Science 1 3 21 24 

10.02.14 
Integrated pest and disease 

management in banana 
off Horticulture 1 14 0 14 

12.02.14 Market led extension for tomato off Home Science 1 2 43 45 

25.02.14 ICM in Greengram off Agronomy 1 13 1 14 

25.02.14 
Introduction of turmeric harvester 

(TD) 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 5 0 5 

26.02.14 Importance of FMD vaccine off Animal Science 1 21 3 24 

04.02.14 Importance of bio fertilizer on pulses sp Agronomy 1 25 0 25 

04.02.14 

Livelihood option and micro 

entrepreneurs in watershed 

management programme 

sp Lab technician 1 43 6 49 

06.02.14 
Integrated Nutrient Management in 

vegetables 
sp Horticulture 1 27 0 27 

07.02.14 

Livelihood option and micro 

entrepreneurs in watershed 

management programme 

sp Lab technician 1 33 9 42 

17.02.14 Value added products from tomato sp Home Science 1 2 21 23 



20.02.14 Clean cotton picking sp Agronomy 1 5 18 23 

20.02.14 
Value added products from fruits and 

vegetables 
sp Home Science 1 2 23 25 

24.02.14 SRI in paddy sp Agronomy 1 13 0 13 

24.02.14 Importance of soil testing sp Soil Science 1 17 0 17 

25.02.14 

Livelihood option and micro 

entrepreneurs in watershed 

management programme 

sp Lab technician 1 38 3 41 

25.02.14 
Improved production technologies in 

horticultural crops 
sp Horticulture 1 26 1 27 

04.03.14 
Post harvest management for fruits 

and vegetables 
on Home Science 1 11 0 11 

26,27.03.14 Composting techniques on Soil Science 2 3 27 30 

27.03.14 Importance of mineral block on Animal Science 1 11 14 25 

27.03.14 Water management practices on 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 0 26 26 

28.03.14 ICM in tomato on Soil Science 1 9 13 22 

29.03.14 Importance of mixed fodder bank on Animal Science 1 16 14 30 

29.03.14 Value addition in tomato on Home Science 1 1 24 25 

29.03.14 
Group dynamics and farmers 

organization 
on Lab technician 1 10 17 27 

29.03.14 

Role of farm mechanization in rainfed 

cotton production (Seed village 

concept) 

on 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 4 18 22 

03.03.14 
Introduction of TD – turmeric 

harvester 
off 

Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 2 12 

05.03.14 Introduction of turmeric boiler off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 2 12 

19.03.14 Introduction of turmeric boiler off Agri 1 0 15 15 



Engineering 

24.03.14 
Drudgery reduction in tamarind 

processing 
off Lab technician 1 4 18 22 

28.03.14 Value added products from tomato off Home Science 1 10 13 23 

26.03.14 to 

29.03.14 
Integrated Farming System voc Agronomy 4 8 22 30 

27.03.14 to 

29.03.14 

Hi tech banana cultivation in IFS 

systems 
voc Horticulture 3 3 19 22 

04.03.14 
Precision farming in Horticultural 

crops 
sp Horticulture 1 13 0 13 

04.03.14 Importance of soil and water testing sp Soil Science 1 17 0 17 

07.03.14 to 

31.03.14 
Income generation through tailoring  sp Lab technician 21 0 26 26 

17.03.14 
Protection of Plant Varieties and 

Farmers Right Authority  
sp Horticulture 1 61 49 110 

24.03.14 & 

25.03.14 

Role of farm mechanization in rainfed 

cotton production 
sp 

Agri 

Engineering 
2 4 14 18 

 

April 2014 to March 2015 

 

Date Training title Type Discipline Duration Male Female Total 

16.04.14 
Role of farm mechanization in rainfed 
cotton production 

On 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 13 2 15 

16.04.14 
Preservation techniques in banana 
stem and flower 

On Home Science 1 0 25 25 

30.05.14 Value addition in millets On Home Science 
2 

1 18 19 

15.05.14 EDP training to farm women Off Home Science 
1 

0 20 20 

21.05.14 
Vegetable cultivation in terrace 
garden 

Off 
Horticulture 1 1 14 15 

27.05.14 
Integrated weed management in 
maize 

Off 
Agronomy 1 16 2 18 



27.05.14 EDP training to farm women 
Off 

Home Science 
1 

0 28 28 

29.05.14 
Importance of oral pellet vaccination 
in poultry 

Off 
Animal Science 1 15 5 20 

29.05.14 
Nutritional security and income 
generation through nutritional garden 

Off 
Home Science 1 0 68 68 

30.05.14 Importance of green fodder CO 31 
Off 

Animal Science 1 9 3 12 

30.05.14 
Introduction of motorized earth augur 
in banana 

Off Agri 
Engineering 

1 10 0 10 

30.05.14 Importance of soil testing 
Off 

Soil Science 1 9 3 12 

01.05.14 Income generation through  tailoring Sp Home Science 30 0 35 35 

10.06.14 
Scientist interface with extension 
functionaries 

On Soil Science 1 28 32 60 

05.06.14 
Rainwater harvesting through chisel 
plough in rainfed cotton production 

Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 13 2 15 

12.06.14 
Importance of seed treatment and 
role of bio fertilizer and cotton 
cultivation 

Off 
Agronomy 1 9 6 15 

25.06.14 EDP to rural women 
Off 

Home Science 1 4 10 14 

26.06.14 Importance of soil testing 
Off 

Soil Science 1 8 8 16 

26.06.14 Importance of safe drinking water 
Off 

Home Science 1 0 26 26 

27.06.14 Role of micro nutrients in daily diet 
Off 

Home Science 1 2 14 16 

05.06.14 
Rural agricultural work experience 
with KVK system 

Voc Horticulture 1 0 6 6 

18.06.14 
Recent technology in millet 
production 

Sp Agronomy 1 18 25 43 

01.05.14 Income generation through tailoring 
Sp 

Home Science 90 0 35 35 

20.06.14 
Value added products from fruits and 
vegetables 

Sp 
Home Science 1 0 23 23 

21.06.14 Terrace gardening techniques 
Sp 

Horticulture 1 0 16 16 

24.06.14 
Quality mulberry leaf production and 
scientific silk worm rearing 

Sp 
Agronomy 1 17 4 21 

04.07.14 Introduction of tractor drawn Off Agri 
1 

11 0 11 



turmeric planter Engineering 

10.07.14 
Quality vegetable production and 
marketing 

Off 
Horticulture 1 16 9 25 

16.07.14 
Improved agronomic practices in high 
yielding variety 

Off 
Agronomy 1 7 3 10 

24.07.14 Importance of green fodder CO 31 
Off 

Animal Science 1 11 2 13 

24.07.14 
Importance of shallow puddling in 
paddy production 

Off Agri 
Engineering 

1 9 0 9 

25.07.14 
Value added production from fruit 
and vegetables 

Off 
Home Science 1 1 17 18 

30.07.14 EDP to rural youth 
Off 

Home Science 1 0 20 20 

31.07.14 
Importance of bio fertilizer in rainfed 
cultivation 

Off 
Soil Science 1 14 7 21 

08.07.14 
Role of chisel plough in rainfed cotton 
production 

Sp 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 6 13 19 

12.08.14 
Integrated Nutrient Management in 
turmeric 

On Soil Science 1 15 5 20 

16.08.14 
Integrated Crop Management in 
Banana 

On Horticulture 1 18 2 20 

06.08.14 
Integrated Crop Management in 
Turmeric 

Off Horticulture 1 8 6 14 

07.08.14 Importance in oral pellet vaccine 
Off 

Animal Science 1 16 4 20 

12.08.14 EDP training to rural women 
Off 

Home Science 1 0 17 17 

20.08.14 
Importance of seed treatment with 
bio agents and bio fertilizer 

Off 
Agronomy 1 8 3 11 

26.08.14 
Introduction of motorized earth augur 
in banana 

Off Agri 
Engineering 

1 17 2 19 

30.08.14 
Introduction of chisel plough in 
cotton 

Off Agri 
Engineering 

1 10 0 10 

19.08.14 
Post harvest technology and value 
addition for tribal products 

Sp Home Science 2 4 16 20 

21.08.14 
Value added products from fruits and 
vegetables 

Sp Home Science 1 0 40 40 

26.08.14 Value addition in banana flower Sp Home Science 1 0 20 20 

22.09.14 
Value added products from banana 
flower and stem 

On Home Science 5 0 19 19 



24.09.14 Nematode management in banana On Horticulture 1 21 2 23 

26.09.14 Value addition in millets On Home Science 1 0 30 30 

02.09.14 
Introduction of chisel plough for 
rainfed cotton production 

Off Agri 
Engineering 

1 7 3 10 

15.09.14 EDP training to rural women 
Off 

Home Science 1 0 18 18 

16.09.14 
Importance of anthelmintic mineral 
block 

Off 
Animal Science 1 11 4 15 

11.09.14 Clean milk production Voc Animal Science 2 12 21 33 

24.09.14 
Production technologies of maize 
nutri seed pack. 

Voc Soil Science 1 0 12 12 

24.09.14 
Introduction of motorized banana 
fiber extraction 

Sp 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 4 14 18 

16.10.14 
Group dynamics and farmers 
organization 

On Home Science 1 0 18 18 

16.10.14 Importance of GRAND supplement 
On 

Animal Science 1 8 12 20 

16.10.14 
Soil nutrient management for pest 
and diseases in banana 

On 
Soil Science 1 20 0 20 

17.10.14 Importance of GRAND supplement 
On 

Animal Science 1 27 3 30 

04.10.14 
Introduction of motorized earth augur 
in banana 

Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 10 0 10 

08.10.14 EDP training to rural women 
Off 

Home Science 1 0 18 18 

20.10.14 Value addition in turmeric 
Off 

Home Science 1 0 30 30 

20.10.14 
Importance of bio fertilizers in banana 
cultivation 

Off 
Soil Science 1 12 0 12 

28.10.14 ICM in tuberose 
Off 

Horticulture 1 8 3 11 

29.10.14 
Importance of seed treatment in 
bengalgram 

Off 
Agronomy 1 10 2 12 

30.10.14 Value addition in millets 
Off 

Home Science 1 1 27 28 

03.11.14 VAM  production and coir composting On Soil Science 1 16 4 20 

12.11.14 Farmers oriented interpreted 
Agricultural extension system for 

On Horticulture 1 31 6 37 



AAO’s 

14 & 
15.11.14 

Mushroom cultivation 
On 

Agronomy 2 3 35 38 

18.11.14 Importance of secondary agriculture 
On 

Home Science 1 0 37 37 

19.11.14 Value added products from tomato 
On 

Home Science 1 11 15 26 

25.11.14 Ethno veterinary medicine FMD 
On 

Animal Science 1 14 36 50 

27.11.14 Value addition in millets 
On 

Home Science 1 2 34 36 

28.11.14 
Stall fed goat farming and CO 31 
green fodder 

On 
Animal Science 1 23 32 55 

28.11.14 Mechanization in cotton production 
On Agri 

Engineering 
1 16 24 40 

05.11.14 EDP training to rural women Off Home Science 1 0 39 39 

10.11.14 Weed management in cotton 
Off 

Agronomy 1 11 12 23 

11.11.14 Mechanization in cotton production 
Off Agri 

Engineering 
1 12 5 17 

13.11.14 
Mechanization in groundnut 
production 

Off Agri 
Engineering 

1 19 0 19 

18.11.14 Value added products from banana 
Off 

Home Science 1 0 11 11 

19.11.14 Clean milk production 
Off 

Animal Science 1 2 21 23 

21.11.14 
Group dynamics and farmers 
organization 

Off 
Home Science 1 6 9 15 

25.11.14 
Importance of soil testing and soil 
fertility management 

Off 
Soil Science 1 26 20 46 

25.11.14 
Proper care and maintenance of  
micro irrigation system 

Off Agri 
Engineering 

1 17 23 40 

25.11.14 Value added products from banana 
Off 

Home Science 1 0 51 51 

26.11.14 Ethno veterinary medicine – FMD 
Off 

Animal Science 1 28 3 31 

26.11.14 
Importance of soil testing and soil 
fertility management 

Off 
Soil Science 1 11 26 37 

26.11.14 Power weeder in banana 
Off Agri 

Engineering 
1 50 0 50 



26.11.14 
Group dynamics and farmers 
organization 

Off 
Home Science 1 16 22 38 

27.11.14 
Importance of soil testing and soil 
fertility management 

Off 
Soil Science 1 32 5 37 

28.11.14 
Importance of soil testing and soil 
fertility management 

Off 
Soil Science 1 18 25 43 

28.11.14 
Value addition in banana stem and 
flower 

Off 
Home Science 1 0 32 32 

12.11.14 
Soil and water conservation for better 
crop production 

Sp Soil Science 1 5 46 51 

26.11.14 
Perimetro – Quality vegetable 
production and  marketing and FPO 
formation 

Sp Home Science 1 50 5 55 

24.12.14 Role of dairy  unit in IFS field On Animal Science 1 43 7 50 

02.12.14 
Integrated weed management in 
banana 

Off 
Horticulture 1 11 0 11 

16.12.14 
Proper maintenance of micro 
irrigation system 

Off Agri 
Engineering 

1 17 3 20 

16.12.14 
Group dynamic and farmers 
organization 

Off 
Home Science 1 13 17 30 

17.12.14 
Proper maintenance of micro 
irrigation system 

Off Agri 
Engineering 

1 19 1 20 

18.12.14 Importance of turmeric in diet 
Off 

Home Science 1 0 26 26 

19.12.14 Weed management in bengalgram 
Off 

Agronomy 1 9 17 26 

19.12.14 Hi tech horticulture 
Off 

Horticulture 1 10 0 10 

23.12.14 ICM in tuberose 
Off 

Horticulture 1 11 0 11 

23.12.14 Introduction of hi tech sprayer 
Off Agri 

Engineering 
1 20 0 20 

24.12.14 Plant protection measures in cotton 
Off 

Agronomy 1 3 20 23 

24.12.14 
Economic empowerment of women 
through  group formation 

Off 
Home Science 1 0 31 31 

26.12.14 ICM in turmeric 
Off 

Soil Science 1 17 13 30 

09.12.14 
Perimetro quality vegetable 
production marketing programme 
and FPO formation 

On Horticulture 1 47 1 48 



10.12.14 
Perimetro quality vegetable 
production marketing programme 
and FPO formation 

Sp Horticulture 1 39 0 39 

11.12.14 
Perimetro quality vegetable 
production marketing programme 
and FPO formation 

Sp 
Horticulture 1 48 0 48 

16.12.14 
Perimetro quality vegetable 
production marketing programme 
and FPO formation 

Sp 
Horticulture 1 38 0 38 

17.12.14 
Perimetro quality vegetable 
production marketing programme 
and FPO formation 

Sp 
Horticulture 1 37 0 37 

18.12.14 
Perimetro quality vegetable 
production marketing programme 
and FPO formation 

Sp 
Horticulture 1 62 0 62 

22.12.14 
Perimetro quality vegetable 
production marketing programme 
and FPO formation 

Sp 
Horticulture 1 49 0 49 

26.12.14 
Moisture conservation technologies 
in rainfed area 

Sp 
Agronomy 1 12 23 35 

30.12.14 
Perimetro quality vegetable 
production marketing programme 
and FPO formation 

Sp 
Horticulture 1 47 4 51 

30.12.14 
Importance of bio fertilizer in rainfed 
agriculture 

Sp 
Soil Science 1 26 13 39 

31.12.14 
Perimetro quality vegetable 
production marketing programme 
and FPO formation 

Sp 
Horticulture 1 60 0 60 

12.01.15 Preparation of organic manure On Soil Science 1 25 10 35 

09.01.15 
Mechanization in groundnut 
production 

Off 
Agri 

Engineering 
1 20 0 20 

12.01.15 
Integrated Disease management in 
banana 

Off 
Horticulture 1 13 2 15 

13.01.15 
Mechanization in groundnut 
production 

Off Agri 
Engineering 

1 17 0 17 

20.01.15 Commercial rearing of livestock 
Off 

Animal Science 1 102 35 137 

28.01.15 Role of micro nutrients in human diet 
Off 

Home Science 1 0 26 26 

29.01.15 IPDM in tuberose 
Off 

Horticulture 1 10 0 10 



29.01.15 
Value added products from fruits and 
vegetables 

Off 
Home Science 1 14 5 19 

30.01.15 ICM in brinjal 
Off 

Soil Science 1 9 6 15 

21.01.15 to 
23.01.15 

Integrated Farming system Sp Agronomy 3 24 0 24 

22.01.15 Role and functions of KVK Sp Soil Science 1 21 6 27 

30.01.15 Milch animal management Sp Animal Science 1 12 0 12 

06.02.15 
Women empowerment through Agri 
Business School 

On Home Science 1 0 16 16 

10,11.02.15 Mushroom cultivation practices 
On 

Agronomy 2 17 4 21 

13.02.15 
Entrepreneur development of farm 
women 

On 
Home Science 1 0 28 28 

05.02.15 Importance of mineral mixture 
Off 

Animal Science 1 12 0 12 

19.02.15 
Importance of value addition and 
food processing 

Off 
Home Science 1 1 19 20 

25.02.15 
SRI power weeder in paddy 
production 

Off Agri 
Engineering 

1 14 0 14 

26.02.15 
Banana fiber extraction through 
machine 

Off Agri 
Engineering 

1 4 18 22 

04.02.15 EDP to rural women Sp Home Science 1 0 13 13 

12.02.15 
Perimetro – Group distribution for 
FPO formation. 

Sp 
Horticulture 1 85 0 85 

16.02.15 Value addition in millets 
Sp 

Home Science 1 0 19 19 

19.02.15 Vermi compost and production 
Sp 

Soil Science 1 0 20 20 

20.02.15 Value added products from millets 
Sp 

Home Science 1 1 14 15 

20.02.15 Vermi compost and production 
Sp 

Soil Science 1 0 20 20 

21.02.15 
Improved cut flower production 
technologies 

Sp 
Horticulture 1 1 14 15 

25.02.15 Value addition in banana 
Sp 

Home Science 1 0 27 27 

24.03.15 
Women empowerment through Agri 
business school 

On Home Science 1 45 0 45 



31.03.15 
Value addition in fruits and 
vegetables 

On Home Science 1 0 20 20 

03.03.15 Different composting technology Off Soil Science 1 2 14 16 

03.03.15 Role of micro nutrients in human diet 
Off 

Home Science 1 0 79 79 

13.03.15 Importance of mixed green fodder 
Off 

Animal Science 1 7 4 11 

18.03.15 Hybrid maize cultivation technologies 
Off 

Agronomy 1 18 2 20 

18.03.15 EDP training to rural youth 
Off 

Home Science 1 7 12 19 

19.03.15 Stall fed goatry 
Off 

Animal Science 1 9 3 12 

25.03.15 Introduction of TD turmeric harvester 
Off Agri 

Engineering 
1 8 2 10 

31.03.15 Importance of maize nutri seed bag 
Off 

Soil Science 1 4 8 12 

06.03.15 
Perimetro – Group discussion for FPO 
formation 

Sp Horticulture 1 10 1 11 

17.03.15 
Hi- Tech horticulture production 
technology 

Sp Horticulture 1 23 0 23 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



April 2015 to March 2016 

Month Training Title Duration 
Training 

For 
Thematic Area 

Trg. 
Loction 

Male Female Total 

April 

Introduction of 
improved turmeric 
boiler (steam 
based) 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
9 10 19 

April 
Introduction of TD 
groundnut 
harvestor 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
13 4 17 

April 

Integrated pest and 
disease 
management in 
banana 

1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
11 0 11 

April 

Income generation 
activities through 
value addition 
(Turmeric) 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

3 10 13 

April 
Role of importance 
of organic manure 
in crop production 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
13 3 16 

April 
Importance of 
green fodder 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

12 3 15 

April 
Perimetro group 
discussion for FPO 
formation 

1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

Off 
Campus 

15 3 18 

May 
EDP training to 
rural women 

5 Vocational 
Income 

generation 
activities 

On Campus 3 11 14 

May 

Capacity building 
and group 
dynamics through 
SHGs. 

1 General 
Capacity 

Building and 
Group Dynamics 

Off 
Campus 

1 20 21 

May 
Importance of 
green fodder 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

21 0 21 

May 
ICM in mulberry 
cultivation 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
12 0 12 

May ICM in banana 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
11 0 11 

May 
Importance of soil 
and water testing 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

0 20 20 

May 

Care and 
maintenance of 
drip irrigation 
system 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
14 0 14 



May 
Advantage of drip 
irrigation system in 
crop production 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
18 0 18 

June 
EDP training to 
farm women 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On Campus 0 12 12 

June 
EDP training to 
farm women 

1 
Rural 
Youth 

Small scale 
processing 

On Campus 0 15 15 

June 
Soil fertility 
management 

1 
Rural 
Youth 

Production of 
organic inputs 

On Campus 10 5 15 

June ICM in tomato 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
13 3 16 

June 
Importance of Co 5 
fodder production 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

7 7 14 

June 
Importance of 
green fodder Co 5 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

0 13 13 

June 

Weed management 
and Integrated 
Nutrient 
Management in 
Maize 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
16 3 19 

July 
Value added 
products from 
millets 

2 
Rural 
Youth 

Small scale 
processing 

On Campus 2 14 16 

July 
Importance of 
nutrition garden 

1 
Extension 
Personnel 

Low cost and 
nutrient 

efficient diet 
designing 

Off 
Campus 

1 14 15 

July 
Hybrid maize 
production 
technology 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
8 1 9 

July 
Importance of soil 
and water testing 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

8 6 14 

July 
Importance of Co 
31 green fodder 
sorghum 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

11 1 12 

July 
FPO formation for 
quality vegetable 
production 

1 General 
Capacity 

Building and 
Group Dynamics 

Off 
Campus 

8 2 10 

August 
Millets based 
product 
preparation 

2 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On Campus 3 11 14 

August 
Terrace garden for 
quality vegetable 
production 

2 General Horticulture On Campus 1 13 14 



August 

Integrated Farming 
system for 
sustainable 
agriculture 

1 General Crop Production On Campus 0 14 14 

August 
Entrepreneurial 
development of 
rural youth 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 15 15 

August 

Empowerment of 
farmers/farm 
women through 
joint liability groups 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

8 10 18 

August 
Advantages of 
HDPS in cotton 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
4 4 8 

September 
Value addition in 
banana flower and 
stem 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On Campus 2 8 10 

September 
Value addition in 
fruits and 
vegetables 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 16 16 

September INM in curry leaf 1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

2 12 14 

September 
Value addition in 
millet 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 16 16 

September 
Milch animal 
management 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

16 3 19 

September 

Maintenance of 
mulberry garden 
for quality leaf 
production 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
6 1 7 

October 
Importance of 
mineral mixture 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

On Campus 17 1 18 

October 
TD groundnut 
harvester 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
7 5 12 

October 
Power weeder in 
cotton 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
10 1 11 

October 
Role of micro 
nutrient in human 
diet 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 11 11 

October 

Empowering of 
farmers / farm 
women through 
FPO formation 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 18 18 

October 
Weed management 
in rainfed cotton 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
5 4 9 



October 
Soil sampling 
testing and 
interpretation 

10 Vocational 
Crop production 

and 
management 

On Campus 13 9 22 

November 
Importance of 
green fodder 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

On Campus 17 8 25 

November 

Value added 
products from 
fruits and 
vegetables 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On Campus 0 10 10 

November 
EDP training â€“ 
Areca plate making 

10 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On Campus 13 13 26 

November 
EDP training 
through group 
approach 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 13 13 

November 
Importance of soil 
testing 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

12 13 25 

November 
Importance of soil 
testing 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

14 11 25 

November 
Importance of soil 
testing 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

18 7 25 

November 

Quality vegetable 
production and 
marketing 
programme 

1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
12 0 12 

November 
Importance of soil 
testing 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

21 4 25 

November 
Maintenance of 
drip irrigation 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
19 8 27 

November 
Importance of soil 
testing 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

25 12 37 

November 
Importance of safe 
drinking water 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

2 17 19 

November 
Power weeder in 
banana 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
12 4 16 

November 
INM in vegetable 
cowpea 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

4 13 17 

November 
Importance of soil 
testing 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

28 4 32 



November 
Importance of seed 
treatment in 
bengalgram 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
6 3 9 

November ICM in banana 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
10 0 10 

December 
Role of micro 
nutrients in human 
diet 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On Campus 4 8 12 

December 
Integrated pest 
management in 
cotton 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
19 22 41 

December ICM in brinjal 1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

11 9 20 

December 
Poultry vaccination 
practices 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

11 9 20 

December 
Manually operated 
groundnut 
decorticator 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
0 15 15 

December 
Safety storage 
methods 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

2 14 16 

December 
Millets production 
technology 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
16 4 20 

December 
Disease 
management in 
sheep and goat 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

16 9 25 

December 
Value added 
products from 
millets 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 20 20 

December 
Power weeder in 
rainfed cotton 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
12 3 15 

December 

Integrated 
Horticulture 
development with 
special reference to 
organic / 
ecofriendly farming 

1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

On Campus 50 0 50 

December 

Integrated 
Horticulture 
development with 
special reference to 
organic / 
ecofriendly farming 

1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

On Campus 32 18 50 

December 

Integrated 
Horticulture 
development with 
special reference to 

1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

On Campus 31 19 50 



organic / 
ecofriendly farming 

December 
Poultry vaccination 
practices 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

3 16 19 

December 

Food quality 
upgradation 
through improved 
agricultural 
practices 

1 
Extension 
Personnel 

Production and 
use of organic 

inputs 
On Campus 13 8 21 

January Vermi composting 2 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

On Campus 0 12 12 

January 

Empowerment of 
women through 
agri business 
school 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On Campus 5 14 19 

January 
Value addition in 
millet 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On Campus 4 16 20 

January 
Proper care and 
maintenance of 
drip irrigation 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
18 0 18 

January ICM in snake gourd 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
20 0 20 

January 
Safety storage 
methods 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 27 27 

January 
Importance of 
grand supplement 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

24 1 25 

January IPDM in tomato 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
9 21 30 

January 
Ethno veterinary 
medicine 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

25 0 25 

January ICM in bhendi 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
18 2 20 

January 
Empowerment of 
farmers / rural 
youth through JLGs 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

8 17 25 

January 
Advantages if micro 
irrigation 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
17 1 18 

January 

Integrated 
Horticulture 
development with 
special reference to 
organic / 

1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

On Campus 34 16 50 



ecofriendly farming 

January 

Integrated 
Horticulture 
development with 
special reference to 
organic / 
ecofriendly farming 

1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

On Campus 50 0 50 

January 

Integrated 
Horticulture 
development with 
special reference to 
organic / 
ecofriendly farming 

1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

On Campus 5 45 50 

January ICM in millets 1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

Off 
Campus 

28 14 42 

January 
Farm waste 
management 

1 Sponsored 
Soil health and 

fertility 
management 

Off 
Campus 

30 9 39 

February 

Empowerment of 
farmers / farm 
women through 
FPO formation 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On Campus 33 13 46 

February 

Empowerment of 
women through 
agri business 
school 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On Campus 0 30 30 

February 

Entrepreneur 
development 
programme to 
urban women 

2 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On Campus 4 28 32 

February 
Value addition in 
vegetables 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On Campus 1 27 28 

February ICM in groundnut 1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
24 0 24 

February 
Advantage of the hi 
tech sprayer 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
14 6 20 

February 
Different 
composting 
techniques 

1 
Rural 
Youth 

Vermi-culture On Campus 0 18 18 

February 

Empowerment of 
women through 
group dynamics 
approach 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 20 20 

February 
TD harvester in 
turmeric 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
11 0 11 



February Back yard poultry 1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

0 20 20 

February 
Integrated pest 
management in 
vegetable crops 

3 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

On Campus 20 2 22 

February 
Marketing 
strategies of 
vegetables 

1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

On Campus 10 4 14 

February 
Millets production 
technology 

1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

On Campus 16 4 20 

February 
Mushroom 
production 
technology 

1 
Rural 
Youth 

Mushroom 
Production 

On Campus 0 20 20 

March 
All crop residue 
management 

1 General Crop Production On Campus 16 2 18 

March 
Value addition in 
millets 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On Campus 1 33 34 

March 
Grading and 
standardization of 
vegetables 

1 General Horticulture On Campus 8 3 11 

March 
Importance of soil 
testing 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

30 0 30 

March 
Advantages of drip 
irrigation 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
8 2 10 

Total 
 

144 -- -- -- 1258 1093 2351 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



April 2016 to March 2017 

Month Training Title 
Duration 

(Days) 
Training 

For 
Thematic Area 

Trg. 
Location 

Total 
Male 

Total 
Female 

Total 

April 

Entrepreneur 
development of 
women through 
ABS 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 12 12 

May 
Importance of soil 
and water testing 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

14 2 16 

May 
Role of 
micronutrients in 
human diet 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 14 14 

May ICM in bittergourd 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
9 1 10 

May 

Nutritional security 
and income 
generation through 
backyard poultry 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

12 0 12 

May 
Value addition in 
millets 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 11 11 

May 
Advantages of 
chisel plough 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
8 2 10 

May 
Seed treatment and 
sowing method in 
pulses 

1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

Off 
Campus 

18 4 22 

May 
Importance of 
green fodder 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

15 4 19 

May 

Nutritional security 
and income 
generation through 
nutritional garden 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 40 40 

June 
Scientific rearing of 
sheep and goat 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

29 11 40 

June 
Importance of 
animal mineral 
block 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

5 10 15 

June 
Role of bio fertilizer 
in bittergourd 
cultivation 

1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
11 4 15 

June 
Role of bio fertilizer 
in vegetable 
cultivation 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

12 5 17 

June 
Importance of 
nutrition garden 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

7 11 18 



June 
Value addition in 
millets 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 10 10 

June 

Nutritional security 
and income 
generation through 
nutrition garden 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 26 26 

June Farm mechanization 1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
On 

Campus 
60 0 60 

June 
Advantages of 
chisel plough 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
10 0 10 

June 
Eco friendly 
agriculture towards 
sustainability 

1 General Crop Production 
On 

Campus 
60 0 60 

July 
Integrated Farming 
system 

1 
Extension 
Personnel 

Productivity 
enhancement in 

field crops 

On 
Campus 

0 43 43 

July 
Integrated Farming 
system 

1 
Extension 
Personnel 

Productivity 
enhancement in 

field crops 

On 
Campus 

0 48 48 

July 
Mushroom 
cultivation 

1 
Rural 
Youth 

Mushroom 
Production 

On 
Campus 

7 20 27 

July 
Care and 
maintenance of drip 
irrigation 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
21 1 22 

July 
Composting of 
animal waste 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

2 10 12 

July ICM in banana 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
13 4 17 

July 
Value addition in 
chillies 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

8 8 16 

July 
Dairy and goat 
farming 

1 Sponsored 
Livestock 

production and 
management 

On 
Campus 

0 47 47 

July 
Dairy and goat 
farming 

1 Sponsored 
Livestock 

production and 
management 

On 
Campus 

0 44 44 

July 
Value addition in 
millets 

1 Sponsored Home Science 
On 

Campus 
8 20 28 

July 
Dairy and goat 
farming 

1 Sponsored 
Livestock 

production and 
management 

On 
Campus 

0 45 45 

August 

Importance of seed 
quality treatment 
and cultivation 
practices of oilseeds 
and millets 

2 
Extension 
Personnel 

Productivity 
enhancement in 

field crops 

On 
Campus 

0 51 51 



August 
IFS for sustainable 
agriculture 

2 
Extension 
Personnel 

Productivity 
enhancement in 

field crops 

On 
Campus 

0 42 42 

August Farm mechanization 1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
12 0 12 

August 
Importance of oral 
pellet vaccination 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

5 22 27 

August 
EDP training to rural 
women 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 25 25 

August 
Importance of 
green fodder 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

14 1 15 

August 
Value addition in 
millets 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 12 12 

August 
Importance of 
green fodder 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

7 23 30 

August 

Nutritional security 
and income 
generating through 
backyard poultry 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

4 8 12 

August 
Backyard poultry 
techniques 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

9 6 15 

August 
Value added 
products from fruit 
and vegetables 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 
Campus 

3 9 12 

August 

Role and 
importance of bio 
fertilizer and bio 
agents in vegetable 
cultivation 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

5 10 15 

August 
Production of low 
volume and high 
volume crops 

21 
Extension 
Personnel 

Productivity 
enhancement in 

field crops 

On 
Campus 

3 3 6 

September 
Soil fertility 
management 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

On 
Campus 

6 13 19 

September 
Soil fertility 
management 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

On 
Campus 

62 0 62 

September 
Role and function of 
KVK 

1 General 
Capacity Building 

and Group 
Dynamics 

On 
Campus 

37 21 58 



September 

Advantages of 
chisel plough in 
rainfed agriculture 
production 

1 
Rural 
Youth 

Repair and 
maintenance of 
farm machinery 
and implements 

On 
Campus 

23 0 23 

September 
Importance and 
method of seed 
treatment in pulses 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
9 3 12 

September 
Advantages of hi 
tech sprayer in 
paddy production 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
20 3 23 

September 
Value added 
products from fruits 
and vegetables 

1 Vocational 
Post harvest 

technology and 
value addition 

On 
Campus 

3 7 10 

September Vermi composting 1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

4 14 18 

September 
Role of micro 
nutrients in human 
diet 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

59 3 62 

September 
EDP hiring to rural 
women 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 16 16 

September 
Advantages of 
micro irrigation 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
12 0 12 

October 
Clean milk 
production 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

On 
Campus 

23 0 23 

October 

Women 
empowerment 
through Agri 
Business School 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 
Campus 

1 15 16 

October 
EDP training 
through Agri 
Business School 

2 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 
Campus 

1 22 23 

October Vermi composting 5 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

On 
Campus 

1 12 13 

October 
Clean milk 
production 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

12 0 12 

October 
Value addition in 
fruits and 
vegetables 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

5 17 22 

October 
Advantages of 
raingun 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
19 1 20 

October 
EDP training 
through Agri 
Business School 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 12 12 

October ICM in banana 1 General Horticulture Off 22 0 22 



Campus 

October 
TD seed drill in 
groundnut 
production 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
16 0 16 

October 
Importance and 
method of seed 
treatment 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
9 2 11 

October 

Nutritional security 
and income 
generating through 
backyard poultry 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

5 5 10 

October 
Nutrient 
management in 
groundnut 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
22 2 24 

October 
Soil fertility 
management 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

19 11 30 

November 

Role of KVK for 
Rejuvenative 
agriculture, value 
addition and 
marketing 

1 
Extension 
Personnel 

Rejuvenation of 
old orchards 

On 
Campus 

10 2 12 

November 
Market outlet for 
secondary 
agriculture 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 
Campus 

3 12 15 

November 
Importance of safe 
drinking water 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 16 16 

November 
TD seed drill in 
rainfed bengalgram 
production 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
7 5 12 

November 
ICM in high yielding 
vegetable 
cultivation 

1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
32 8 40 

November 
Role of 
micronutrients in 
human diet 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

3 13 16 

November 
Correct cooking 
methods 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 15 15 

November 

Importance and 
method of seed 
treatment in 
bengalgram 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
6 4 10 

November Vermi composting 1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

24 4 28 

November 
Advantages of 
tamarind de seeder 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
4 9 13 



November 
Value added 
products from fruits 
and vegetables 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

4 8 12 

November 
Advantages of TD 
groundnut 
harvester 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
18 3 21 

November 
Demonstrating 
milking machine 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

11 0 11 

November 
Storage techniques 
for agricultural 
commodities 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

32 8 40 

November 
ICM in high yielding 
vegetable 
cultivation 

1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
24 16 40 

November 
ICM in high yielding 
vegetable 
cultivation 

1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
37 3 40 

November ICM in millets 1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

32 8 40 

November ICM in millets 1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

40 0 40 

November ICM in millets 1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

30 10 40 

November 
ICM in groundnut 
and Gingelly 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
33 7 40 

November ICM in pulses 1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
33 7 40 

December 
Value addition in 
banana 

3 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 
Campus 

7 8 15 

December 

Entrepreneur 
development 
through agri 
business 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 15 15 

December 
Advantages 
improved steam 
boiler in turmeric 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
16 0 16 

December ICM in pulses 1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

Off 
Campus 

38 2 40 

December 
ICM in hybrid 
vegetable 
cultivation 

1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

Off 
Campus 

36 4 40 

December ICM in pulses 1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
Off 

Campus 
35 5 40 



management 

December 
Safety storage 
methods 

1 Sponsored Home Science 
Off 

Campus 
28 11 39 

December ICM in paddy 1 Sponsored 
Crop production 

and 
management 

Off 
Campus 

34 6 40 

December 
Value added 
products from 
millets 

1 Sponsored Home Science 
On 

Campus 
3 18 21 

December 
Integrated Nutrient 
management 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

15 0 15 

January 
Sustainable 
agriculture 
development 

1 
Extension 
Personnel 

Productivity 
enhancement in 

field crops 

On 
Campus 

15 6 21 

January 
ICN in onion 
cultivation 

1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
13 4 17 

January 
Group enterprise 
and farmers 
organization 

1 General 
Capacity Building 

and Group 
Dynamics 

Off 
Campus 

2 12 14 

January 
Foliar application of 
nutrient in millet 

1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
13 3 16 

January 
Advantages of TD 
sorghum harvestor 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
17 3 20 

January ICM in cauliflower 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
9 3 12 

January 
Value addition in 
pulses 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

2 23 25 

January 
Quality vegetable 
production 

1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
7 8 15 

January 
Advantages of 
tamarind deseeder 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
4 12 16 

February 
Soil fertility 
management 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

On 
Campus 

28 11 39 

February 
Advantages of 
motorized tamarind 
deseeder 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
On 

Campus 
1 12 13 

February 

Role of primary and 
secondary tillage 
equipment in crop 
production 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
On 

Campus 
43 2 45 

February 

Soil fertility 
management 
through balanced 
fertilization 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

On 
Campus 

68 20 88 



February 

Women 
empowerment 
through agri 
business school 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

1 16 17 

February 
Quality vegetable 
production 

1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
9 0 9 

February 
Importance of 
mineral mixture 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

12 18 30 

February 
Soil fertility 
management 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

22 16 38 

February ICM in Cauliflower 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
7 3 10 

February 
Sustainable 
agricultural 
development 

1 
Extension 
Personnel 

Productivity 
enhancement in 

field crops 

Off 
Campus 

15 10 25 

February 
Value added 
products from 
chillies 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 12 12 

February ICM in groundnut 1 General Crop Production 
Off 

Campus 
42 5 47 

February ICM in Onion 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
5 5 10 

February 

Post harvest 
management of 
fruits and 
vegetables 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

25 3 28 

February 
Role of micro 
irrigation system in 
crop production 

1 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
38 0 38 

February 

Empowerment of 
farmers and farm 
women through 
group activities 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

8 9 17 

February 

Empowerment of 
farmers and farm 
women through 
group activities 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 15 15 

February 
Milch animal 
management 

1 Sponsored 
Livestock and 

fisheries 
On 

Campus 
35 5 40 

February 
Importance of value 
addition 

1 Sponsored 
Post harvest 

technology and 
value addition 

On 
Campus 

1 89 90 

March 
Sheep and goat 
rearing 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

12 20 32 

March 
Importance of 
vaccination 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Off 

Campus 
15 6 21 



Management 

March 
Clean milk 
production 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

10 8 18 

March 
Clean milk 
production 

1 General 
Livestock 

Production and 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

21 8 29 

March 
Soil fertility 
management 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

18 18 36 

March 
Soil fertility 
management 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

1 25 26 

March 
Soil fertility 
management 

1 General 
Soil Health and 

Fertility 
Management 

Off 
Campus 

19 19 38 

March 

Soil Health 
management and 
sustainable 
agriculture 

1 
Extension 
Personnel 

Integrated 
Nutrient 

management 

On 
Campus 

17 14 31 

March ICM in banana 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
11 0 11 

March ICM in vegetables 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
29 13 42 

March ICM in vegetables 1 General Horticulture 
On 

Campus 
38 16 54 

March ICM in vegetables 1 General Horticulture 
On 

Campus 
49 21 70 

March ICM in vegetables 1 General Horticulture 
Off 

Campus 
28 15 43 

March 
Maintenance of drip 
irrigation 

2 General 
Agril. 

Engineering 
Off 

Campus 
20 5 25 

March 
Entrepreneur 
development 
through ABS 

1 
Rural 
Youth 

Small scale 
processing 

On 
Campus 

0 22 22 

March 
Value addition of 
agri products and 
marketing 

1 
Rural 
Youth 

Value addition 
Off 

Campus 
0 22 22 

March 
Value addition of 
agri products and 
marketing 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 24 24 

March 
Income generation 
through group 
dynamics 

2 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 17 17 

March 
Income generation 
through group 
dynamics 

1 General 
Home 

Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 
Campus 

0 20 20 

Total   178 
   

2106 1693 3799 



April 2017 to March 2018  

Date Training title 
Dura 
tion 

Type Thematic area Location Male Female Total 

04.04.17 Women in agriculture 1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 3 15 18 

15.04.17 Importance of soil testing 1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 2 10 12 

16.04.17 
and 

17.04.17 

Innovative agriculture 
technology and IFS 

2 PF Crop Production On 38 2 40 

28.04.17 Value addition in milk 1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 16 16 

01.05.17 
to 

05.05.17 

Sustainable agriculture 
development 

2 RY Crop Production On 60 0 60 

09.05.17 
Entrepreneur 
development programme 
to farm women 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 4 21 25 

15.05.17 
Entrepreneur 
development programme 
to farm women 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 5 20 25 

23.05.17 
Importance of soil and 
water testing 

1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 8 4 12 

25.05.17 Farm mechanization 1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 10 2 12 

31.05.17 
Integrated Crop 
Management in 
Kuthiravali 

1 PF 
Crop production 
and 
management 

Off 8 4 12 

15.06.17 EDP to rural women 1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 16 0 16 

16.06.17 
Value added products 
from fruits and vegetables 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 14 3 17 

20.06.17 
Value addition of agri 
products 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 7 15 22 

23.06.17 
Importance of summer 
ploughing 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 7 5 12 

28.06.17 
Proper care and 
maintenance of drip 
irrigation 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 16 0 16 

05.07.17 
Sustainable agriculture 
and allied enterprises 

1 RY Crop Production On 0 6 6 



11.07.17 
Role of rotary over head 
raingun irrigation for 
higher production 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 10 1 11 

14.07.17 
Role of farm 
mechanization in rainfed 
groundnut production 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 12 2 14 

19.07.17 
Value added products 
from Moringa 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 2 13 15 

20.07.17 
Importance of Soil 
sampling 

1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 9 5 14 

21.07.17 
Importance of Soil 
sampling 

1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 13 0 13 

26.07.17 
Integrated Farming 
System for sustainable 
agriculture 

1 PF Crop Production On 18 0 18 

26.07.17 
Importance of nutrition 
garden 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 14 14 

27.07.17 
Supplementation of yeast 
culture in dairy cows 

1 PF 
Livestock 
Production and 
Management 

Off 4 7 11 

01.08.17 
Role of chisel plough in 
rainwater harvesting 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 19 0 19 

04.08.17 
Farm mechanization in 
rainfed groundnut 
production and profit 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 21 2 23 

07.08.17 
Packing and labeling of 
value added products 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 0 22 22 

08.08.17 
Role of chisel plough in 
rainwater harvesting 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 11 3 14 

09.08.17 
to 

13.11.17 

Sustainable and profitable 
agriculture 

5 RY Crop Production On 6 0 6 

18.08.17 Soil fertility management 1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 2 12 14 

18.08.17 

Popularization of 
Progesterone sponge for 
managing reproductive 
future in dairy cattle. 

1 PF 
Livestock 
Production and 
Management 

Off 7 3 10 

20.08.17 
Composting technology 
for farm waste 

1 RY 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 2 12 14 

22.08.17 
Group dynamics and 
farmers organization 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 27 27 



23.08.17 
Integrated rhizome rot 
management in turmeric 

1 PF Horticulture Off 17 10 27 

01.09.17 
TD seed drill in rainfed 
groundnut production 
and profit 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 11 1 12 

11.09.17 
to 

21.09.17 

Soil fertility management 
for sustainable agriculture 

10 RY 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

On 5 0 5 

12.09.17 
ICM in F1 hybrid 
vegetable cultivation 

1 PF Horticulture Off 15 8 23 

13.09.17 
TD seed drill in rainfed 
groundnut production 
and profit 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 5 6 11 

14.09.17 
EDP training to rural 
women 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 17 17 

14.09.17 
Soil test based fertilizer 
recommendation for field 
crops 

1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 74 26 100 

15.09.17 
Soil fertility management 
for sustainable agriculture 

1 RY 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 3 7 10 

15.09.17 
Value added products 
from Morina 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 6 9 15 

19.09.17 

Seed treatment with bio 
agents for enhancing 
productivity in snake 
gourd 

1 PF Horticulture Off 7 6 13 

20.09.17 
Importance of green 
fodder Co 31 

1 PF 
Livestock 
Production and 
Management 

Off 10 0 10 

21.09.17 Role of KVK and IFS 1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

On 11 1 12 

22.09.17 
Bio fertilizer application in 
coconut 

1 PF Horticulture Off 11 8 19 

26.09.17 
Role of  Pseudomonas in 
rhizome rot management 
in turmeric 

1 PF Horticulture Off 9 10 19 

26.09.17 EDP to rural women 1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 14 14 

27.09.17 
Importance of seed 
treatment in Bengalgram 

1 PF Crop Production Off 24 7 31 

05.10.17 
Motorized de seeder for 
Tamarind 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

On 3 7 10 

05.10.17 
Value added products 
from fruits and vegetables 

1 RY 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 112 112 



07.10.17 
Role of VAM in coconut 
cultivation 

1 PF Horticulture Off 18 8 26 

09.10.17 
Women empowerment 
through Agri Business 
School 

1 RY 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 0 8 8 

13.10.17 
Role of VAM application 
in Turmeric cultivation 

1 PF Horticulture Off 9 5 14 

13.10.17 INM in Jasmine 1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 0 14 14 

20.10.17 
Weed management in 
Bengalgram 

1 PF Crop Production Off 35 0 35 

21.10.17 
Group dynamic approach 
for FPO 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 26 0 26 

24.10.17 
and 

25.10.17 

Value added products 
from Moringa 

2 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 1 14 15 

25.10.17 
Role of micro nutrient in 
Turmeric cultivation 

1 PF Horticulture Off 11 5 16 

26.10.17 
Integrated Farming 
system 

1 PF Crop Production Off 74 8 82 

07.11.17 
Group dynamics and 
farmers organization 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 17 0 17 

08.11.17 
EDP training to rural 
women 

1 RY 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 1 14 15 

09.11.17 
Women Entrepreneur 
through SHGs 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 2 29 31 

16.11.17 
Role of micro nutrient in 
snake gourd cultivation 

1 PF Horticulture Off 10 5 15 

17.11.17 Composting technologies 1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility Management 

Off 18 4 22 

18.11.17 
TD seed drill in 
Bengalgram production 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 9 1 10 

18.11.17 INM in Coriander  1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility Management 

Off 12 2 14 

20.11.17 
Seed treatment with bio 
agents for enhancing 
productivity in onion 

1 PF Horticulture Off 5 3 8 

22.11.17 
Advantages of mechanical 
weeders in paddy 
production 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 6 9 15 

23.11.17 
Role of coconut tonic in 
coconut production 

1 PF Horticulture Off 9 1 10 

23.11.17 
Women entrepreneur 
through Agri Business school 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 14 14 



24.11.17 
Weed management in 
Bengalgram 

1 PF Crop Production Off 12 3 15 

24.11.17 
Importance of 
pseudomonas drenching 
in turmeric production 

1 PF Horticulture Off 12 13 25 

02.12.17 
to 

05.12.17 

Processing of tribal 
products 

3 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 0 19 19 

06.12.17 IPDM in groundnut 1 PF Horticulture Off 11 4 15 

07.12.17 
Role and function of KVK 
in formation of farmers 
and farm women groups 

1 RY 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 7 19 26 

07.12.17 
Importance of different 
weeders in paddy 
cultivation 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 6 8 14 

08.12.17 
Integrated pest and 
disease management in 
turmeric 

1 PF Horticulture Off 9 3 12 

08.12.17 
Role of TD groundnut 
harvester in groundnut 
production 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 14 6 20 

12.12.17 
Bee keeping and bee 
farming 

1 RY 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 15 16 31 

15.12.17 
Value added products 
form maize 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 17 17 

18.12.17 
Institutional support to 
agri premises with special 
reference to KVK activities 

1 RY Crop Production On 0 33 33 

19.12.17 

Nutrition security and 
income generation 
through nutritional 
garden 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 34 34 

20.12.17 
Role of azophos 
application in coconut 
cultivation 

1 PF Horticulture Off 5 5 10 

20.12.17 
Water conservation 
techniques 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 10 1 11 

26.12.17 
Role of ICAR KVK on 
sustainable agricultural 
development  in the district 

1 EP Crop Production On 15 8 23 

03.01.18 ICM in Jasmine 1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 2 13 15 

03.01.18 
Proper care and 
maintenance of drip 
irrigation system 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 11 0 11 

04.01.18 
Role and Importance of 
medicinal plants 

1 EF Horticulture Off 17 15 32 



05.01.18 
Value added products 
from banana 

1 RY 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 6 7 13 

05.01.18 
Role and importance of 
medicinal plants 

1 EF Horticulture Off 14 11 25 

06.02.18 
Value added products 
form banana 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 2 16 18 

08.01.18 
Integrated Pest and 
Disease Management in 
pulses 

1 PF Crop Production Off 8 3 11 

08.01.18 
Utilization of multi crop 
thrasher in rainfed 
Bengalgram 

1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 9 1 10 

10.01.18 INM in onion 1 PF Horticulture Off 6 24 30 

11.01.18 
Hi tech vegetable 
cultivation 

1 PF Horticulture Off 27 20 47 

11.01.18 
EDP training to rural 
women 

1 RY 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 15 15 

18.01.18 
Formation of FPO and 
Registration process 

1 EF Horticulture Off 20 14 34 

18.01.18 
Importance of dietry  
fiber and low glycemic 
index foods 

1 RY 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 20 20 

20.01.18 
Importance of disease 
management in turmeric 

1 PF Horticulture Off 7 3 10 

23.01.18 Soil fertility management 1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 0 30 30 

25.01.18 
Value added products 
from milk 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 2 13 15 

02.02.18 
Integrated weed and 
nutrient management in 
banana 

1 PF Horticulture Off 15 6 21 

06.02.18 TD groundnut thrasher 1 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

Off 9 6 15 

07.02.18 

Importance of VAM 
application in coconut 
cultivation 
 

1 PF Horticulture Off 21 6 27 

07.02.18 
Role of micro nutrient in 
daily diet 

1 RY 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 17 17 

13.02.18 
Formation in FPO and 
Registration 

1 EF Horticulture Off 21 16 37 

14.02.18 
Soil conservation 
practices 

1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility Management 

Off 20 1 21 



21.02.18 
Post-harvest handling in 
turmeric 

1 PF Horticulture Off 15 17 32 

21.02.18 Value addition in milk 1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 15 15 

22.02.18 EDP to rural youth 1 RY 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 30 30 

23.02.18 
Integrated Nutrient 
management  

1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 1 11 12 

27.02.18 

Integrated Farming 
system for sustainable 
agriculture and average 
water use efficiency 

1 PF Crop Production Off 17 0 17 

05.03.18 Soil conservation 1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 21 7 28 

07.03.18 
Value added products 
from milk 

1 RY 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 0 20 20 

09.03.18 
Importance of soil fertility 
and composting 

1 PF 
Soil Health and 
Fertility 
Management 

Off 2 10 12 

12.03.18 
Formation of FPO and 
registration 

1 PF Horticulture Off 17 16 33 

15.03.18 
Value added products 
form fruits and vegetables 

1 RY 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 0 20 20 

19.03.18 
to 

21.03.18 

Bee keeping and bee 
farming 

3 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

On 12 4 16 

22.03.18 Role and activities of KVK 1 PF Crop Production On 44 0 44 

23.03.18 
Role of micro nutrient in 
daily diet 

1 PF 
Home 
Science/Women 
empowerment 

Off 2 14 16 

24.03.18 
Training on IFS climatic 
change adoption and GAP 
in horticulture crops 

1 PF Horticulture On 13 2 15 

28.03.18 
to 

31.03.18 

Skill development training 
on Tamarind processing 
and value addition 

4 PF 
Agril. 
Engineering 

On 0 12 12 

29.03.18 
Rainfed horticultural 
development progress 

1 PF Horticulture On 21 1 22 

 Total    130 1344 1280 2624 

 

 



April 2019 to March 2020  

Date Training title 
Dura 
tion 

Type Thematic area Location Male Female Total 

02.04.2019 
Importance of summer 
ploughing 

1 PF Agri Engineering Off 15 0 15 

05.04.2019 TD Groundnut digger 1 RY Agri Engineering Off 10 5 15 

08.04.2019 
Enterprenure 
development to Tribal 
women 

1 RY Home Sciences Off 14 13 27 

11.04.2019 
Importance of organic 
farming 

1 PF Soil Science On 13 7 20 

12.04.2019 
Importance of bee 
keeping 

1 PF Home Sciences On 13 7 20 

23.04.2019 ICM in Banana 1 PF Horticulture Off 12 0 12 

24.04.2019 
Importance of IFS and 
Value addition 

1 PF Home Sciences SP 9 15 24 

16.05.2019 EDP to rural women 1 PF Home Sciences Off 0 13 13 

17.05.2019 
Cultivation in rainfed 
maize 

1 PF Agronomy Off 10 2 12 

22.05.2019 
Income generation 
through tailoring 

1 RY Home Sciences Off 0 16 16 

23.05.2019 
Integrated Nutrient 
management 

1 PF Soil Science Off 2 10 12 

24.05.2019 
Importance of PGPR in 
turmeric cultivation 

1 PF Horticulture Off 8 2 10 

29.05.2019 
Training on manually 
operated groundnut 
decorticator 

1 PF Agri Engineering Off 7 3 10 

07.06.2019 Safe food production 1 PF Home Sciences On 9 12 21 

07.06.2019 
Power weeder in 
horticultural crops 

1 PF Agri Engineering Off 13 2 15 

13.06.2019 
Capasity buildng to farm 
women 

1 PF Home Sciences SP 3 22 25 

14.06.2019 Capacity building 1 PF Home Sciences SP 0 21 21 

15.06.2019 EDP - Areca plate making 1 PF Home Sciences SP 0 27 27 

17.06.2019 
Integrated Nutrient 
management 

1 RY Soil Science On 15 0 15 

17.06.2019 Value addition in coconut 1 PF Home Sciences SP 23 6 29 

18.06.2019 
Recent technologies and 
FAW management  in 
Maize 

1 PF Agronomy SP 55 10 65 

18.06.2019 

Importance of seed 
treatment with bio agents 
for enhancing production 
of ridge gourd 

1 PF Horticulture Off 10 1 11 

18.06.2019 Soil tertility management 1 RY Soil Science On 15 29 44 

18.06.2019 
Role of KVK, income 
generation through Value 

1 RY Home Sciences On 17 21 38 



addition 

18.06.2019 Power weeder in cotton 1 PF Agri Engineering Off 17 2 19 

19.06.2019 
Integrate pest and disease 
management in coconut 

1 PF Horticulture Off 22 5 27 

19.06.2019 
Women empowerment 
through ABS 

1 PF Home Sciences Off 0 16 16 

20.06.2019 
Role of KVK, income 
generation through Value 
addition 

1 RY Home Sciences On 9 30 39 

21.06.2019 
EDP - Value addition in 
millets 

1 PF Home Sciences Off 2 28 30 

24.06.2019 
Doubling the farmers 
income through value 
addition 

1 PF Home Sciences On 11 18 29 

25.06.2019 EDP to rural women 1 PF Home Sciences On 1 23 24 

26.06.2019 
Nursery techniques for 
quality seedling 
production 

1 PF Horticulture Off 10 1 11 

03.07.2019 EDP to rural women 1 PF Home Sciences On 4 17 21 

04.07.2019 
Recent techniques in 
fodder cultivation 1 

PF Agronomy On 6 4 10 

09.07.2019 
Care and maintanance of 
drip irrigation 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 16 2 18 

11.07.2019 
Rainwater harvesting with 
TD chisel plough 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 11 1 12 

18.07.2019 
Importance of nutrition 
garden 1 

PF Home Sciences Off 7 16 23 

19.07.2019 Capacity building 1 PF Home Sciences Off 6 11 17 

20.07.2019 
Rainwater harvesting with 
TD chisel plough 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 34 5 39 

23.07.2019 
Value added products 
from curry leaf 1 

PF Home Sciences On 3 7 10 

24.07.2019 Popularising wind break  1 PF Horticulture On 59 3 62 

25.07.2019 
Importance of bio 
fertilizers in soil fertility 
management 1 

PF Soil Science Off 3 30 33 

26.07.2019 
Millet production 
technologies 1 

PF Agronomy Off 31 9 40 

27.07.2019 
High density planting and 
canopy manangment in 
fruit crops 1 

PF Horticulture Off 11 4 15 

28.07.2019 
Factors introduction of 
coconut production 1 

PF Horticulture Off 12 9 21 

01.08.2019 
Role of soil and water 
conservation in coconut 
cultivatgion 1 

PF Horticulture Off 22 2 24 

07.08.2019 
Farm mechanization in 
rainfed groundnut 
production 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 29 1 30 



08.08.2019 Advantages of farm ponds 1 PF Agri Engineering Off 32 10 42 

12.08.2019 
Advantages of TD chisel 
plough 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 36 7 43 

14.08.2019 
Advantages of  micro 
irrigation system 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 20 15 35 

14.08.2019 
Integrated pest and 
diseased management in 
coconut 1 

PF Horticulture Off 24 2 26 

14.08.2019 
Integrated pest and 
diseased management in 
banana 1 

PF Horticulture Off 23 2 25 

16.08.2019 
Seed treatment with bio 
agents for enhancing 
productivity in tomato 1 

PF Horticulture Off 26 0 26 

19.08.2019 
Mushroom productio 
techniques 2 

PF Home Sciences On 11 6 17 

21.08.2019 
Value added products 
from banana 1 

PF Home Sciences On 20 2 22 

22.08.2019 
Importance of summer 
ploughing in bengalgram 
production 1 

PF Agronomy Off 28 8 36 

23.08.2019 
Importance of soil and 
water testing 1 

PF Soil Science Off 28 3 31 

23.08.2019 
Importance of mineral 
mixture 1 

PF Animal Science Off 11 0 11 

26.08.2019 
Value addition and 
marketing of agricultural 
crops 6 

PF Home Sciences On 21 7 28 

26.08.2019 
Importance of inter  crops 
in coconut cultivation 1 

PF Horticulture Off 21 2 23 

27.08.2019 
Integrated Nutrient 
management 1 

PF Soil Science Off 11 0 11 

28.08.2019 

Seedling treatment bio 
agent for enhancing 
productivity in star 
Jasmine 1 

PF Horticulture Off 9 0 9 

29.08.2019 
Integrated weed 
management in coconut 1 

PF Horticulture Off 19 0 19 

03.09.2019 
Nursery management of 
horticultural crops 1 

RY Horticulture Off 7 1 8 

06.09.2019 
TD Groundnut seed drill in 
rainfed production 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 15 0 15 

06.09.2019 
Animal vaccination and 
animal production 1 

PF Animal Science Off 28 2 30 

09.09.2019 
Importance of value 
addition 1 

PF Home Sciences Off 0 20 20 

12.09.2019 
Integrated pest and 
diseased management in 
tomato 1 

PF Horticulture Off 23 6 29 



12.09.2019 
Integrated Nutrient 
management 1 

PF Soil Science Off 2 14 16 

17.09.2019 
Value added products 
from banana and curry 
leaf 1 

PF Home Sciences Off 7 16 23 

18.09.2019 
Animal vaccination and 
animal production 1 

PF Animal Science Off 18 2 20 

19.09.2019 
Manually operated 
groundnut decorticator 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 0 14 14 

20.09.2019 
Advantages of drip 
irrigation 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 15 0 15 

20.09.2019 
Terrace garden 
techniques 1 

RY Horticulture Off 2 38 40 

20.09.2019 
Animal vaccination and 
animal production 1 

PF Animal Science Off 19 4 23 

21.09.2019 Composting techniques 1 PF Soil Science Off 12 0 12 

26.09.2019 
Silk worm rearing  
techniques 1 

RY Agronomy On 15 15 30 

30.09.2019 ICM in millet production 1 PF Agronomy On 7 1 8 

02.10.2019 
Soil fertility management 
through composting 1 

PF Soil Science Off 14 16 30 

03.10.2019 
Designing of micro 
irrigation system 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 14 0 14 

05.10.2019 
Integtated white fly 
management in coconut 1 

PF Horticulture Off 6 3 9 

16.10.2019 Soil fertility management 1 PF Soil Science On 10 31 41 

17.10.2019 
Integrated Nutrient 
Management 1 

PF Soil Science On 10 34 44 

17.10.2019 
Advantages of desi bird 
rearing 1 

PF Animal Science Off 3 8 11 

17.10.2019 
Nutritional security and 
income generation 
through back yard poultry 1 

PF Home Sciences Off 4 7 11 

18.10.2019 
Integrated pest and 
disease management in 
tomato 1 

PF Horticulture Off 14 5 19 

18.10.2019 
Designing of micro 
irrigation system 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 17 0 17 

21.10.2019 
Integrated farming 
system 1 

PF Agronomy SP 22 3 25 

23.10.2019 
Soil fertility management 
through farm waste 
recyling 1 

EF Soil Science On 24 12 36 

23.10.2019 
Value added products 
from curry leaf 1 

PF Home Sciences On 5 6 11 

04.11.2019 
Value added products 
from millets 1 

PF Home Sciences SP 17 8 25 

05.11.2019 
Nursery management in 
Horticulture crops 4 

RY Horticulture Off 7 0 7 



08.11.2019 
Importance of ethno 
veterinary medicine 1 

RY Animal Science On 7 0 7 

08.11.2019 
Demonsteration of curry 
leaf stripper and 
Enterprenur visit 1 

PF Home Sciences Off 5 7 12 

11.11.2019 to 
17.11.2019 

Friends of coconut tree 6 RY Horticulture SP 13 7 20 

14.11.2019 
Post harvest management 
and value addition of 
tribal resource 1 

PF Home Sciences SP 10 32 42 

19.11.2019 
Integrated Pest 
management in coconut 1 

PF Horticulture Off 15 8 23 

19.11.2019 
Importance of Micro 
Nutrient in chillies 1 

PF Soil Science Off 7 5 12 

20.11.2019 
Balanced fertilizer 
application 1 

PF Soil Science On 28 10 38 

20.11.2019 
Utilization of power 
weeder through power 
tiller in coconut farm 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 14 0 14 

21.11.2019 ICM in Jasmine 1 PF Horticulture Off 8 3 11 

21.11.2019 
Advantages of drip 
irrigation 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 12 0 12 

04.12.2019 
Balanced fertilizer 
application 1 

PF Soil Science On 7 9 16 

04.12.2019 
Importance of stall fed 
goat rearing 1 

PF Animal Science Off 1 9 10 

06.12.2019 
Value added products 
from millets 1 

PF Home Sciences SP 9 31 40 

06.12.2019 
Advantges of micro 
irrigation 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 10 2 12 

07.12.2019 
Demonstration of 
different sweetner in 
bakery products 1 

PF Home Sciences On 3 9 12 

09.12.2019 
Organic farming in 
vegetable crops 1 

PF Horticulture Off 17 1 18 

12.12.2019 
Introduction of TD 
groundnut digger 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 7 3 10 

13.12.2019 
Importance of mixed 
fodder 1 

PF Animal Science Off 2 8 10 

13.12.2019 
Integrated Nutrient  
management in 
vegetables 1 

PF Soil Science On 54 6 60 

16.12.2019 Women empowerment 1 PF Home Sciences On 0 22 22 

18.12.2019 Safe  disposal of waste 1 PF Home Sciences Off 0 23 23 

20.12.2019 
Effective utilization of 
kitchen waste for rasing 
kitchen garden 1 

PF Home Sciences Off 4 8 12 

20.12.2019 
Importance of 
concentrate feed paring 
lactation and preganancy 1 

PF Animal Science Off 2 7 9 



23.12.2019 Organic farming 1 PF Horticulture On 26 11 37 

06.01.2020 
Quality vegetable 
production in terrace 
garden 1 

RY Horticulture On 0 10 10 

07.01.2020 Value added in millets 1 PF Home Sciences On 0 20 20 

08.01.2020 
Mechanization in rainfed 
groundnut production 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 15 0 15 

09.01.2020 
Quality vegetable seedling 
production 1 

PF Horticulture Off 10 0 10 

10.01.2020 
Quality vegetable 
production in terrace 
garden 1 

RY Horticulture On 0 10 10 

10.01.2020 
Development and 
promotion of tribal 
products through EDP 1 

PF Home Sciences Off 13 14 27 

10.01.2020 Women empowerment 1 RY Home Sciences On 0 25 25 

22.01.2020 ICM in chillies 1 PF Soil Science On 18 6 24 

23.01.2020 
Proper care and 
maintenance of drip 
irrigation system 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 12 3 15 

24.01.2020 
Importance of green 
fodder 1 

PF Agronomy Off 22 22 44 

27.01.2020 
- 

29.01.2020 

Development of banana 
pseudostem fiber 
extration  3 

RY Home Sciences On 4 4 8 

29.01.2020 
Improved  coconut 
cultivation techniques 1 

EF Horticulture Off 35 7 42 

29.01.2020 
Proper care and 
maintanance of drip 
irrigation system 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 19 5 24 

27.01.2020 
- 

31.01.2020 

Effective utilization of 
banana pseudostem  fiber 

2 
RY Home Sciences On 6 8 14 

12.02.2020 ICM in watermelon 1 PF Horticulture Off 9 5 14 

13.02.2020 ICM in millet production 1 PF Agronomy Off 9 4 13 

13.02.2020 IPDM in coconut 1 PF Horticulture Off 45 21 66 

13.02.2020 Value added from pulses 1 PF Home Sciences SP 29 0 29 

15.02.2020 Value added from banana 1 PF Home Sciences On 0 10 10 

19.02.2020 ICM in banana 1 PF Horticulture Off 14 8 22 

19.02.2020 
Soil test based fertilizer 
recommendation for 
vegetables 1 

PF Soil Science Off 30 4 34 

20.02.2020 ICM in chillies 1 PF Soil Science On 18 6 24 

20.02.2020 
-

24.02.2020 
Areca plate making 5 RY Home Sciences VOC 30 2 32 

25.02.2020 
Farm mechanization in 
rainfed groundnut 
production 1 

PF Agri Engineering SP 8 17 25 



27.02.2020 
Maintenance of drip 
irrigation system 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 11 3 14 

02.03.2020 
Maintenance of micro 
irrigation system 1 

PF Agri Engineering Off 12 2 14 

05.03.2020 
Women empowerment 
through group farming 1 

RY Home Sciences Off 0 15 15 

12.03.2020 
Harvesting and cleaning 
of bengalgram 1 

PF Agronomy Off 16 2 18 

13.03.2020 
Role of KVK in value 
added products  1 

PF Home Sciences SP 0 38 38 

14.03.2020 
Quality vegetable 
production 1 

PF Horticulture Off 22 3 25 

16.03.2020 
Balanced fertilizer 
application 1 

PF Soil Science Off 14 12 26 

16.03.2020 
Value added products 
from tribal resources 1 

PF Home Sciences Off 13 34 47 

16.03.2020 
Farm mechanization in 
rainfed groundnut 
production 

1 PF Agri Engineering Off 14 0 14 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



April 2020 to March 2021  

Date Training title 
Durati

on 
Type Discipline 

Locatio

n 
Male 

Femal

e 
Total 

May 
Advantages of   chisel plough  in 

rainwater harvesting 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 10 2 12 

May 

Primary and secondary tillage 

equipments in seed bed 

preparation 

1 PF Agri Engg Off 14 1 15 

May 

Primary and secondary tillage 

equipments in seed bed 

preparation 

1 PF Agri Engg Off 13 2 15 

May 
Preparation of low cost nutritious 

during the COVID 19 
1 PF Home Sciences Off 0 17 17 

May 
Processing of value addition of 

millets 
1 PF Home Sciences Off 0 9 9 

May 
Mushroom cultvation as income 

generation activity 
1 RY Home Sciences Off 0 12 12 

May 
Women empowerment through 

ABS 
1 PF Home Sciences On 0 10 10 

May 
Importance of summer ploghing in 

groundnut cultivation 
1 PF 

Field Crop 

Production and 

Management 

Off 20 10 30 

June 
Importance of Soil and water 

testing 
1 PF 

Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 2 6 8 

June 

Primary and secondary tillage 

equipments in seed bed 

preparation 

1 PF Agri Engg Off 15 1 16 

June 

Primary and secondary tillage 

equipments in seed bed 

preparation 

1 PF Agri Engg Off 6 9 15 

June EDP to rural women 1 PF Home Sciences Off 0 11 11 

June 
Establishment of kitchen garden at 

village level 
1 PF Home Sciences Off 0 13 13 

July 
TD check basin formation in 

Irrigated Groundnut production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 11 4 15 

July 
TD check basin formation in 

Irrigated Groundnut production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 12 3 15 

July High value of vegetable cultivation 1 PF 
Horticultural 

crops 
On 24 6 30 

July 
Value added products from tribal 

resources 
1 PF Home Sciences SP 12 6 18 

July Value added products from millets 1 PF Home Sciences SP 0 22 22 



July Farm waste recyling 1 PF 
Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 3 9 12 

August Pulses production technoligies 1 PF 

Field Crop 

Production and 

Management 

SP 11 2 13 

August Importance of Nutri cereals 1 PF 

Field Crop 

Production and 

Management 

SP 27 3 30 

August Integrated farming system 1 PF 

Field Crop 

Production and 

Management 

SP 22 2 24 

August Hi value vegetable cultivation 1 PF 
Horticultural 

crops 
SP 27 8 35 

August 
Integrated crop management in 

tomato 
1 PF 

Horticultural 

crops 
SP 30 5 35 

August Integrated Nutrient management 1 PF 
Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 8 2 10 

August 
Soil test based fertilizer 

recommendation 
1 PF 

Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 8 0 8 

August 

Advantages of priliminary / 

secondary tillage equipments in 

seed bed proparation 

1 PF Agri Engg Off 15 0 15 

August 
Proper care and maintenance of 

drip irrigation 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 12 0 12 

August Processing of millets 1 PF Home Sciences SP 31 8 39 

August Marketing of agri products 1 PF Home Sciences SP 18 4 22 

August 
Enterprenuer development 

through ABS 
1 PF Home Sciences SP 4 4 8 

August Bee keeping 1 PF Home Sciences SP 12 6 18 

September Different composting technologies 1 PF 
Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 17 1 18 

September 
Integrated Plant Nutrient supply 

system 
1 PF 

Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 13 3 16 

September ICM in tomato 1 PF 
Horticultural 

crops 
Off 23 12 35 

September Terrace garden 1 PF 
Horticultural 

crops 
On 1 19 20 

September 
Advantages of chisel plough in 

rainwater harvesting 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 10 2 12 

September 
Proper care and maintenance of 

drip irrigation 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 14 0 14 

September Importance of nutri garden 1 PF Home Sciences Off 4 8 12 

September Value added products from millets 1 PF Home Sciences Off 3 12 15 



September Importance of nutri garden 1 EF Home Sciences Off 2 68 70 

September 
Processing and value addition of 

millets 
1 PF Home Sciences Off 0 14 14 

September Importance of nutri garden 1 EF Home Sciences On 1 101 102 

September Integrated faming system 1 RY Crop Production SP 26 2 28 

September ICM in Pulses 1 PF Crop Production Off 18 3 21 

October 
Quality planting materials 

production technologies 
1 RY 

Field Crop 

Production and 

Management 

On 14 15 29 

October 
Recent technologies in agricultural 

special focus on IFS 
1 EF 

Field Crop 

Production and 

Management 

On 9 7 16 

October 
Sericulture - quality cocoon 

production 
1 RY 

Field Crop 

Production and 

Management 

On 17 13 30 

October 
Disaster management in 

horticultural crops 
1 PF 

Horticultural 

crops 
On 17 3 20 

October 
Quality seedling production in 

horticultural crops 
1 RY 

Horticultural 

crops 
On 8 10 18 

October 
Integrated Nutrient Management 

in ashgourd 
1 PF 

Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 5 3 8 

October 
Integrated Nutrient Management 

in Brinjal 
1 PF 

Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 5 9 14 

October 
Advantages of TD seed drill in 

rainfed bengalgram production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 2 6 8 

October 
TD digger in rainfed groundnut 

production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 9 2 11 

October 
Capacity building programme for 

rural women 
1 PF Home Sciences Off 0 16 16 

October 
Preparation of herbal powder 

incorporated cookies 
1 PF Home Sciences Off 10 8 18 

November 
Pulses (Blackgram) production 

technology 
1 PF 

Field Crop 

Production and 

Management 

Off 8 6 14 

November Bengalgram production technology 1 PF 

Field Crop 

Production and 

Management 

Off 10 0 10 

November 
Groundnut cultivation and 

importance of gypsum application 
1 PF 

Field Crop 

Production and 

Management 

Off 8 1 9 

November ICM in pulses production 1 PF 

Field Crop 

Production and 

Management 

Off 10 0 10 



November 
Improved production technologies 

for horticultural crops 
1 PF 

Horticultural 

crops 
Off 21 9 30 

November ICM in banana 1 PF 
Horticultural 

crops 
Off 10 1 11 

November High density planting in banana 1 PF 
Horticultural 

crops 
On 3 8 11 

November 
Importance of intercrops in banana 

cultivation 
1 PF 

Horticultural 

crops 
Off 22 0 22 

November 
Importance of integrated terrace 

garden 
3 RY 

Horticultural 

crops 
On 0 23 23 

November Maintenance of micro irrigation 1 PF Agri Engg Off 9 2 11 

November TD seed drill in bengalgram 1 PF Agri Engg Off 8 4 12 

November Role of micro nutrients in daily diet 1 RY Home Sciences Off 0 40 40 

November EDP to rural women 1 PF Home Sciences Off 0 14 14 

November Value added products from pulses 1 PF Home Sciences Off 11 9 20 

December ICM  with weed management 1 PF 
Horticultural 

crops 
SP 19 16 35 

December 
Importance of intercrops in young 

banana cultivation 
1 PF 

Horticultural 

crops 
SP 13 11 24 

December 
Role of micro nutrients in coconut 

production 
1 PF 

Horticultural 

crops 
SP 11 10 21 

December 
Integrated pest and disease 

management in tomato 
1 PF 

Horticultural 

crops 
SP 17 6 23 

December 
Integrated water and soil 

conservation in coconut 
1 PF 

Horticultural 

crops 
SP 17 7 24 

December 
Safety storage method to food 

grains 
1 RY Home Sciences Off 0 9 9 

December EDP to rural women 1 RY Home Sciences Off 0 18 18 

December Bee keeping and value addition 3 PF Home Sciences VOC 25 23 48 

December Demonstration of multi grain mix 1 RY Home Sciences On 4 19 23 

December Mush room production 3 RY Home Sciences VOC 14 23 37 

December Importance of nutri garden 1 PF Home Sciences Off 4 27 31 

December 
Advantages of chisel plough in 

rainwater harvesting 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 13 2 15 

December 
Farm mechanization in groudnut 

production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 0 11 11 

December 
Proper care and maintenance of 

drip irrigation system 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 10 2 12 

December 
Proper care and maintenance of 

drip irrigation system 
1 PF Agri Engg SP 24 2 26 

December Farm waste recycling 1 PF 
Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 4 8 12 

December Integrated farming system 1 PF Field Crop Off 9 2 11 



Production and 

Management 

December ICM in maize 1 PF 

Field Crop 

Production and 

Management 

Off 18 3 21 

05.01.2021 ICM in Bengalgram 1 PF 
Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 15 3 18 

19.01.2021 Integrated Terrace garden 1 PF 
Horticultural 

crops 
VOC 4 13 17 

19.01.2021 INM in ash gourd 1 PF Crop Production Off 6 6 12 

19.01.2021 Agri business incubation challenge 1 PF Home Sciences On 37 22 59 

20.01.2021 Maintenance of Micro irrigation 1 PF Agri Engg Off 10 2 12 

21.01.2021 Mushroom Production 1 PF Home Sciences On 21 0 21 

22.01.2021 ICM in Solunium nigirus 1 PF 
Horticultural 

crops 
Off 2 12 14 

23.01.2021 
Farm Mechanization in groundnut 

production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 10 0 10 

05.02.2021 ICM in pulses 1 PF 
Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 4 18 22 

09.02.2021 ICM in Coconut 1 PF 
Horticultural 

crops 
Off 26 3 29 

12.02.2021 Value addition in Mushroom 1 PF Home Sciences On 2 16 18 

16.02.2021 
Farm Mechanization in groundnut 

production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 21 9 30 

18.02.2021 Importance of value addition 1 PF Home Sciences SP 18 3 21 

18.02.2021 Integrated soil health management 1 PF 
Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 8 21 29 

18.02.2021 Motorized earth augur 1 PF Agri Engg Off 7 7 14 

19.02.2021 Water harvesting techniques 1 PF 
Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
On 7 26 33 

19.02.2021 Roof top garden techniques 1 RY 
Horticultural 

crops 
On 0 15 15 

24.02.2021 
Primary processing and value 

added products from banana 
1 PF Home Sciences Off 20 3 23 

24.02.2021 ICM in Corainder 1 PF 
Horticultural 

crops 
Off 9 6 15 

25.02.2021 
Value addition and marketing of 

agricultural crops 
1 PF Home Sciences SKILL 7 14 21 

25.02.2021 
FPO activities for uplifting the 

agricultural production 
1 PF 

Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 26 2 28 

26.02.2021 
Post harvest handling of 

bengalgram 
1 PF 

Agronomy and 

Soil Science 
Off 19 3 22 

03.03.2021 Quality seedling production 1 PF Horticultural On 6 7 13 



through terrace garden crops 

04.03.2021 
Value addition and marketing of 

agricultural crops 
5 RY Home Sciences SKILL 7 14 21 

11.03.2021 Organic farming 1 PF Crop Production On 12 1 13 

12.03.2021 Value addition of vegetables 1 PF Home Sciences Off 5 2 7 

15.03.2021 Dairy Management techniques 1 PF Animal Science On 2 3 5 

19.03.2021 
Pest and disease control in certain 

horti and agri cops 
1 RY 

Kumaravadivelu 

P Dr 
On 39 3 42 

23.03.2021 
Dairy Products technology (Paneer 

Khoa 
2 RY Animal Science On 2 3 5 

24.03.2021 
Farm Mechanization in banana 

production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 7 7 14 

26.03.2021 Value addition in Mushroom 1 PF Home Sciences On 3 8 11 

29.03.2021 Value addition in tomato 1 PF Home Sciences On 4 8 12 

30.03.2021 women and child care 1 PF Home Sciences Off 13 14 27 

 

April 2021 to March 2022  

Date Training title 
Durati

on 
Type Discipline 

Locatio

n 
Male 

Femal

e 
Total 

05.04.2021 
Importance of integrated plant 

nutrient supply system 
1 PF Soil Science Off 4 3 7 

09.04.2021 
Training on Nutrient management 

in vegetables 
1 PF Soil Science Off 4 2 6 

12.04.2021 
Training programme on IFS for 

rural youth 
1 PF Agronomy ON 7 0 7 

16.04.2021 
Importance of soil and water 

testing 
1 PF Soil Science ON 7 0 7 

21.04.2021 
Farm mechanization in paddy 

production 
1 PF Agri Engg ON 8 0 8 

23.04.2021 
Training on ICM in banana by 

online 
1 PF Horticulture ON 8 4 12 

17.05.2021 
Training on seed production 

techniques in vegetable crops 
1 PF Horticulture VOC 17 2 19 

20.05.2021 Honey bee rearing techniques 1 PF Home Science Virtual 84 11 95 

27.05.2021 Roof top garden techniques 1 PF Horticulture Virtual 86 15 101 

27.05.2021 Waste decompost techniques 1 PF Soil Science Virtual 89 11 100 

01.06.2021 Clean milk production 1 PF Animal Science Virtual 41 8 49 

01.06.2021 Value addition in milk 1 PF Home Science Virtual 39 9 48 

14.06.2021 
Soil fertility management for 

enhancing good quality of food 
1 PF Soil Science Virtual 87 14 101 



products 

14.06.2021 
Linkages between agri producers 

and FPOs 
1 PF Horticulture Virtual 78 13 91 

14.06.2021 
Role of livestock in quality food 

products 
1 PF Animal Science Virtual 63 11 74 

18.06.2021 4R Fertilizer application method 1 PF Soil Science Virtual 28 13 41 

23.06.2021 
Enhancing Farmer’s Income - 

Reinforcing the developmental 
activities by Convergence 

1 PF Agri Engg Virtual 85 16 101 

15.07.2021 Vermi composting techniques 1 PF Soil Science Off 3 17 20 

15.07.2021 
Animal Vaccination and 

Deworming for goats 
1 PF Animal Science Off 0 24 24 

19.07.2021 Micro irrigation 1 PF Agri Engg Off 9 0 9 

19.07.2021 ICM in chillies 1 PF Horticulture Off 13 3 16 

24.07.2021 
Value added products from Tribal 

resources 
1 PF Home Science Off 5 165 170 

27.07.2021 ICM in Brinjal 1 PF Horticulture Off 10 3 13 

28.07.2021 
Proper care and maintenance of 

drip irrigation system 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 15 0 15 

29.07.2021 
Advantage of pseudostem injector 

in banana (FLD) 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 22 0 22 

29.07.2021 ICM in Coconut 1 PF Horticulture Off 18 3 21 

31.07.2021 
Proper care and maintenance of 

Micro Irrigation system 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 17 4 21 

02.08.2021 ICM in vegetables 1 PF Horticulture Off 13 8 21 

05.08.2021 
Farm waste recycling and vermi 

composting 
1 PF Soil Science Off 26 6 32 

05.08.2021 
Enterprenur development 

programme on diary farming 
1 PF Animal Science Off 3 27 30 

05.08.2021 
High density planting techniques in 

horticultural crops 
1 PF Horticulture Off 10 8 18 

06.08.2021 ICM in coconut 1 PF Horticulture Off 15 17 32 

09.08.2021 Mushroom Production techniques 1 PF Home Science Off 6 26 32 

10.08.2021 Organic farming in vegetables 1 PF Horticulture Off 13 8 21 

12.08.2021 
Proper care and maintenance of 

Micro Irrigation system 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 30 6 36 

12.08.2021 Soil fertility management 1 PF Soil Science Off 42 12 54 

12.08.2021 ICM in Coconut 1 PF Horticulture Off 19 0 19 



13.08.2021 
Proper care and maintenance of 

micro irrigation 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 28 3 31 

18.08.2021 
Mechanization of Groundnut 

production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 4 16 20 

18.08.2021 Goat rearing techniques 1 PF Animal Science Off 4 16 20 

25.08.2021 ICM in Turmeric 1 PF Horticulture Off 12 5 17 

26.08.2021 Storage techniques for food grains 1 PF Home Science ON 3 15 18 

27.08.2021 ICM in Coconut 1 PF Horticulture Off 11 6 17 

27.08.2021 Bringing fallow land cultivation 1 PF Soil Science Off 21 12 33 

01.09.2021 Training on Vermi composting 1 PF Soil Science Off 23 18 41 

01.09.2021 
Training conducted on 'Proper care 

and maintenance of Micro 
Irrigation system 

1 PF Agri Engg Off 20 3 23 

02.09.2021 
Training conducted on 'Proper care 

and maintenance of Micro 
Irrigation system 

1 RY Agri Engg ON 15 5 20 

02.09.2021 Dairy products 1 PF Animal Science ON 5 7 12 

03.09.2021 Quail farming 1 PF Animal Science Off 7 14 21 

03.09.2021 
Scientific grading, sizing, packing 
and storage of horticultural crops 

1 PF Horticulture Off 15 6 21 

04.09.2021 
Capacity building programme for 

farm women 
1 PF Home Science Off 0 16 16 

06.09.2021 
Capacity building programme for 

farm women 
1 PF Home Science Off 0 12 12 

06.09.2021 
Training conducted on 'Proper care 

and maintenance of Micro 
Irrigation system 

1 PF Agri Engg Off 23 1 24 

07.09.2021 
Mechanization on banana 

production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 16 0 16 

08.09.2021 
Capacity building programme for 

farm women 
1 PF Home Science Off 0 15 15 

09.09.2021 
FLD on Introduction and 

Demonstration of Namakkal gold 
quail. 

1 PF Animal Science Off 7 14 21 

09.09.2021 
Farm waste recycling and vermi 

composting 
1 PF Soil Science Off 23 6 29 

14.09.2021 
Farm mechanization in Rainfed 

Groundnut production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 3 11 14 

14.09.2021 
EDP to Value added products from 

coconut 
1 PF Home Science Off 15 2 17 

16.09.2021 
Proper care and maintenance of 

Micro Irrigation system 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 20 4 24 



16.09.2021 INM in vegetables 1 PF Soil Science Off 41 4 45 

20.09.2021 ICM in Coconut 1 PF Horticulture Off 12 7 19 

22.09.2021 
Sorting, grading and marketing of 

horticultural crops 
1 PF Horticulture Off 13 18 31 

23.09.2021 
Soil health management with 
support of ARAM Organic FPO 

1 PF Soil Science Off 32 4 36 

23.09.2021 

Training and Sensitizing to 
Agricultural students on Soil and 

Crop health management to 
contribute to the FPO 

1 PF Plant Protection Off 7 0 7 

24.09.2021 Demonstration of seaweed cookies 1 RY Home Science ON 9 10 19 

24.09.2021 Roof top vegetable cultivation 1 PF Horticulture Off 8 10 18 

24.09.2021 ICM in vegetables 1 PF Soil Science Off 12 11 23 

27.09.2021 ICM in millet production 1 RY Agronomy ON 17 11 28 

29.09.2021 
ICM in pulses production 

technologies 
1 PF Agronomy ON 10 11 21 

30.09.2021 Nutri garden techniques 1 PF Horticulture EF 0 16 16 

30.09.2021 Nutrient management in Jasmine 1 PF Soil Science Off 2 10 12 

01.10.2021 
Advantages of chisel plough in 

rainwater harvesting 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 12 4 16 

01.10.2021 
Sorting, Grading and marketing of 

horticultural crops 
1 PF Horticulture Off 10 6 16 

06.10.2021 ICM in Brinjal 1 PF Horticulture Off 9 6 15 

07.10.2021 
Sorting, Grading and marketing of 

horticultural crops 
1 PF Horticulture Off 15 2 17 

07.10.2021 
Women empowerment through 

agri enterprises 
1 PF Home Science Off 0 16 16 

15.10.2021 Importance of Nutri garden 1 PF Home Science Off 3 21 24 

16.10.2021 ICM in Bengalgram 1 PF Agronomy Off 33 5 38 

18.10.2021 
Importance of varietal selection 

and seed treatment in bengalgram 
1 PF Agronomy Off 12 3 15 

20.10.2021 Importance of soil testing in onion 1 PF Soil Science Off 12 0 12 

21.10.2021 Soil fertility management 1 PF Soil Science Off 46 6 52 

29.10.2021 Value addition in Groundnut 1 PF Home Science Off 21 9 30 

29.10.2021 ICM in groundnut 1 PF Agronomy Off 33 4 37 



01.11.2021 
Integrated Farming System for 

extension workers 
1 EF Agronomy ON 0 24 24 

02.11.2021 
 Recent technologies in agriculture 

special focus on IFS 
1 EF Soil Science ON 2 17 19 

06.11.2021 ICM in bengalgram 1 PF Agronomy Off 23 3 26 

08.11.2021 ICM in blackgram 1 PF Agronomy Off 11 0 11 

11.11.2021 
Advantage of TD Seed drill in 

Rainfed Bengalgram production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 9 3 12 

12.11.2021 
FLD on TD Digger in Rainfed 

Groundnut production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 9 4 13 

12.11.2021 
FLD - Masti guard prevention 

techniques 
1 PF Animal Science Off 8 4 12 

20.11.2021 
FLD on TD seed dril in Rainfed 

Bengalgram production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 10 3 13 

20.11.2021 Organic input preparation 1 PF Soil Science Off 53 12 65 

24.11.2021 
Banana cultivation and Post 

harvest technologies 
1 EF Horticulture ON 36 6 42 

25.11.2021 VOC Training Bee Keeping 1 PF Home Science ON 42 22 64 

29.11.2021 to 
04.12.2021 

Bee Keeping 6 RY Home Science Skill 18 11 29 

02.12.2021 
Importance of mineral mixture in 

goats 
1 PF Animal Science Off 4 6 10 

02.12.2021 
Training programme on Nursery 

Management in paddy 
1 PF Agronomy Off 9 2 11 

04.12.2021 
Role of farm mechanization in crop 

production 
1 RY Agri Engg ON 20 4 24 

08.12.2021 
Farm mechanization on groundnut 

production 
1 PF Agri Engg ON 11 11 22 

09.12.2021 ICM in banana 1 PF Horticulture Off 14 3 17 

10.12.2021 ICM in Coconut 1 PF Horticulture Off 20 6 26 

13.12.2021 to 
22.12.21 

Vocational training on IFS 10 RY Agronomy ON 16 0 16 

15.12.2021 Terrace garden techniques 1 PF Horticulture Off 13 4 17 

20.12.2021 to 
31.12.2021 

Nutrition, Nutri garden, Food 
production and hospitality 

management 

12 RY Home Science VOC 8 19 27 

21.12.2021 
Capacity building programme for 

farm women 
1 PF Home Science Off 2 16 18 

21.12.2021 ICM in Coconut 1 PF Horticulture Off 14 4 18 

22.12.2021 
EF  training on role and function of 
KVK for farmer and rural economic 
upliftment of Coimbatore district 

1 PF Agronomy ON 9 39 48 



23.12.2021 Production of organic inputs 1 RY Soil Science Off 72 12 84 

23.12.2021 to 
24.12.2021 

Skill training on Nutri garden 
techniques 

1 RY Horticulture ON 8 23 31 

23.12.2021 
Importance of farm mechanization 

in rainfed crop production 
1 PF Agri Engg ON 4 9 13 

28.12.2021 
EDP training value added products 

form coconut 
1 PF Home Science ON 3 13 16 

28.12.2021 Training on organic farming 1 PF Agronomy Off 32 8 40 

29.12.2021 
Value added products from 

coconut 
1 PF Home Science ON 10 6 16 

29.12.2021 
Natural resource management in 

agriculture 
1 RY Agronomy ON 15 0 15 

01.01.2022 
Importance of milk and milk 
products in human nutrition 

1 PF Animal Science Off 8 23 31 

29.12.2021 to 
05.01.2022 

Scientific Bee keeping 6 RY Home Science VOC 18 7 25 

07.01.2022 
Training programme on dryland 

agriculture technologies 
1 PF Agronomy Off 19 3 22 

20.01.2022 
High  density planting in 

horticulture crops 
1 PF Horticulture Off 15 5 20 

20.01.2022 Drip irrigation system 1 PF Agri Engg Off 12 0 12 

24.01.2022 
Importance of Nutrition for 

Adolesend girls 
1 PF Home Science ON 0 39 39 

28.01.2022 

IPM strategies in pulses production 
system election of pheromone trap 

for pod borer and yellow Sticky 
trap for sucking pest 

1 PF Agronomy Off 8 4 12 

28.01.2022 Roof top garden techniques 1 RY Horticulture Off 11 7 18 

01.02.2022 Training on roof top garden 1 PF Horticulture Off 15 6 21 

08.02.2022 ICM in vegetable cowpea 1 PF Horticulture Off 11 9 20 

08.02.2022 Quail farming techniques 1 PF Animal Science Off 9 3 12 

09.02.2022 
Vegetable cultivation under pandal 

system 
1 PF Horticulture ON 31 11 42 

10.02.2022 Value added products from milk 1 PF Home Science ON 2 13 15 

10.02.2022 Clean milk production 1 PF Animal Science ON 2 12 14 

11.02.2022 Quality seed production in pulses 1 PF Agronomy Off 13 13 26 

14.02.2022 ICM in coconut 1 PF Horticulture Off 17 4 21 

15.02.2022 
Quality seed production in 

Groundnut 
1 PF Agronomy Off 18 4 22 



16.02.2022 Terrace garden techniques 1 RY Horticulture ON 0 10 10 

22.02.2022 to 
28.03.2022 

Skill training on Bee Keeping 1 PF Home Science ON 22 3 25 

23.02.2022 ICM in Vegetable crops 1 PF Horticulture Off 16 4 20 

24.02.2022 Goat farming techniques 1 PF Animal Science Off 2 10 12 

24.02.2022 
Importance of soil testing and bio 

fertilizer 
1 PF Soil Science ON 2 9 11 

25.02.2022 
Role of inorganic input production 

techniques 
1 PF Agronomy Off 15 3 18 

01.03.2022 Poultry rearing techniques 1 PF Animal Science Off 0 10 10 

02.03.2022 
Quality seed production in pulses 

and millets 
1 PF Agronomy Off 19 1 20 

02.03.2022 Demonstration of mastigourd 1 PF Animal Science Off 3 7 10 

03.03.2022 Dairy farming techniques 1 PF Animal Science ON 14 18 32 

04.03.2022 
Importance of  biological pest 

management in onion 
1 PF Soil Science Off 8 0 8 

04.03.2022 
Training on Mini tractor operated 

earthen up in banana 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 10 3 13 

07.03.2022 Integrated Animal farming 1 PF Animal Science Off 2 8 10 

08.03.2022 Training women day 1 PF Home Science Off 0 35 35 

09.03.2022 
Importance of agro forestry in 

agriculture 
1 PF Agronomy Off 16 0 16 

09.03.2022 Motorized earth augar in banana 1 PF Agri Engg Off 10 2 12 

16.03.2022 Terrace garden techniques 1 PF Horticulture ON 10 0 10 

17.03.2022 Nursery management techniques 1 PF Horticulture ON 10 8 18 

17.03.2022 Motorized earth augar in banana 1 PF Agri Engg Off 10 1 11 

19.03.2022 
Important selection of agro 
forestry spices in agriculture 

1 PF Agronomy Off 17 0 17 

21.03.2022 Kitchen garden techniques 1 PF Horticulture ON 0 9 9 

21.03.2022 
Integrated Pest management in 

agriculture crop 
1 PF Agronomy Off 16 3 19 

21.03.2022 to 
23.03.2022 

Training on Mushroom production 
techniques 

3 PF Home Science Skill 12 1 13 

22.03.2022 
Training on  mechanization in 

mushroom production 
1 PF Agri Engg Off 12 1 13 

22.03.2022 
Training on importance of agro 

forestry 
1 PF Agronomy Off 15 3 18 



22.03.2022 to 
28.03.2022 

Scientific Bee keeping 6 RY Home Science VOC 21 4 25 

26.03.2022 to 
31.03.2022 

Scientific Bee keeping  techniques 6 RY Home Science VOC 35 8 43 

30.03.2022 Value added products from milk 1 RY Home Science ON 2 3 5 

 

April 2022 to March 2023  

Date Training title 
Durati

on 
Type Discipline Location Male Female Total 

12.04.2022 
Women empowerment through 
agri and allied activities 

1 PF Home Science Off 8 23 31 

25.04.2022 to 
27.04.2022 

Banana cultivation practices and 
post harvest technologies 

3 RY Horticulture VOC 18 7 25 

28.04.2022 to 
30.04.2022 

Coconut cultivation practices and 
post harvest technologies 

3 PF Horticulture Off 19 3 22 

10.05.2022 Goat farming techniques 1 PF Animal Science Off 15 5 20 

11.05.2022 Vermi compost technologies 1 PF Soil Science Off 12 0 12 

11.05.2022 Native cattle and goat rearing 1 RY Animal Science On 0 39 39 

11.05.2022 Rainwater harveting techniques 1 PF Agri Engineering Off 8 4 12 

14.05.2022 ICM in groundnut production 1 PF Agronomy Off 11 7 18 

17.05.2022 
Mechanization in banana 
cultivation 

1 PF Agri Engineering Off 15 6 21 

26.05.2022 
Training programme on Green 
fodder production technology 

1 PF Agronomy Off 11 9 20 

08.06.2022 
Recent technologies in agriculture 
special emphasis on millets and 
pulses 

1 PF Agronomy Off 9 3 12 

08.06.2022 
Value added products from millet 
and pulses 

1 RY Home Science On 31 11 42 

08.06.2022 Goat farming techniques 1 RY Animal Science On 2 13 15 

14.06.2022 
Training on Management of Native 
breeds and their maintenance 

1 PF Animal Science On 2 12 14 

21.06.2022 Balances use of fertilizer 1 PF Soil Science Off 13 13 26 

22.06.2022 
Importance of Gypsum application 
and earthing up in groundnut 

1 PF Agronomy Off 17 4 21 

22.06.2022 ICM in vegetables crops 1 PF Horticulture Off 18 4 22 

24.06.2022 Roof top garden techniques 1 PF Horticulture On 0 10 10 



24.06.2022 
Safe usage of pesticides and 
equipment’s 

1 RY Agronomy On 22 3 25 

27.06.2022 Milk products and value addition 1 PF Home Science Off 16 4 20 

28.06.2022 Dryland agricultural technologies 1 PF Agronomy Off 2 10 12 

28.06.2022 Terrace garden techniques 1 PF Horticulture On 2 9 11 

29.06.2022 Terrace garden techniques 1 PF Horticulture Off 15 3 18 

30.06.2022 Kitchen garden techniques 1 PF Horticulture Off 0 10 10 

01.07.2022 
Training on ICM in coconut and 
field visit 

1 PF Horticulture Off 19 1 20 

04.07.2022 
Training and method 
demonstration on Dryland 
agricultural technologies 

1 PF Agronomy Off 3 7 10 

06.07.2022 
Training on quality seed production 
technologies 

1 RY Agronomy On 14 18 32 

07.07.2022 Agro forestry in KAVIADP village 1 PF Agronomy Off 8 0 8 

11.07.2022 Roof top garden techniques 1 PF Horticulture Off 10 3 13 

15.07.2022 
Training on quality vegetable 
production 

1 PF Horticulture Off 2 8 10 

16.07.2022 
Training on Green fodder 
techniques 

1 PF Agronomy Off 0 35 35 

26.07.2022 
Training on IFS for dryland 
agriculture 

1 PF Agronomy Off 16 0 16 

27.07.2022 Training on ICM in vegetables 1 PF Horticulture Off 10 2 12 

29.07.2022 Importance of Soil testing 1 RY Soil Science On 10 0 10 

29.07.2022 Training on dryland agriculture 1 PF Agronomy On 10 8 18 

29.07.2022 
Training on organic vegetable 
cultivation 

1 PF Horticulture Off 10 1 11 

01.08.2022 
Quality seed production in field 
crops 

1 PF Agronomy Off 17 0 17 

03.08.2022 
Demonstration of  TANUVAS star 
Chicken 

1 PF Animal Science On 0 9 9 

04.08.2022 
Training on women empowerment 
through agri and entrepreneur ship 
development 

1 PF Home Science Off 16 3 19 

08.08.2022 
Training on safe use of pesticide 
and spraying chemical 

3 RY Agronomy Skill 12 1 13 

08.08.2022 
Ectoparasite control in sheep and 
goat 

1 PF Animal Science Off 12 1 13 

10.08.2022 
Training on women empowerment 
through agri and entrepreneur ship 

1 PF Home Science Off 15 3 18 



development 

11.08.2022 Brooding in poultry 1 RY Animal Science VOC 21 4 25 

11.08.2022 Training on ICM in Pulses 1 RY Agronomy VOC 35 8 43 

12.08.2022 IFS special emphasis on sericulture 1 PF Agronomy On 2 3 5 

16.08.2022 Value addition in milk 1 PF Animal Science On 3 14 17 

18.08.2022 
Training programme on Quality 
seed production in Groundnut 

1 PF Agronomy On 12 12 24 

18.08.2022 
Training on quality seed production 
technologies 

1 RY Horticulture On 15 15 30 

18.08.2022 INM in tomato 1 PF Soil Science Off 0 13 13 

23.08.2022 Training on Coconut tree climber 1 RY Agri Engineering On 4 4 8 

25.08.2022 
Soil and water conservation 
practices 

1 PF Agri Engineering Off 0 14 14 

06.09.2022 Composting technologies 1 PF Soil Science Off 2 9 11 

06.09.2022 
Training on Agro forestry 
techniques 

1 PF Agronomy Off 13 4 17 

14.09.2022 
Training on Innovative eco friendly 
edible crockery and cutlery 

1 PF Home Science Off 5 4 9 

14.09.2022 Training on millet flakes 1 PF Home Science Off 16 4 20 

15.09.2022 
Training on Importance of 
Secondary Agriculture 

1 PF Home Science On 9 11 20 

16.09.2022 ICM in vegetables crops 1 RY Horticulture On 12 4 16 

19.09.2022 
Training on ICM in Banana 
cultivation 

1 PF Horticulture Off 0 18 18 

20.09.2022 
Value added products from Tribal  
resources 

1 PF Home Science On 9 21 30 

20.09.2022 Training on ICM in Pulses 1 PF Agronomy On 20 22 42 

21.09.2022 
Training on ICM in coconut 
cultivation 

1 PF Horticulture Off 5 9 14 

22.09.2022 Safety storage methods 1 PF Home Science Off 16 11 27 

26.09.2022 Training on ICM in Coriander 1 PF Horticulture Off 4 18 22 

26.09.2022 
Training on recent technologies in 
millet production 

1 PF Agronomy Off 19 2 21 

06.10.2022 IPM in vegetables 1 PF Horticulture Off 19 26 45 

11.10.2022 Poultry brooding 1 PF Animal Science Off 12 4 16 



12.10.2022 ICM in coconut 1 PF Horticulture Off 8 20 28 

12.10.2022 
Importance of soil and water 
testing 

1 PF Soil Science Off 14 18 32 

17.10.2022 Soil fertility management 1 PF Soil Science Off 15 32 47 

18.10.2022 Vermi compost technologies 1 PF Soil Science Off 18 4 22 

19.10.2022 Acaridae’s in livestock farms 1 PF Animal Science Off 11 10 21 

20.10.2022 Integrated farming system 1 PF Agronomy Off 15 7 22 

20.10.2022 Importance of nutri garden 1 PF Home Science Off 17 17 34 

21.10.2022 Importance of health and hygiene 1 PF Home Science Off 10 17 27 

21.10.2022 One Health 1 PF Animal Science Off 12 8 20 

27.10.2022 Millet production techniques 1 PF Agronomy Off 14 6 20 

01.11.2022 Mastitis clean milk production 1 PF Animal Science Off 21 6 27 

02.11.2022 
Innovative and eco friendly 
crockery and cutlery 

1 PF Home Science Off 18 12 30 

02.11.2022 
Product development through 
millet flags 

1 PF Home Science Off 9 4 13 

02.11.2022 Meat production technology 1 PF Animal Science Off 14 5 19 

07.11.2022 to 
11.11.20252 

Vocational training on Soil fertility 
management 

5 On Soil Science Off 20 0 20 

08.11.2022 
ICM in Bengalgram and recent 
cultivation technology 

1 PF Agronomy Off 13 7 20 

10.11.2022 
IFS special emphasis on fodder 
production 

1 EF Agronomy Off 0 11 11 

10.11.2022 Terrace garden techniques 1 EF Horticulture On 50 28 78 

15.11.2022 
Millet production technologies and  
ICM 

1 PF Agronomy Off 17 6 23 

17.11.2022 Livestock diseases 1 PF Animal Science Off 1 14 15 

18.11.2022 Mastitis and  ethno  vet medicine 1 PF Animal Science On 73 0 73 

18.11.2022 INM in paddy 1 PF Soil Science Off 1 12 13 

18.11.2022 ICM in coconut 1 PF Horticulture Off 7 6 13 

19.11.2022 Poultry brooding 1 PF Animal Science On 8 0 8 

21.11.2022 to 
25.11.20252 

Vocational training on Soil fertility 
management 

5 RY Soil Science On 2 2 4 



21.11.2022 ICM in Chillies 1 PF Horticulture Off 12 6 18 

23.11.2022 Farm waste recycling 1 PF Soil Science Off 25 14 39 

23.11.2022 Nursery techniques 1 PF Horticulture Off 4 8 12 

25.11.2022 Integrated farming system 1 PF Agronomy Off 14 0 14 

01.12.2022 
Training on crop residue 
management 

1 PF Agronomy Off 17 11 28 

05.12.2022 ICM in water melon 1 PF Horticulture On 21 6 27 

06.12.2022 ICM in vegetables crops 1 PF Horticulture Off 16 5 21 

08.12.2022 ICM in greens 1 PF Horticulture Off 6 14 20 

09.12.2022 
Training on Winter care in 
domestic animal 

1 PF Animal Science Off 3 7 10 

13.12.2022 INM in bhendi 1 PF Soil Science Off 50 0 50 

13.12.2022 
Training on TANUVAS star chicken 
brooding and rearing 

1 PF Animal Science Off 21 16 37 

13.12.2022 Training on Bee keeping 1 PF Home Science Off 12 7 19 

15.12.2022 Training on dryland agriculture 1 PF Agronomy Off 3 12 15 

17.12.2022 
Training on Importance of post 
harvest management and value 
addition 

1 PF Home Science Off 10 5 15 

20.12.2022 
Training on LSD causes prevention 
and treatment 

1 PF Animal Science Off 14 7 21 

21.12.2022 ICM in vegetables crops 1 PF Horticulture Off 5 4 9 

03.01.2023 Training on ICM in solanum nigrum 1 PF Horticulture Off 8 3 11 

03.01.2023 
Training on importance of drudgery 
reduction in agriculture 

1 PF Home Science Off 6 6 12 

05.01.2023 Training on ICM in Coconut 1 PF Horticulture Off 10 4 14 

13.01.2023 
Training on brooding management 
in poultry 

1 PF Animal Science Off 8 2 10 

19.01.2023 
Training on ICM in Banana 
cultivation 

1 PF Horticulture Off 13 6 19 

21.01.2023 IFS special emphasis on Sericulture 1 PF Agronomy On 9 0 9 

24.01.2023 
and 

25.01.2023 

Training on Value addition 
technologies  for chillies, banana, 
coconut and rice 

2 RY Home Science On 23 1 24 

25.01.2023 Training on farm waste recycling 1 PF Soil Science Off 3 8 11 



03.02.2023 Husk recycling in coconut garden 1 PF Horticulture Off 12 3 15 

04.02.2023 ICM in black shade 1 PF Horticulture Off 16 6 22 

06.02.2023 
Banana fiber extracted and  
handicraft product  making 

1 PF Home Science SP 23 19 42 

07.02.2023 
Income generation activities for 
agricultural enterprises 

1 PF Home Science Off 3 3 6 

14.02.2023 Different composting techniques 1 PF Soil Science On 17 5 22 

15.02.2023 
Application of uzhavan app and its 
benefits 

1 EF Agronomy Off 16 5 21 

17.02.2023 
Recent technologies in agriculture 
special emphasis on millets and 
pulses 

1 RY Agronomy On 20 3 23 

17.02.2023 Farm waste management 1 RY Soil Science On 6 15 21 

21.02.2023 
Demonstration of Drone 
application technology 

1 PF Agronomy Off 14 7 21 

03.03.2023 
Training on Soil fertility 
management 

1 PF Soil Science Off 9 4 13 

13.03.2023 
Training on  importance of millet 
processing 

1 PF Home Science Off 35 9 44 

16.03.2023 
Recent technologies in millet 
production 

1 PF Agronomy Off 14 4 18 

18.03.2023 Awareness and training on millets 1 PF Agronomy Off 32 5 37 

28.03.2023 
Training on  importance of millet 
processing 

1 PF Home Science Off 2 25 27 

30.03.2023 Millet production technologies 1 EF Agronomy Off 15 4 19 

 

  



April 2023 to March 2024 

Date Training title Location Discipline Male Female Total 

10.04.2023 Training on ICM in Coconut  Off Horticulture 3 8 11 

12.04.2023 Training programme on ICM in Groundnut Off Agronomy 35 3 38 

26.04.2023 

Training program on quality seed 

production and trading for farmers, FPO 

and traders jointly organized by National 

Seed  Corporation Ltd, Coimbatore 

On Agronomy 24 5 29 

01.05.2023 Soil fertility management  Off Soil Science 30 16 46 

09.05.2023 Soil fertility management  On Soil Science 84 40 124 

16.05.2023 FLD Cotton pre season training Off Agronomy 9 4 13 

20.05.2023 Bee keeping techniques Off Home Science 19 5 24 

24.05.2023 Quality fodder production techniques On Agronomy 7 37 44 

30.05.2023 ICM in coconut Off Horticulture 8 5 13 

03.06.2023 Pre-season training for FLD programme Off Horticulture 12 10 22 

05.06.2023 

to 

08.06.2023 

Income generation activities for 

agricultural enterprises 

Vocational 

Training 
Home Science 3 12 15 

06.06.2023 

Promoted marigold as a intercrop in 

Banana crop for additional income in 

young stage as well as Nematode 

management 

Off Horticulture 6 5 11 

06.06.2023 

Training on Integrated Farming System for 

doubling the farmers income to Extension 

officials 

On Agronomy 32 13 45 

13.06.2023 
Training on Integrated Farming System 

and special emphasis on Sericulture 
On Agronomy 28 12 40 

13.06.2023 
Training on Integrated Farming System 

and special emphasis on Vermicompost 
On Soil Science 0 10 10 

21.06.2023 
Training on Integrated Crop Management 

in Coconut 
On Horticulture 25 8 33 

07.07.2023 
Training on Integrated Crop Management 

in Cotton cultivation 
Off Agronomy 43 5 48 

11.07.2023 Training on Organic farming On Agronomy 14 3 17 



14.07.2023 

to 

31.08.2023 

KVK Activities to RAWE students On Agronomy 1 3 4 

18.07.2023 Training on Millet cultivation On Agronomy 31 16 47 

21.07.2023 Good cultivation practices in curry leaf Off Horticulture 21 6 27 

24.07.2023 Importance of millet processing Off Home Science 8 19 27 

24.07.2023 Vermi compost technologies Off Soil Science 44 84 128 

25.07.2023 
Orientation training to RAWE students 

about Extension system 
Off Agronomy 47 11 58 

26.07.2023 Soil fertility management  On Soil Science 21 29 50 

26.07.2023 Pre season training on FLD Cotton  Off Agronomy 17 5 22 

02.08.2023 
Training programme on Millet awareness 

and cultivation practices 
Off Agronomy 14 6 20 

02.08.2023 Integrated Crop Management in coconut Off Horticulture 16 4 20 

05.08.2023 Integrated Crop Management in coconut Off Horticulture 15 5 20 

10.08.2023 Soil test based fertilizer recommendation Off Soil Science 10 2 12 

19.08.2023 INM in vegetables On Soil Science 18 4 22 

22.08.2023 
Integrated Crop Management in 

Groundnut 
Off Agronomy 20 12 32 

22.08.2023 Importance of Bee Keeping Off Home Science 0 53 53 

28.08.2023 ICM in Banana Off Horticulture 11 8 19 

30.08.2023 ICM in vegetables crops Off Horticulture 19 7 26 

05.09.2023 ICM in Jasmine Off Horticulture 13 3 16 

07.09.2023 Training on Millet cultivation techniques Off Agronomy 7 7 14 

08.09.2023 

Capacity building programme on 

Horticulture crops for SC&ST farmer's 

under SCSP and TSP project sponsored by 

IIHR, Bangalore 

On Horticulture 30 13 43 

12.09.2024 
Training on Safety storage methods in 

cereals and pulses 
Off Home Science 6 1 7 

12.09.2025 
Training on Scientific method of preserving 

copra 
Off Home Science 7 1 8 

13.09.2023 
Training programme on Recent 

technologies and varieties in Millet 
Off Agronomy 16 6 22 



production 

13.09.2023 Training on organic farming Off Soil Science 12 24 36 

13.09.2023 ICM in vegetables crops Off Horticulture 15 3 18 

14.09.2023 
Training on Integrated Nutrient 

Management in millets 
Off Soil Science 12 23 35 

15.09.2023 Training on vermi compost technologies On Soil Science 6 9 15 

19.09.2023 Training on HTP cotton cultivation Off Agronomy 24 0 24 

19.09.2023 ICM in Banana Off Horticulture 14 5 19 

21.09.2023 
Training on Integrated Crop Management  

in Vegetables 
Off Horticulture 7 15 22 

25.09.2023 
Training on Integrated nutrient 

management in millets 
Off Soil Science 21 13 34 

25.09.2023 Training on importance of millet Off Home Science 13 24 37 

25.09.2023 

to 

20.10.2023 

Orientation training to RAWE students 

about Extension system 
On Agronomy 11 3 14 

26.09.2023 
Training programme on Grassroots 

innovation and techniques 
On Home Science 38 20 58 

26.09.2023 
Training on Farm waste recycing 

techniques 
Off Soil Science 43 6 49 

26.09.2023 
Training programme on Recent 

technologies in finger millet 
Off Agronomy 9 10 19 

27.09.2023 
Training programme on Recent 

technologies in millet production 
Off Agronomy 16 6 22 

05.10.2023 
Training programme on recent 

technologies in millet production 
Off Agronomy 16 13 29 

09.10.2023 
Training on Integrated Crop Management 

in Millets 
Off Agronomy 13 5 18 

09.10.2023 

to 

20.10.2023 

Vocational training on Organic farming On Soil Science 12 11 23 

10.10.2023 
Training on Integrated Crop Management 

in Coconut and Arecanut 
Off Horticulture 21 5 26 

10.10.2023 
Training programme on ICM in Agriculture 

crop and method of soil sampling 
Off Agronomy 13 5 18 



12.10.2023 Training on Integrated Farming System Off Agronomy 18 2 20 

13.10.2023 
Training and method demonstration on 

value addition in coconut  
On Home Science 8 16 24 

13.10.2023 Importance of soil and water testing Off Soil Science 9 3 12 

17.10.2023 Training on Integrated Farming System Off Agronomy 16 3 19 

18.10.2023 
Training programme on Millet production 

technologies importance of millet  
Off Agronomy 17 10 27 

19.10.2023 
Training on Integrated Crop Management 

in coconut  
Off Horticulture 8 7 15 

19.10.2023 

Training and Field visit on HDPS cotton 

cultivation techniques under special 

project on large scale adoption of cotton-

NFSM 2023-24 

Off Agronomy 21 5 26 

30.10.2023 
Extension Training on Recent production 

techniques in Guava cultivation 
On Horticulture 2 8 10 

02.11.2023 
Training on Recent production techniques 

in vegetables  
Off Horticulture 15 9 24 

06.11.2023 

to 17.11.23 
Organic farming 

Vocational 

Training 
Soil Science 12 25 37 

13.11.2023 

to 24.11.23 
Soil fertility management  

Vocational 

Training 
Soil Science 1 4 5 

21.11.2023 Training on ICM in Banana cultivation Off Horticulture 21 7 28 

12.12.2023 
Post harvest management on fruit and 

vegetables 
Off Home Science 6 4 10 

20.12.2023 Mechanization in Groundnut cultivation On Agronomy 11 8 19 

22.12.2023 ICM in lab lab Off Horticulture 19 10 29 

26.12.2023 Millet cultivation technologies Off Agronomy 9 8 17 

28.12.2023 - 

03.01.24 
Organic farming  

Vocational 

Training 
Agronomy 8 20 28 

02.01.2024 Soil fertility management  Off Soil Science 14 8 22 

03.01.2024 Soil fertility management  Off Soil Science 28 21 49 

08.01.2024 Terrace garden techniques Off Horticulture 9 11 20 

08.01.2024 
HDP in cotton and pest & Disease 

management 
Off Agronomy 19 17 36 



10.01.2024 
Training on Integrated Crop Management 

in coconut 
Off Horticulture 18 0 18 

10.01.2024 ICM in coconut Off Horticulture 18 2 20 

11.01.2024 ICM in millets Off Agronomy 9 11 20 

29.01.2024 

to 

31.01.2024 

Women empowerment through bee 

keeping 
On Home Science 0 25 25 

02.02.2024 INM in vegetables Off Soil Science 8 4 12 

06.02.2024 
Training program on improved production 

techniques in coconut 
On Horticulture 15 16 31 

08.02.2024 
Training program on value added products 

from millets 
On Home Science 13 15 28 

19.02.2024 
Sp Training program on Mushroom 

cultivation techniques 
On Home Science 26 11 37 

23.02.2024 Safe use of pesticides Off Agronomy 12 6 18 

06.03.2024 Off on organic vegetable cultivation Off Horticulture 11 2 13 

14.03.2024 
Value added products from Tribal  

resources 
Off Home Science 18 11 29 

 

April 2024 to March 2025 

 

Date Training title Location Discipline Male Female Total 

16.04.2024 Nursery management techniques On Horticulture 0 8 8 

24.04.2024 ICM in Bannana On Horticulture 10 0 10 

29.04.2024 ICM in vegetables crops Off Horticulture 11 21 32 

03.05.2024 
Women empowerment through 
agricultural enterprises 

On Home Science 0 10 10 

04.05.2024 
Income generation activities for 
agricultural enterprises 

On Home Science 8 5 13 

07.05.2024 
Training on azolla cultivation and vermi 
compoting techniques 

On Agronomy 0 29 29 

09.05.2024 
to 

11.05.2024 
Farm waste recyling techniques On Soil Science 0 7 7 



20.05.2024 Sericulture rearing techniques On Agronomy 0 7 7 

21.05.2024 ICM in vegetables crops Off Horticulture 11 6 17 

06.06.2024 
to 

20.06.2024 

Vocational training on Rural enterprenuer 
development throgh Agri business 
enterprises 

Vocational  Home Science 12 18 30 

19.06.2024 Training on pulses cultivation techniques Off Agronomy 33 12 45 

19.06.2024 Training on Balance use of fertilizers Off Soil Science 39 9 48 

20.06.2024 Soil test and fertilizer application Off Soil Science 42 0 42 

24.06.2024 Terrace garden techniques Off Horticulture 0 17 17 

25.06.2024 INM in pulses Off Soil Science 38 0 38 

25.06.2024 
Women enterpreneur through Bee 
keeping 

Off Home Science 3 15 18 

25.06.2024 Soil test and balanced nutrient application Off Soil Science 42 4 46 

06.07.2024 
Pre season training on Cotton cultivation 
cultivation 

Off Agronomy 16 5 21 

08.07.2024 

Pre season training on Cotton cultivation 
cultivation and distribution of ELS cotton 
seed 
Venue: Vadapudur village, Kinathukadavu 
block, Coimbatore district 

Off Agronomy 17 8 25 

09.07.2024 
Off on Nursery techniques in vegetable 
cultivation 

Off Horticulture 11 4 15 

15.07.2024 
Off campus on Ecological assessment on 
Banana cultivationto extension personnels 

Off Horticulture 17 11 28 

16.07.2024 
Income generation activities through value 
addition 

Off Home Science 1 14 15 

18.07.2024 
to 

20.07.2024 
Different composting techniques On Soil Science 18 13 31 

22.07.2024 Off on kerala wilt management in coconut Off Horticulture 17 5 22 

23.07.2024 

Training on pulses production. Explained 
about selection of variety, importance of 
summer ploughing, INM and IPM 
strategies 

Off Agronomy 25 2 27 

23.07.2024 Balance use of fertilizer Off Soil Science 36 12 48 

24.07.2024 
to 

30.07.2024 

Women empowerment through Bee 
keeping 

Vocational  Home Science 0 29 29 

24.07.2024 Training on ICM in Coconut cultivation Off Horticulture 21 6 27 



25.07.2024 Training on balance use of bio fertilizer Off Agronomy 3 18 21 

26.07.2024 Off on Nutri garden techniques Off Horticulture 1 17 18 

07.08.2024 
Consortia platform on engineering 
interventions in precision farming 

Off Agronomy 31 13 44 

07.08.2024 
Training on soil health management for 
banana cultivation 

Off Horticulture 25 13 38 

08.08.2024 
Training programme on Millet production 
technology 

Off Agronomy 20 6 26 

13.08.2024 
Training on HDPS special project on cotton 
input seed distribution 

Off Agronomy 12 6 18 

13.08.2024 Training on Importance of  Nutri garden Off Home Science 1 12 13 

14.08.2024 
Integrated Nutrient Management in 
vegetables 

On Soil Science 32 4 36 

14.08.2024 Utilization of Renevable energy On Soil Science 25 8 33 

17.08.2024 Training on Organic farming  techniques Off Soil Science 18 6 24 

19.08.2024 
Training on climate resilient management 
in coconut cultivation 

Off Horticulture 22 2 24 

20.08.2024 Training on ICM in Brinjal cultivation Off Horticulture 19 3 22 

27.08.2024 
Training on Value added products from 
fruits 

On Home Science 15 10 25 

28.08.2024 
Training on extra long stable cotton 
cultivation techniques 

Off Agronomy 24 10 34 

29.08.2024 
Training on Kitchen garden techniques for 
vegetable cultivation 

Off Horticulture 1 16 17 

03.09.2024 
to 

07.09.2024 

Skill development training on Integrated 
Farming 

Off Agronomy 22 8 30 

03.09.2024 
to 

04.09.2024 
Importance of Soil and water testing On 

Pavithra 
Periyasamy 

12 1 13 

03.09.2024 ICM in lab lab Off Horticulture 13 17 30 

04.09.2024 Mechanization in agriculture On Agronomy 30 14 44 

05.09.2024 
Training programme on importance of 
value addition 

On Home Science 5 27 32 

10.09.2024 Training on Organic farming On Agronomy 12 12 24 

11.09.2024 
Special programme on HDPS cotton 
meeting for large scale adoption of cotton 

Off Agronomy 23 7 30 

16.09.2024 
Training importance of post harvest 
management and value addition 

Off Home Science 28 4 32 



17.09.2024 
to 

21.09.2024 

Skill development training on Composting 
production technology 

Off Soil Science 25 5 30 

17.09.2024 
to 

23.09.2024 

Skill development training on Integrated 
Nutri garden techniques 

On Horticulture 0 22 22 

18.09.2024 
Training importance On Entrepreneurship 
development through agricultural and 
allied enterprises 

On Home Science 7 21 28 

18.09.2024 Training programme on organic farming On Agronomy 25 10 35 

18.09.2024 
Training on importance of seed treatment 
in vegetable production 

Off Horticulture 14 5 19 

19.09.2024 INM in casava Off Soil Science 10 2 12 

21.09.2024 
Training importance Post Harvest 
management in Oilseeds 

On Home Science 24 8 32 

26.09.2024 EDP through Agricultural enterprises Off Home Science 8 19 27 

26.09.2024 
Integrated Nutrient Management in 
vegetables 

Off Soil Science 16 8 24 

28.09.2024 
Recent production technologies in 
groundnut cultivation 

Off Agronomy 22 3 25 

01.10.2024 
Rural youth training on Income generation 
through agricultural enterprises 

On Home Science 16 17 33 

01.10.2024 INM in pulses Off Soil Science 6 5 11 

07.10.2024 ICM in tomato Off Horticulture 9 2 11 

09.10.2024 
Sponsored training on Importance of Post 
Harvest Management and Value addition 

On Home Science 18 8 26 

10.10.2024 
Training on Organic farming in vegetable 
production 

Off Horticulture 18 3 21 

10.10.2024 Method demonstration Off Horticulture 18 3 21 

14.10.2024 
to 

25.10.2024 
Training programme on organic farming On Agronomy 9 10 19 

15.10.2024 
to 

22.10.2024 

Skill training on women empowerment 
through Bee keeping 

On Home Science 0 25 25 

18.10.2024 ICM in Turmeric Off Horticulture 15 1 16 

18.10.2024 
EDP training on women empowerment 
programme on Value added products from 
coconut 

On Home Science 0 16 16 

23.10.2024 Training programme on rainfed groundnut Off Agronomy 11 7 18 



production 

28.10.2024 Training on long stable cotton Off Agronomy 26 14 40 

28.10.2024 Soil fertility management Off Soil Science 8 6 14 

04.11.2024 
Training on cotton cultivation techniques - 
Special Project Cotton 

Off Agronomy 7 4 11 

05.11.2024 Pre season training on cotton cultivation Off Agronomy 8 7 15 

12.11.2024 Training on INM in pulses Off Soil Science 4 8 12 

13.11.2024 Off on ICM in coconut Off Horticulture 14 7 21 

13.11.2024 
to 

16.11.2024 

Skill Training on Vermi composting 
techniques 

Skill  Soil Science 32 5 37 

14.11.2024 Off on ICM in coconut Off Horticulture 23 3 26 

16.11.2024 Off on ICM in Tomato Off Horticulture 9 4 13 

19.11.2024 
Training on Integrated Nutrient 
Management in Vegetables 

Off Soil Science 10 4 14 

21.11.2024 
EDP training on value added products 
from Millets 

Off Home Science 1 23 24 

25.11.2024 
to 

06.12.2024 

Training on recent production 
technologies in Horticultural crops 

Vocational  Horticulture 14 10 24 

25.11.2024 
Training on pulses production 
technologies 

Off Agronomy 12 9 21 

26.11.2024 Off on organic cultivation techniques Off Agronomy 12 3 15 

26.11.2024 
Training on Farm waste recycling 
techniques 

Off Soil Science 42 5 47 

03.12.2024 
training on ICM in Pulses production 
techniques 

Off Agronomy 14 7 21 

03.12.2024 Off on ICM in Banana cultivation Off Horticulture 17 8 25 

06.12.2024 Vermi composting techniques On Soil Science 27 16 43 

11.12.2024 
Off programme on pulses production 
technology cum seed treatment method 
demonstration 

Off Agronomy 13 7 20 

16.12.2024 
- 

18.12.2024 
EDP training on Agricultural enterprises On Home Science 8 15 23 

20.12.2024 Off on ICM in Tomato cultivation Off Horticulture 17 6 23 

21.12.2024 Off on ICM in Red Amaranthus cultivation Off Horticulture 6 5 11 

24.12.2024 Off on IPM in Pulses Off Agronomy 11 12 23 



01.01.2025 
Training programme on pulses production 
technology 

Off Agronomy 16 8 24 

02.01.2025 
& 

03.01.2025 

Training on Post-Harvest management of 
Horticulture crops 

On Home Science 11 20 31 

02.01.2025 ICM in Turmeric Off Horticulture 7 4 11 

22.01.2025 
Training programme on Integrated pest 
and disease management in Bengalgram 

Off Agronomy 16 8 24 

28.01.2025 Training programme on Organic farming Off Agronomy 13 6 19 

04.02.2025 
Training programme on HDPS cotton 
cultivation 

Off Agronomy 38 12 50 

05.02.2025 Training programme on ICM in pulses Off Agronomy 6 13 19 

06.02.2025 Value added products from millets Off Home Science 18 2 20 

13.02.2025 Whitefly management in coconut Off Horticulture 47 25 72 

13.02.2025 
& 14.02.25 

Capacity building training on primary 
processing, storage, packaging and export 
of fruits and vegetable 

Off Home Science 22 4 26 

18.02.2025 
Sponsored training on advance production 
Technologies in Papaya 

Off Horticulture 15 4 19 

19.02.2025 ICM in banana Off Horticulture 21 8 29 

24.02.2025 
Enterpreneural activity through 
agricultural enterprises 

On Home Science 0 10 10 

03.03.2025 
Training on Integrated Crop Management 
in Pulses 

Off Agronomy 10 13 23 

05.03.2025 ICM  in Coconut Off Horticulture 10 4 14 

08.03.2025 
Role of women in home and farm 
activities 

On Home Science 1 21 22 

20.03.2025 Integrated crop management in Maize Off Agronomy 14 11 25 

26.03.2025 Training on Natural farming On Agronomy 6 9 15 

 


